G Hall County Government

— - FINANCIAL SERVICES
HALL COUNTY CONTRACT EXECUTION SIGNATURE REQUEST
We have it all in Hall Date: 5/4/2023
To: Richard Higgins, Commission Chairman
POST OFFICE DRAWER 1435 From: Debra Howington, Buyer

GAINESVILLE, GA 30503

Your signature is requested to execute the attached bid/contract award

t: 770.535.8270 | f: 770.531.6711
documents for:

DIRECTOR Bid/Contract No: IFB #001-43-1
Wesley Geddings
Bid/Contract Name: Athletic Uniforms Annual Contract
Department(s) Requesting Contract: Parks and Leisure Services
Award Recipient Name: Hobbs Sporting Goods
Date of BOC Approval:  5/25/2023

Contract Description: Uniforms for various athletic teams for County

Annual Contract [] New Renewal
Estimated Prior Year’'s Spend: $ 59,690,45

L] Price Increase Requested Percentage Increase:

] Project/Service Contract Awarded Amount:
Commodity Contract Awarded Amount: OPEN

Comments: This is year two (2) of a three (3) year bid.

Revised 08/05/2022 AGP

wewnw hallcounty.org



Attachment A

Athletic Uniforms Annual Contract March 28,
2023

Whereas, the Contractor and the County have agreed to a change in the contract prices and have
recorded them below, and have both agreed to their rates, the prices associated with this contract are
hereby changed upon approval of the County:

No W\W‘Qﬂ' CU\Q\L&



cc: Contract File
State of Georgia Contract #001-43-1
County of Hall

Supplement Agreement #1

Athletic Uniforms Annual Contract March 28, 2023

Whereas, the County desires to extend the contract period for a one year period through June
30, 2024, in accordance with the terms and conditions of Bid #001-43, Athletic Uniforms Annual
Contract, dated July 1, 2022 and

Whereas the Contractor has agreed to this extension and agrees to provide services and/or
materials previously supplied in accordance with the original agreement; and

Whereas, with both parties agreeing to the extension as stated and therefore, the above
numbered contract is hereby changed as follows:

e By extending the contract coverage for a one year period through June 30, 2024,
e Allow for price adjustments as agreed to and recorded in Attachment A,

e Change Orders: Any and all change orders requested by the successful bidder on this
project must be approved per the County’s Purchasing Policies through the Contract
Administrator prior to any work being performed. Any work performed outside the contract
agreement for which compensation over and above the contract requested must have an
approved Change Order. If work is done before approval of a Change Order, the subsequent
Change Order will be rejected.

With the above change to the original contract set forth herein, the parties hereto agree that
all terms and conditions of the original agreement will remain in full force and effect and legally
binding on both parties.

In witness whereof, the parties hereto have set their hands and affixed their seals the day and
year first above written.

Subscribed and sworn to in our Hall County, Georgia
presence this day of

, 2023

By:
Notary Public Richard Higgins
Commission expires: Commission Chairman
Subscribed and sworn to in our Hobbs Sporting Goods
presence this __ | & day of
N\C‘uj . 2023 \&&'\
EAZTATFY By. A\

Notary Public i Nate Miller
Commission expires: CB/ /2 / 2.3 Partner




001-43 Athletic Uniform Supply
Annual Contract

Hobbs
Sporting
Goods
Gainesville,
GA
FY24 No price
increase
item # Description Unit Price
Basketball Uniforms
Youth (Boys) Logo'd Reversible NBA
T Jersey (S-XL) $12.00
Youth (Girls) Logo'd Reversible
2 |WNBA Jersey (S-XL) $12.00
Youth (Mens) Logo'd Reversible
3 |NBA Jersey (S-5XL) $13.00
Youth (Womens) Logo'd Reversible
4 |WNBA Jersey (S-3XL) $13.00
Youth (Boys) Logo'd NBA Shorts (all
5 sizes) $15.00
Youth (Girls) Logo'd WNBA Shorts
6 (all sizes) $15.00
Adult (Men) Logo'd NBA Shorts (all
7 sizes) $15.00
Adult (Women) Logo'd WNBA
8 Shorts (all sizes) $15.00
NBA/WNBA Logo'd Game Shirt for
9 Coaches (all sizes) $13.00
(Youth) Collegiate Replica Jersey w / .
10 lus (all sizes) no bid
(Adult) Collegiate Replica Jersey w / .
1 #'s (all sizes) no bid
Collegiate Replica Ball Park Jersey .
12 for Coaches (all sizes) no bid
(Youth) Collegiate Replica Rookie .
13 Jersey w/ #'s (all sizes) no bid
14 (Youth) MLB Evolution Tee w / #'s $19.50

(all sizes)




(Adult) MLB Evolution Tee w / #'s (all

15 sizes) $19.50
(Adult) MLB & Minor Replica Jersey

16 for Coaches (all sizes) $19.00

17 Qlldan (Ladies) Tee w/ logo (all $7.00
sizes)

18 |Gildan Tee w/ logo (all sizes) $7.00
Gildan Performance Polo w / logo

19 (all sizes) $18.00

20 |All-Star Baseball Uniform (all sizes) $48.00

21 AII—S?ar Baseball Coaches Uniform $24.00
(all sizes)

22 |All-Star Softball Uniform (all sizes) $48.00

23 AII-S?ar Softball Coaches Uniform $24.00
(all sizes)

24 |Richardson Cap w/ 3D logo $16.00

25 |Staff Hat (one size - adjustable) $16.00
All-Star Yough League Series

26 Catching Kit $100.00

27 |Rawlings Baseballs (doz. Count) $50.00

28 |Outdoor Cap MLB Replica Cap $7.95
Outdoor Cap Collegiate Visor one

29 size - adjustable $7.95

30 |Mark V Basketball Scorebocok $7.95




