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POST OFFICE DRAWER 1435
GAINESVILLE, GA 30503

t: 770.535.8270 | f: 770.531.6711

DIRECTOR
Wesley Geddings

Hall County Government
FINANCIAL SERVICES

CONTRACT EXECUTION SIGNATURE REQUEST
Date:  5/3/2023

To: Wesley Geddings, Financial Services Director
From: Debra Howington, Buyer

Your signature is requested to execute the attached bid/contract award
documents for:

Bid/Contract No: IFB #023-43-1

Bid/Contract Name: Fire & EMS Uniform Supply Annual Contract
Department(s) Requesting Contract: Fire Rescue & EMS

Award Recipient Name: S.T.A.R. Apparel & Plastics, Inc. and NAFECO
Date of BOC Approval: N/A

Contract Description: Uniforms for Fire Rescue and EMS

X Annual Contract [ ] New [] Renewal

Prior Year's Spend: $268,480.00

X Price Increase Requested  Percentage Increase: Average 10.79

[] Project/Service Contract Awarded Amount: Click here to enter text.
Commodity Contract Awarded Amount:  OPEN

Comments: This is year two (2) of a three (3) year contract.
S.T.A.R. is asking for a 10.79% increase on 18 items out of 44 items.
NAFECO has no price increase.

Revised 08/05/2022 AGP

www.hallcounty.org



Stale of Geongia Contract #023-43-1
County of Hall

Aftachment A

5 Iﬂ,.‘a P March 28, 2023

Whereas, the Cantractor and the County have agreed to a change In the contract prices and have
recorded them below, and have both agreed to their rates, the prices associated wilh this cantract are hereby

changed upon approval of the County:
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Nomex Uniform Shirt - Workrite # 720NX45
38-50
52-54

Nomex Polo Shirt, Workrite #263TK-67-NB,
XS-3XT
4XT-BXT

Nomex Uniform Shirt, Workrite #705NX-45-NV, I/s in navy
XS-3X
4X-5X

Nomex Uniform Shirt, Workrite #701NMX-45-NV, s/s in navy
X8-3X
4X-5X

Nomex Uniform Shirt, Workrite #708NX-45-NV, I/s in navy
XS-3X
4X-5X

Nomex Uniform Pant, Workrite #400-NX-75 Industrial or #402-NX-75 in navy
List prices for sizes: 28-42
List prices for oversizes: 44-56

Nomex Uniform Pant, Workrite #401-NX-75 in navy
List prices for sizes: 2-20
List prices for oversizes: 28-50

Nomex Uniform Pant, Workrite #401-NX-75-NV in navy
List prices for sizes: 2-20
List prices for oversizes: 28-50

Nomex Cargo Shorts, Workrite #425NX-60-NV in navy
List prices for sizes: 25-50
List prices for oversizes: 52-60

S.TAR. | S.T.AR. % of
FY23 FY24 increase
$155.00 | $175.00 | 12.90%
$210.00 | $230.00 | 9.50%
$109.00 | $129.00 | 18.30%
$139.00 | $159.00 | 14.40%
$185.00 | $205.00 | 10.80%
$245.00 | $265.00 | 8.20%
$155.00 | $175.00 | 12:90%
$210.00 | $230.00 | 9.50%
$185.00 | $205.00 | 10.80%
$245.00 | $265.00 | 8.20%
$175.00 | $195.00 | 11.40%
$235.00 | $255.00 | 8.50%
$175.00 | $195.00 | 11.40%
$235.00 | $255.00 | 8.50%
$175.00 | $195.00 | 11.40%
$235.00 | $255.00 | 8.50%
$185.00 | $205.00 | 10.80%
$245.00 | $265.00 | 8.20%
Average 10.79%




State of Georgia Contract #023-43-1
County of Hall

Attachment A

NAEC D ¢ March 28, 2023

Whereas, the Contractor and the County have agreed to a change in the contract prices and have
recorded them below, and have both agreed to their rates, the prices associated with this contract are hereby
changed upon appreval of the County:




State of Georgia Contract #023-43-1
County of Hall

Supplement Agreement #1

Fire & EMS Uniform Supply Annual Contract March 28, 2023

Whereas, the County desires to extend the contract period for a one year period through June 30,
2024, in accordance with the terms and conditions of Bid #023-43, Fire & EMS Uniform Supply Annual
Contract, dated July 1, 2022 and

Whereas the Contractor has agreed to this extension and agrees to provide services and/or materials
previously supplied in accordance with the original agreement; and

Whereas, with both parties agreeing to the extension as stated and therefore, the above numbered
contract is hereby changed as follows:

1. By extending the contract coverage for a one year period through June 30, 2024,
2. Allow for price adjustments as agreed to and recorded in Attachment A,

3. Change Orders: Any and all change orders requested by the successful bidder on this project must
be approved per the County’s Purchasing Policies through the Contract Administrator prior to any work
being performed. Any work performed outside the contract agreement for which compensation over and
above the contract is requested must have an approved Change Order. If work is done before approval
of a Change Order, the subsequent Change Order will be rejected.

With the above change to the original contract set forth herein, the parties hereto agree that all terms
and conditions of the original agreement will remain in full force and effect and legally binding on both
parties.

In witness whereof, the parties hereto have set their hands and affixed their seals the day and year
first above written.

Subscribed and sworn to in our Hall County, Georgia
presence this day of
, 2023
By:
Notary Public Richard Higgins
Commission expires: Commission Chairman

Subscribed and sworp to in our NAFECO

presence this 3 Ca& day of

l,On X , 2023
7
Notary Public

Commission expires: e el %

e s

iz, SUMMER WISEMAN |

i Notary Public, Georgia
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E*i;ﬂ;j-z GwinnettCounty

Z am¥. § My Commission Expires
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State of Gedngia Contract #023-43-1
County ¢f Hall

Supplemerit Agreement #1

Fire & EMS Uniform Supply Annual Contract March 28, 2023

Whereas, the County desires to extend the contract period fora one year petiod through June 30, 2024,
in accordance with the terms and conditions of Bid #023-43, Fire & EMS Uniform Supply Annual Contract,

dated July 1, 2022 and

Whereas the Contractor has agreed to this extension and agress to provide services and/or materials
previously supplied in accordance with the ‘original agreemient; and

Whereas, with both parties agreeing to the extension as stated and therefore, the above numbered
contract is hereby changed as follows:

1. By extending the contract coverage for a one year period through June 30, 2024,
2. Allow for price adjustments as agreed to and recorded in Attachment A,

3. Change Orders: Any and all change orders requested by the successful bidder on this project must
be approved perthe County’s Purchasing Policies through the Contract Administrator prior to any work
being performed. Any work performed oulside the contract agreement for which compensation over and
above the contract is requested must have an approved Change Otder. If work is done.before approval

of a Change Order, the subsequent Change Order will be rejected.

With the above change to the original contract set forth herein, the parties hereto agree that all tetrms
and conditions of the original dgreement will remain in full force and effect and legally binding on both
parties.

In witness whereof, the parties hereto have set their hands and affixed their seals the day and year
first above wnitten,

Subscribed and swom to in our Hall County, Georgia

presence this day of
, 2023

By:

Notary Pubiic Richard Higgins
Commission expires: vilberi,, Commission Chairman

': LL ‘S.T.A.R. Appare! & Plastics, Inc.
G‘JA

Subsctibed and swom to in our .
pre ig 4 day of i
, 2023 ot
e Tracy

Notary}‘{bhc ' UN o Tra
Commission explres: 3‘: AT President
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SUMMATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
# 023-43 FIRE AND EMS UNIFORM
SUPPLY ANNUAL CONTRACT
Name of Company

Description
Patches
Fire Service Uniform Patch
Badge Patch
Badge Patch
Georgia Smoke Diver Patch
Honor Guard Patch
Embroidered Collar Disc Patch - Captain / Battalion Chief
Embroidered Collar Disc Patch - Firefighter / Lieutenant
Embroidered Paramedic Patch
Embroidered EMT Patch
Sew-On namestrip
New Badge Patch
Challenge Coin size 1.75", round

Badges and Bars
Firefighter Badge - BLACKINTON # B547

Lieutenant Badge - BLACKINTON # B1160

Chief - Caplain Badges - BLACKINTON # B1160

Chief - Captain Badges - BLACKINTON # B1160-2
Honor Guard Badge - BLACKINTON # B586
Firefighter Collar Brass Set - BLACKINTON

Lieutenant Coilar Brass Set - BLACKINTON

Captain Collar Brass Set- BLACKINTON

Battalion Chief Collar Brass Set - BLACKINTON
Commander Guard Collar Brass Badge Set - BLACKINTON
Division Chief - BLACKINTON #A2547/A2807

Deputy Chief Collar Brass Set - BLACKINTON #A2547/A2906
Chief Collar Brass Set - BLACKINTON #A2547/A2505
Lieutenant Hat Badge - BLACKINTON # A2817DE
Sergeant Cap Badge - BLACKINTON #A6223
Firefighter Cap Badge - BLACKINTON #A698

Captain Hat Badge - BLACKINTON #A6197DE
Battalion Chief Hat Badge - BLACKINTON A2816DE
Commander Badge - BLACKINTON #A2816DE
Division Chief Badge - BLACKINTON #A2853DE
Deputy Chief Hat Badge - BLACKINTON #A1962DE
Chief Hat Badge - BLACKINTON #A2815DE

Honor Guard Hat Badge - BLACKINTON #C12571
Honor Guard Membership Bar - BLACKINTON #B1942
Nameplates

Clothing - No exceptions where noted
Class A Dress Pants - {men) Flying Cross
List prices for sizes: 28-42

List prices for oversizes: 44-568

Class a Dress Pants - (women) Patriot
List prices for sizes: 6-20
List prices for oversizes: 22-24

Class A Dress Honor Guard Pants (made to measure)
List prices for sizes: 28-42

Class A Dress Coat - (men) Flying Cross
List prices for sizes: 34-46

List prices for oversizes: 48-50

List prices for oversizes: 52-54

Class A Dress Coat - (women) Patriot
List prices for sizes: 6-20
List prices for oversizes: 22-24

NAFECO S.T.AR. STAR.
Clarkston, GA | Cakwood, GA
FY23 FY24 %
$3.00 No bid
$2.00 No bid
$2.00 No bid
$3.00 No bid
$3.00 No bid
$2.00 No bid
$2.00 No bid
$2.00 No bid
$2.00 No bid
$3.00 No bid
$3.00 No bid
$8.00 No bid
$86.00 No bid
$86.00 No bid
$86.00 No bid
$86.00 No bid
$88.00 No bid
$52.00 No bid
$52.00 No bid
$52.00 No bid
$52.00 No bid
$74.00 No bid
$74.00 No bid
$74.00 No bid
$74.00 No bid
$56.00 No bid
$36.00 No bid
$36.00 No bid
$54.00 No bid
$54.00 No bid
$54.00 No bid
$54.00 No bid
$54.00 No bid
$54.00 No bid
$50.00 No bid
$24.00 No bid
$20.00 No bid
No bid
$104.00
$124.00
No bid
$104.00
$124.00
No bid
$120.00
No bid
$325.00
$350.00
$375.00
No bid
$325.00
$350.00




SUMMATION OF BIDS RECEIVED ,
# 023-43 FIRE AND ENMS UNIFORM NAFECOQ S.T.AR. S.TAR.
SUPPLY ANNUAL CONTRACT
Name of Company Clarkston, GA | Oakwood, GA
FY23 FY24 %
ltem # Description
40 Class A Dress Honor Guard Coat No bid
List prices for sizes: 38-46 $450.00
41 Class A Dress Honor Guard Top Coat No bid
List prices for sizes: 38-46 $230.00
List prices for oversizes: 48-50 $250.00
42  Honor Guard Shoulder Cord, 1/, 20", 22" adj. $28.00 No bid
43 Class A Dress Hat No bid
XS-2XL $75.00
44 Class A Honor Guard Hat No bid
X8 -2 XL $110.00
Chief's Hat with Flame Visor $150.00
45 Class A Dress Shoe - Bates 941 High Gloss Military Uniform Oxford No bid
List prices for men sizes: 4-15 {half sizes 6-12) $110.00
List prices far women sizes: 5-10 - (half sizes 5 1/2 - 9 1/2) $110.00
46 Dress Belt No bid
28-42 $24.00
44-54 $26.00
47 Honor Guard Parade Beit No bid
Even sizes 24-60 $98.00
48 Ties No bid
4-in-Hand
List prices for men sizes: 18, 20, 22 . $5.50
List prices women sizes: 14-16 $6.50
49 Long Sleeve White Shirt - Flying Cross #45W8600 men / # 102W6600 ladies No bid
List ptices for men neck sizes: 14-17.5 $62.00
List prices for men neck sizes: 18.5-20 $75.00
List prices for women bust sizes: 30-44 $62.00
List prices for women bust sizes: 46-48 $72.00
50 Short Sleeve White Shirt - Flying Cross #85R6600 men / #152R6600 women No bid
List prices for men - S - XL $54.00
List prices for men 2XL - 4XL $54.00
List prices for women bust sizes: 30-44 $58.00
List prices for women bust sizes: 46-48 $54.00
51 Long Sleeve Black Shirt - Flying Cross #47W6610 men / # 104W6610 ladies No bid
List prices for men neck sizes: 14-17.5 $62.00
List prices for men neck sizes: 18.5-20 $72.00
List prices for women bust sizes: 30-44 $62.00
List prices for women bust sizes: 46-48 ' $2.00
52 Short Sleeve Black Shirt - Flying Cross #97R6610 men / #154R6610 women No bid
List prices for men - S - XL, $62.00
List prices for men 2XL - 4XL $72.00
List prices for women bust sizes: 30-44 $62.00
List prices for women bust sizes: 46-48 $72.00
53 Staff Non-Pleated Black Pant - Flying Cross 3800 No bid
List prices for sizes: 28-42 $40.00
List prices for oversizes: 44-52 $45.00
List price for women sizes: 2-20 even sizes $40.00 2
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SUMMATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
# 023-43 FIRE AND EMS UNIFORM
SUPPLY ANNUAL CONTRACT
Name of Company

Description,

Physical Training shirts, NEXT LEVEL, s/s, Beefy T-shirt
S-XL
XL - 4XL

Physical Training Shorts - Champro # Boss 9
List prices for sizes: Small - XLarge
List prices for sizes; 2XL - 3XL

Physical Training Pants - Champro #1550
List prices for sizes: Small - XLarge
List prices for sizes; 2XL - 3XL

Sweatshirt Crewneck - Jerzees Style #562 Navy & Grey
List prices for sizes: Small - XLarge
List prices for sizes: 2XL - 3XL

Cap - Embroidered - Navy Biue

Flex-Fit Cap - Embroidered in Navy Blue
Red / Silver: SM/Med: LG/XL
Red / Gold: SM/Med:; LGAXL

Fleece Beanie Hat in Navy Blue

Job Shirt - Tri-Mountain # 647 Alarm and # 644 React in Navy Blue
# 647 sizes: Small - 4X Large

Small - XL

2XL - 4XL

Large Tall 4XL

Boots - Bates #2066 - men's 7 - 12

Boots - Bates # 2261 )
men's medium - 6-12, 13, 14, 15, 16
men's extra wide - 7-12, 13, 14

Boots - USBBK, Redback Only
List men full sizes; 4-15

List men half sizes: 5.5-12.5

List men wide width sizes: 15-16

Shoes - #834-633 Men's Oxford Black and #534-6333 Women's Oxford Black
List prices for men sizes. 7-12

List price for men size: 13

List price for men size: 14

List price for men size: 15

List prices for women sizes: 7-12

List price for women size: 13

List price for women size: 14

List price for women size: 15

Nomex Uniform Shirt - Workrite # 720NX45 Short Sleeve in Midnight Blue
38-50
52-54

Nomex Polo Shirt, Workrite #263TK-67-NB, sfs, in navy
XS-3XT
4XT-5XT

Nomex Uniform Shirt, Workrite #705NX-45-NV, Ifs in navy

NAFECO STAR. S.TAR
Clarkston, GA | Oakwood, GA
FY23 FY24 %
$15.00 $8.50
$17.00 $12.50
No bid $10.65
No bid $12.15
$30.00 $11.95
$32.00 $13.95
$28.00 $14.50
$30.00 $16.50
$16.50 $17.50
$18.50 $15.95
$18.50 $15.95
$9.00 $8.50
$62.00 $65.00
$64.00 $75.00
364.00 $80.00
No bid No bid
No bid No bid
No bid No bid
No bid
$160.00
$160.00
$160.00
$160.00
$160.00
$160.00
$160.00
$160.00
$124.00 $155.00 $175.00 12.90%
$138.00 $210.00 . $230.00 9.50%
$94.00 $109.00 $129.00 18.30%
$100.00 $139.00 $159.00 14.40%
3
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SUMMATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
# 02343 FIRE AND EMS UNIFORM
SUPPLY ANNUAL CONTRACT
Name of Company

Description
XS-3X
4X-6X

Nomex Uniform Shirt, Workrite #701NMX-45-NV, sfs in navy
X8-3X
4X-5X

Nomex Uniform Shirt, Workrite #708NX-45-NV, I/s in navy
XS-3X
4%-5X

Nomex Uniform Pant, Workrite #400-NX-75 Industrial or #402-NX-75 in navy
List prices for sizes: 2842
List prices for oversizes: 44-56

Nomex Uniform Pant, Workrite #401-NX-75 in navy
List prices for sizes: 2-20
List prices for oversizes: 28-50

Nomex Uniform Pant, Workrite #401-NX-75-NV in navy
List prices for sizes: 2-20
List prices for oversizes: 28-50

Nomex Cargo Shorts, Workrite #425NX-60-NV in navy
List prices for sizes: 25-50
List prices for oversizes: 52-60

Rescue Belt, Rescue Tech #703306, w/"V" ring
Standard size
QOver Size

Firefighter Turnout Gear Bag, FIREARTH20-N-107-WH

Staff Short Sleave Tactical Polo Shirt - Propper F534172
List price for men sizes: XS-XL
List price for men size: 2XL - 6XL

Staff Long Sleeve Tactical Polo Shirt - Propper F5315
List price for men sizes: X8-XL
List price for men size: 2XL - 6XL

Staff Short Sleeve Tactical Polo Shirt - UFX K5100
List price for men sizes: S-XL
List price for men size; 2XL - 4XL

NAFECO S.T.AR. S.T.AR.
Clarkston, GA | Oakwood, GA
FY23 Fy24 %
$136.00 $1856.00 $205.00 10.80%
$146.00 $245.00 $265.00 8.20%
$124.00 $155.00 $175.00 12.90%
$138.00 $210.00 $230.00 9.50%
$136.00 $185.00 $205.00 10.80%
$146.00 $245.00 $265.00 8.20%
$136.00 $175.00 $195.00 11.40%
$146.00 $235.00 $255.00 8.50%
$136.00 $175.00 $195.00 11.40%
$146.00 $235.00 $255.00 8.50%
$136.00 $175.00 $195.00 11.40%
$146.00 $235.00 $255.00 8.50%
$120.00 $185.00 $205.00 10.80%
$140.00 $245.00 $265.00 8.20%
No bid
$36.00
$40.00
$78.00 No bid
No bid
$44.00
$48.00
No bid
$50.00
$54.00
$62.50 $55.00
$75.00 $65.00




SUMMATION OF BIDS RECEIVED

# 023-43 FIRE AND EMS UNIFORM NAFECO S.T.AR. S.TAR.
SUPPLY ANNUAL CONTRACT
Name of Company Clarkston, GA | Oakwood, GA
FY23 Fy24 %
Item # Description
80 Tactical Pants - Propper # F525650
30-42 $44.00 $42.00
44-54 $48.00
81 Tactical Pants - Propper #F5252-50 (olive)
3042 No bid
44-54
Recruit Uniforms
82 T-Shirt Hanes Beefy in Heather Grey
List price for sizes: Small-X Large $14.00 $11.95
List price for size: 2XL - 3 XL $16.00 $15.95
83 BDU Pant - Propper # F5201-38-405
List price for sizes: Small-X Large $32.00 $35.00
List price for sizes: 2X Large-3X Large $34.00 $35.00
84 AV-58121F, Alert vision 5 point breakaway vest No hid
List Price for sizes L - 2XL $64.00
86 Sweatshirt Crewneck - Recruit
List price for sizes: Small-X Large $28.00 $14.50
List price for size: 2XL - 3 XL $30.00 $19.50
86 Physical Training Shorts _ Recruit
List price for sizes: Small-X Large $18.00 $11.95
List price for sizes: 2X Large-3X Large $20.00 - $14.95

Added additional se:vices 823119 per Fire Services request as needed
88 Hem Pants
89 Add patch to sleeve
90 Add callar insignia
91 Add badge emblem
92 Add namestrip (if provided)
93 Add velcro to namestrip

94 Add 1 gold stripe
Add 2 gold stripes
Add 3 gold stripes
Add 4 gold stripes
Add 5 gold stripes

95 Add 1 Maltese Cross
Add 2 Maltese Crosses
Add 3 Maltese Crosses
Add 4 Maltese Crosses
Add 5 Maltese Crosses
Add 6 Maltese Crosses
Add 7 Maltese Crosses
Add 8 Maltese Crosses
Add 9 Maltese Crosses
Add 10 Maltese Crosses

86 5.11 Responder Parka - black #48063-019
S-XL . 5
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SUMMATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
# 023-43 FIRE AND EMS UNIFORM
SUPPLY ANNUAL CONTRACT
Name of Company

Description
2XL-4XL
Thorogood Tactical Oxford black #834-6522

4-15

Replace Bates 2066 to 2262
7-15

Flexfit Cap with HCFS logo, #5580-NV
S, LIXL

Richard 112 Cap with HCFS logo #112
one size

ADDITIONAL ITEMS ADDED 12/20/2022
Tecasafe Uniforms

Men's pants 28-42 #87200-86
Men's pants 44-56 #87200-86

Men's Short Sleeve shirts  #8200-86
Navy S-XL

Men's Short Sleeve shirts  #8200-86
Navy 2XL-5XL

Men's Long Sleeve shirts  #8220-86
Navy S-XL

Men's Long Sleeve shirts  #8220-86
Navy 2XL-5XL

Women's Pants #82700W-86
Size 2-26

Women's Short Sleeve Shirt #8200W-86
Navy Size 30-52

Women's L.ong Sleeve Shirt #8220W-86
Navy Size 30-50

NAFECO

Clarkston, GA

S.TAR.
Oakwood, GA

FY23

S.T.AR.

FY24

%

$114.00

$125.00

$96.00

$105.00

$98.00

$108.00

$114.00

$96.00

$98.00




