	BID #003-44 FIRE SPRINKLER SYSTEM ANNUAL CONTRACT	Century Fire Dulut
	Location	Type of Inspec.
1	For furnishing all labor, materials, and equipment necessary for the inspection of the fire sprinkler system located at the Hall County Courthouse "77" Building, 116 Spring Street, Gainesville, Georgia 30501 as per the following specifications:	
2	For furnishing all labor, materials, and equipment necessary for the inspection of the fire sprinkler system located at the Hall County Courthouse, 225 Green Street, Gainesville, Georgia 30501 as per the following specifications:	
3	For furnishing all labor, materials, and equipment necessary for the inspection of the fire sprinkler system located at the Hall County Parking Deck, 122 Spring Street, Gainesville, Georgia 30501 as per the following specifications:	
4	For furnishing all labor, materials, and equipment necessary for the inspection of the fire sprinkler system located at the Hall County District II Health Department, 1280 Athens Street, Gainesville, Georgia 30501 as per the following specifications:	
5	For furnishing all labor, materials, and equipment necessary for the inspection of the fire sprinkler system located at the Hall County "Catherine F. Brown" Health Department Building, 1290 Athens Street, Gainesville, Georgia 30501 as per the following specifications:	
6	For furnishing all labor, materials, and equipment necessary for the inspection of the fire sprinkler system located at the Spout Springs Library, 6488 Spout Springs Road, Flowery Branch, Georgia 30542 as per the following specifications:	
7	For furnishing all labor, materials, and equipment	

necessary for the inspection of the fire sprinkler system located at the Hall County Jail, 1700 Barber Road Gainesville, Georgia 30507 as per the following specifications:

- 8 For furnishing all labor, materials, and equipment necessary for the inspection of the fire sprinkler system located at Hall County Resource Recovery, 1008 Chestnut Street, Gainesville, Georgia 30501 as per the following specifications:
- 9 For furnishing all labor, materials, and equipment necessary for the inspection of the fire sprinkler system located at the Hall County Landfill, 1700 Oakbrook Drive Gainesville, Georgia 30507 as per the following specifications:
- 10 For furnishing all labor, materials, and equipment necessary for the inspection of the fire sprinkler system located at the East Hall Community Center, 3912 P Davidson Road, Gainesville, Georgia 30507 as per the following specifications:
- 11 For furnishing all labor, materials, and equipment necessary for the inspection of the fire sprinkler system located at the Mulberry Creek Community Center, 4491 J M Turk Road, Flowery Branch, Georgia 30542 as per the following specifications:
- 12 For furnishing all labor, materials, and equipment necessary for the inspection of the fire sprinkler system located at the Emergency Services Complex, 470 Crescent Drive, Gainesville, Georgia 30501 as per the following specifications:
- 13 For furnishing all labor, materials, and equipment necessary for the inspection of the fire sprinkler system located at the Animal Control, 1688 Barber Road, Gainesville, Georgia 30507 as per the following specifications:
- 14 For furnishing all labor, materials, and equipment necessary for the inspection of the fire sprinkler system located at North Hall Community Center, 4175 Nopone

Road, Gainesville, GA 30506 as per the following specifications:

- 15 For furnishing all labor, materials, and equipment necessary for the inspection of the fire sprinkler system located at the Hall County Government Center, 2875 Browns Bridge Road, Gainesville, Georgia 30504 as per the following specifications:
- 16 For furnishing all labor, materials, and equipment necessary for the inspection of the fire sprinkler system located at Hall County Sheriff's Office, 2859 Browns Bridge Road, Gainesville, GA 30504 as per the following specifications:
- 17 For furnishing all labor, materials, and equipment necessary for the inspection of the fire sprinkler system located at Hall County Correctional Institute, 1698 Barber Road, Gainesville, GA 30507 as per the following specifications:
- 18 For furnishing all labor, materials, and equipment necessary for the inspection of the fire sprinkler system located at Hall County Elachee Nature Center, 2125 Elachee Drive, Gainesville, GA 30504 as per the following specifications:
- 19 For furnishing all labor, materials, and equipment necessary for the maintenance and repair of the fire sprinkler systems located at all of the above facilities:
  - A. Hourly Labor Rate
  - B. Overtime Hourly Labor Rate
  - C. Percentage Markup on Parts
- 20 For furnishing all labor, materials, and equipment necessary for a 3 to 5 year Internal Inspection at any Hall any Hall County location as per the following specifications: (does not include annual test)

**A**. Remove the cover plate to the fire sprinkler control valve and check for any possible damage or problems to the valve.

**B.** Replace all pressure gauges.

**C.** Perform an obstruction investigation in the fire sprinkler main piping.

**D.** Retag the fire sprinkler systems after all work has been performed.

Protection	Johnson Controls		ProTech Fire, Inc.	
h, GA	Roswell, GA		Gainesville, GA	
\$ Per Inspec.	Type of Inspec.	\$ Per Inspec.	Type of Inspec.	\$ Per Inspec.
\$235.00		No Bid		No Bid
\$425.00		No Bid		No Bid
\$200.00		No Bid		No Bid
i				
\$85.00		No Bid		No Bid
\$85.00		No Bid		No Bid
\$85.00		No Bid		No Bid

\$995.00	No Bid	No Bid
\$110.00	No Bid	No Bid
\$85.00	No Bid	No Bid
\$85.00	No Bid	No Bid
\$85.00	No Bid	No Bid
<del>403.00</del>	NO BIU	
\$85.00	No Bid	No Bid
\$85.00	No Bid	No Bid
	l	l l

\$85.00	No Bid	No Bid
\$990.00	No Bid	No Bid
\$255.00	No Bid	No Bid
<b>4-------------</b>		
\$85.00	No Bid	No Bid
\$195.00	No Bid	No Bid
φ135.00		
\$125.00	No Bid	No Bid
\$195.00	No Bid	No Bid
30%	No Bid	No Bid
\$200.00	No Bid	No Bid