Contract #010-42-2

State of Georgia
County of Hall
Supplement Agreement #2
Firefighting Equipment Annual Contract March 28, 2023

Whereas, the County desires to extend the contract period for a one year period through June 30, 2024,
in accordance with the terms and conditions of Bid #010-42, Firefighting Equipment Annual Contract, dated

December 9, 2021 and

Whereas the Contractor has agreed to this extension and agrees to provide services and/or materials
previously supplied in accordance with the original agreement; and

Whereas, with both parties agreeing to the extension as stated and therefore, the above numbered
contract is hereby changed as follows:

1. By extending the contract coverage for a one year period through June 30, 2024,
2. Allow for price adjustments as agreed to and recorded in Attachment A,

3. Change Orders: Any and all change orders requested by the successful bidder on this project must
be approved per the County's Purchasing Policies through the Contract Administrator prior to any work

being performed. Any work performed outside the contract agreement for which compensation over and
above the contract is requested must have an approved Change Order. If work is done before approval
of a Change Order, the subsequent Change Order will be rejected.

With the above change to the original contract set forth herein, the parties hereto agree that all terms
and conditions of the original agreement will remain in full force and effect and legally binding on both
parties.

In witness whereof, the parties hereto have set their hands and affixed their seals the day and year
first above written.
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State of Georgia ' Contract #010-42-2
County of Hall

Supplement Agreement #2 -

-

Firefighting Equipment Annual Contract

March 27, 2023

Whereas, the County desires to extend the contract period for a one year period through June 30,

2024 in accordance with the terms and conditions of Bid #010-42, Firefighting Equipment Annual
Contract, dated December 9, 2021 and

Whereas the Contractor has agreed to this extension and agrees to provide services and/or materials
previously supplied in accordance with the original agreement; and

Whereas, with both parties agreeing to the extension as stated and therefore, the above numbered
contract is hereby changed as follows:

1. By extending the contract coverage for a one year period through June 30, 2024

2. Allow for p}ice adjustments as agreed to and recorded in Attachment A

3. Change Orders: Any and all change orders requested by the successful bidder on this project must
be approved per the County’s Purchasing Policies through the Contract Administrator prior to any work
being performed. Any work performed outside the contract agreement for which compensation over and

above the contract is requested must have an approved Change Order. If work is done before approval
of a Change Order, the subsequent Change Crder will be rejected.

With the above change to the original contract set forth herein, the parties hereto agree that all terms

and conditions of the original agreement will remain in full force and effect and legally binding on both
parties.

i Inwitness whereof, the parties hereto have set their hands and affixed their seals the day and year

ﬁrst above written.
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Subscribed and sworn to in our North America Fire Equipment Co.
presence this 15 day of
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State of Georgia Contract #010-42-2
County of Hall

Attachment A

Cﬂ\w gw e %Rﬁs&w

Firefighting Equipment Annual Contract March 27, 2023

Whereas, the Contractor and the County have agreed to a change in the contract prices and have
recorded them below, and have both agreed to their rates, the prices associated with this contract are hereby
changed upon approval of the County:

Vanguard MK-1 Ultra pricing for FY 2024 will be $110.50

Black Diamond X2 boot pricing for FY 2024 will be $309.75

Prices above do not include shipping
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State of Georgia Contract #010-42-2
County of Hall

Supplement Aareement #2

Firefighting Equipment Annual Contract March 27, 2023

Whereas, the County desires to extend the contract period for a one year period through June 30, 2024,
in accordance with the terms and conditions of Bid #010-42, Firefighting Equipment Annual Contract, dated
December 9, 2021 and

Whereas the Contracter has agreed to this extension and agrees to provide services and/or materials
previously supplied in accordance with the original agreement; and

Whereas, with both parties agreeing to the extension as stated and therefore, the above numbered
contract is hereby changed as follows:

1. By extending the contract coverage for a one year period through June 30, 2024,
2. Allow for price adjustments as agreed to and recorded in Attachment A,

3. Change Orders: Any and all change orders requested by the successful bidder on this project must
be approved per the County’s Purchasing Policies through the Contract Administrator prior to any work

being performed. Any work performed outside the contract agreement for which compensation over and
above the contract is requested must have an approved Change Order. If work is dene before approval
of a Change Order, the subsequent Change Order will be rejected.

With the above change to the original contract set forth herein, the parties hereto agree that all terms
and conditions of the original agreement will remain in full force and effect and legally binding on both
parties.

In witness whereof, the parties hereto have set their hands and affixed their seals the day and year
first above written.

Subscribed and to inour whiieg,, Hall County, Georgia
i Mter Ry, b .
presilcjfthls day of b ve %,

O ol e I
023 > D mSSI0n e ~
, 202 -~ ."(.Pﬂ 6‘*0;..9 l=
- f& owotarg, By 2
y 5T e : Ey 2
' “,

£%  Ayne  F.O3 Rich&rd Higgins/
A Laest O Commission Chéirman
‘ )

%, C HLIGE O
iPielt ) BT
“ ’NSIP:\\\‘\\
. . 3§ "ll""" : .
Subscribed and sworn to in our R o, Georgia Fire & Rescue Suppl
presen.ethis__l_jSLday of §¢é‘ _..--IE,?: /4"‘:?’""'4 ° PRy
[ I ;2008 £, . Vou 2%
I

122 By
0 ot

FQO§ Sales Representative

Fs. - o2 % -
L iR ®% 701 : m/é,__
‘ (Y %& = Z3 - -
5 ‘fy

Commission expires:

/,
g n®



SUMMATION OF BIDS RECEIVED Georgia Fire and NAFECO Ten-8 Safety

INVITATION FOR BID # 01042 Rescue Supply
FIREFIGHTING EQUIPMENT ANNUAL CONTRACT Canton, GA Decatur, AL Forsyth, GA
ltem Price Price Price
Number

1 Hoods - Innotex $96.00 $103.95 187.50
2 Boots - GLOBE no bid no bid no bid
3 Boots - Black Diamond 295.50 $324.00 no bid
4 Janesville V-Force Bi-Swing Coat no bid 2043.00 no bid
5 Janesville V-Force Pant with Belt no bid 1695.00 no bid
6 Cairns 1010 Helmet no bid no bid $543.00
7 Helmet Front no bid no bid 45.00
8 Helmet Repair Parts no bid no bid 25%
9 Vanguard Gloves $106.75 $127.19 $108.00

Total

Bennett Fire
Woodstock, GA
Item Price
Number

1 Hoods - Innotex no bid
2 Boots - GLOBE $459.00
3 Boots - Black Diamond no bid
4 Janesville V-Force Bi-Swing Coal no bid
5 Janesville V-Force Pant with Belt no bid
6 Cairns 1010 Helmet no bid
7 Helmet Front no bid
8 Helmet Repair Parls no bid
9 Vanguard Gloves no bid

BUDGETED AMOUNT: ANNUAL CONTRACT
BIDS MAILED: 36 (H)2

BIDS RECEIVED: 4 (3-NoBid) (H) Suggested Award by Fire Service:

DEPARTMENT: Fire Services Items #3 & #9 - Georgia Fire and Rescue
Items #4 & #5 - NAFECO

No bid: Fire Line Inc. , Winder, GA Items#1, #6, #7 and #9 - Ten-8 Safety

Municipal Equipment Co., LLC, Tifton, GA We will not be using item #2 boot

HAIX North American, Inc., Lexington, KY
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CONTRACT EXECUTION SIGNATURE REQUEST
Date: 5/3/2023

To: Richard Higgins, Commission Chairman
From: Debra Howington, Buyer

Your signature is requested to execute the attached bid/contract award
documents for:

Bid/Contract No: IFB #010-42
Bid/Contract Name: Firefighting Equipment Annual Contract
Department(s) Requesting Contract:  Fire Rescue

Award Recipient Name: Ten-8 Safety, LLC, Georgia Fire & Rescue
Supply and North American Fire Equipment Co. (NAFECO)

Date of BOC Approval:  5/10/2023

Contract Description: Hoods, boots, turnout gear, helmets
Annual Contract [] New Renewal

Prior Year's Spend: $125,136.00

Price Increase Requested by Georgia Fire and Rescue only.
Percentage Increase: See attached.

[] Project/Service Contract Awarded Amount: Click here to enter text.

Commodity Contract Awarded Amount: OPEN

Comments: This is year three (3) of a three (3) year bid.

Nine items on the contract. See attached bid tab for list of items.

Each vendor on the contract has an individual column. If they were
Awarded an item, it is hi-lited. NAFECO nor Ten-8 had a price increase.
Georgia Fire and Rescue increase is on following page.

Revised 08/05/2022 AGP



