
IFB#: 026-44

KBP 

Construction 

Plus, LLC

Pencor 

Construction
Precision Planning, Inc. Sunbelt Builders Choate Interior

Sheriff's Office Training Center Storage Building  Construction Company

Winder, GA Alpharetta, GA Lawrenceville, GA Covington, GA Atlanta, GA

Description Cost Proposal Cost Proposal Cost Proposal Cost Proposal Cost Proposal

TASK 1: Project Design Phase $6,500.00 $9,500.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

TASK 2: Preliminary Design Approval/changes $32,861.75 $2,750.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

TASK 3: Final Design $8,500.00 $2,750.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

TASK 4: Permitting $3,500.00 $1,263.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

TASK 5: Construction Services

Site prep $3,650.00 $3,489.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Water/electricity installation $14,000.00 $34,477.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Concrete slab $18,490.00 $10,047.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Structural assembly $16,430.90 $61,954.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

TOTAL $103,932.65 $126,230.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid


