SUMMATION OF BIDS RECEIVED
INMATE CLOTHING & RELATED

Bob Barker

Victory Supply,

Hard Time

StrongPoint

Anchortex
Corporation

SUPPLY ITEMS LLC Products L.L.C.
ANNUAL CONTRACT
Bid #008-45
B!DS EMA_ILED: 30 (H)1 . Fuquay-Varina, NC Mount Pleasant, Rome, GA Gainesville, GA West Berlin,
Bids Received: 3 (H) 1 No Bids 2 TN NJ
Department: JAIL & CI
$6.74 / S-L
$6.94 / XL
Correctional classics striped trousers - $7.11/ 2XL $5.58 / S-2XL
sizes S-8XL, "Bob Barker #TBWT" or $7.31/3XL $6.63/ ea $7.00 / 3XL - 6XL no bid no bid
equivalent, black/white stripe $7.56 / 4XL $10.35 / 7XL - 8XL
$8.56 / 5XL-6XL
$12.11/ 7XL-8XL
$6.74 / S-L
$6.94 / XL
Correctional classics striped trousers - $7.11/ 2XL $5.58 / S-2XL
sizes S-8XL, "Bob Barker #TOWT" or $7.31/3XL $6.63 / ea $7.00 / 3XL - 6XL no bid no bid
equivalent, orange/white stripe $7.56 / 4XL $10.35/ 7XL - 8XL
$8.56 / 5XL-6XL
$12.11 / 7XL-8XL
Case of 6
$70.14 /S
$74.34 /M
65/35 poly/cotton twill, 7.5 oz. white $S8892..3144//XLL
pants with dark blue stripe. Double $90.30 / 2XL
stitched on cuff less pants, belt loops, $91.14 / 3XL $23.98 / ea no bid no bid no bid
button fly, two front pockets, two $97.14 / 4XL

back pockets, sizes S-8XL

$103.14/ 5XL
$113.94/ 6XL
$116.34/ 7XL
$125.94/ 8XL




$7.98/S-L
$8.44 [ XL-2XL

Men's poly/cotton triple needle full $8.64 / 3XL 5.58 / S-2XL
elastic pant w/mock fly, navy, sizes S - $8.94 / AXL 6.63 / ea $7.00 / 3XL - 6XL no bid no bid
8XL $9.36 / 5XL-6XL $10.35/ 7XL - 8XL
$10.44/ 7XL
$10.75/ 8XL
Case of 12
$20.28 / S-L $20.63 / S-XL
White T-Shirts, 100% cotton w/crew $24.00 / L-XL $33.53 / 2X - 5XL ) .
. 3.19 / ea no bid no bid
neck. Sizes S - 8XL $28.00 / 2XL-3XL $37.61/ 6XL
$35.00 / 4XL -7XL $42.00/ 7XL
S44.00 / 8XL
Case of 12
$12.90/ S-XL
Case of 12 $13.43 / 2XL
Underwear, Boxers, 65/35 poly/cotton $13.22 /S -XL $13.97 / 3XL
e $12.12 / cs (12) _ _
broadcloth. Elastic waistband. $14.92 / 3XL $14.51 / 4XL no bid no bid
. (51.01/ ea)
Hemmed legs & patch fly. Sizes S - 8XL $15.42 / 4XL $15.05 / 5XL
$16.12 /5XL - 8XL $16.05 / 6XL
$17.05 / 7XL
$18.05 / 8XL
Inmate tube socks, 90% cotton/7%
0 .
pol}/ester/3A) elastic, unbleach.ed . $4.84 / cs (12) $5.16 / ¢cs (12) no bid no bid no bid
white. Double welt top, One size fits (50.40 / ea) (50.43 / ea)
all, 12 per pack, Men's & Women's
Military style cotton webbed belt,
. . $18.48 / ¢s (12) . . .
1.25" wide, webbing w/buckle and 5.49 / ea no bid no bid no bid
. (51.54 / ea)
tip
Watch cap, 1-Size-Fits-All, 100% $15.48 / cs (12) $11.52 /cs (12) | $23.64 per dozen i i
i no bid no bid
Acrylic, Navy (51.29 / ea) (50.96 / ea) (51.97/ea)
Mesh safet t ilver &
esh satety v.es ! or.ange w/silver 3.88/ea 5.21/ea 5.78 / ea no bid no bid
yellow reflective stripes
. . $19.68 /S -3XL
Denim jacket, 100% cotton denim $20.68 / 4XL
w/grey flannel lining, button front, ’ 21.49 /ea no bid no bid no bid

cuffless sleeves. Sizes S-8XL

$21.68 / 6XL - 7XL
$24.68 - 8XL




Rain poncho, vinyl, orange, "Bob

. $34.66 / cs (12) 1.14 / ea no bid no bid no bid
Barker #VRP-OR or equivalent"
Chore coat, blanket lined Khaki twill, sl;;:iéj;;i(l_
Si(;l';irsrrj-ST)Zj( #JKT-5052 or equivalent $21.68 / 6XL - XL 19.23 / ea no bid no bid no bid

$24.68 - 8XL
LAUNDRY ITEMS:
Bleach, Laundry,. 55 Gallon Drum, "ZEP no bid 16 bid $612.99 16 bid 1o bid
# 86885" or equivalent
Detergent, Laundry, 55 Gallon Drum, no bid no bid $659.00 no bid no bid
"ZEP # 86685" or equivalent
no bid no bid
PERSONAL HYGIENE:
Clippers, Fmgernall,.Z" Long, "Bob $7.66 / cs (24) 0.29 / ea $2.64 per dozen 16 bid 16 bid
Baker # PT1" or equivalent (50.32 / ea) (50.22/ea)
Clippers, Toe Nail, Nickel Plated Steel
with Chrome Finish, No File, "Bob S?S.?)35Qc;é;)2) 0.71/ea 57'2(20/ gg/redac))zen no bid no bid
Baker # TC1" or equivalent ' '
‘ $27.27/ cs (500) $100.00 / $100.00 / . .
Razor, anti-shank, 500/case ($0.05 / ea) cs (500) cs (500) no bid no bid
' ($0.20 / ea) ($0.20 / ea)
Soap, Bar, 5 ounce, Anti-Bacterial, $34.14/ cs (144) »80.00/cs $40.00 /cs (72) i .
Individually Wrapped (50.24 / ea) (1000) (50.56) no bid no bid
(50.08 / ea)

Hygiene Kit to contain the following:
Washcloth, Tuft short toothbrush,
Maximum security toothpaste, Black
plastic 5” black comb, Sheets of loose
paper, Plain white envelopes, Clear $1.01 / kit $1.98 / kit $0.85/kit no bid no bid
plastic mechanical pencil, #2 lead
stacking point, Eraser cap. All items
are to be in an 8” x 10” clear,
enclosable zip closure poly bag.
Shampoo, lice control, non-foaming, Per Case of 4
one-gallon with dispensing pump with $171.24 Per Case of 4
each gallon for one ounce of shampoo $51.51/ea $137.40 no bid no bid
dispenses, "Bob Barker" #LCS-128 or (542.81 per ($34.35 per gallon)
equivalent gallon)




Shave Cream, 0.25 ounce, Vinyl

$53.97 / ¢s (1,000)

$60.00 /

$5.00/ cs (1000)

Packet, Case / 1,000, "Bob Barker # c¢s (1000) no bid no bid
0.05 0.005
SCP" or equivalent (5 / ea) (50.06 / ea) (> /ea)
Toothbrush, 3-1/4" Long, | Color,
CZSe / {ZZ "Bob/Barlf:rg# ;:2'/_250..0; $4.98 / cs (144) $7.20 / cs (144) 5.76 / cs (144) no bid no bid
: ’ ($0.03 / ea) ($0.05 / ea) ($0.04 / ea)
equivalent
Toothpaste, 0.6 , Animal Fat-
cothpaste, ©.b ounce, Anima ra $19.28 / cs (144) $20.16 / cs (144) _ ,
Free Fluoride, "Bob Barker Maximum ($0.13 / ea) 0.11/ ea ($0.14 / ea) no bid no bid
Security # MS306" or equivalent ' '
T |, first lity, 20” x 40", 86%
OWel, TTst quality, 20 x ° $10.61/cs(12) | $11.16/cs(12) | $11.40/dozen _ _
cotton, 14% polyester with 100% no bid no bid
. (50.88 / ea) (50.93 / ea) (50.95 / ea)
cotton loop on both sizes
Wash Cloth, first lity, 12" x 12",
86;:\’/S Cot(t)on lnz‘quuoa: Ie»;ter w)i(th 100% 216.92/cs (12) 22.40 / dozen »1.80/ dozen no bid no bid
° 70 TONE °l ($1.41/ea) ($0.20 / ea) (30.15 / ea)
Cotton Loop on both sides
OTHER:
Odor Hound Air & Surface spray 32 fl.
Oz 6/case, "Bob Barker OH-532" or $56.22 / cs (6) $14.99 / ea no bid no bid no bid
equivalent
Safety fl ti-fati t, "Bob . . .
atety o anti-a |g“ue ma i © $65.22 / ea $74.44 / ea no bid no bid no bid
Barker #26916035" or equivalent
Heavy duty utility cart 25" x 40", "Bob . .
231.15 269.00 260.00 bid bid
Barker #5805BE" or equivalent > /ea > /ea /ea no bl no bl
50.00 350.00
Protective Detainee hood, "Bob $166.50 / cs (50) > / > / . .
Barker #7000" or equivalent (53.33 / ea) ¢s (100) ¢s (100) no bid no bid
g ' ($2.00 / ea) ($3.50 / ea)
PERSONAL UTENSILS:
Cup, I'T‘Iol?/propylene, 7-1/2 OLlJlnce, Buff, $50.94 / cs (72) $151.20/ $130.00/ ' '
3-1/8" high, Micrwave Safe, "Bob cs (240) cs (72) no bid no bid
" . (50.71/ ea)
Barker # 724B" or equivalent (50.63 / ea) (51.31/ ea)




178.56 50.25
. $69.13 / cs (144) > / 2 / . .
Deodorant, stick, 5 oz. alcohol-free ($0.48 / ea) cs (576) cs (144) no bid no bid
' ($0.31 /ea) ($0.35 / ea)
Sporl|<|, Mini, Thumb handLe, Case / $10.10 /cs (100) ‘ ' '
100, "Bob Barker #THSPK" or $0.15 no bid no bid no bid
' (50.10/ ea)
equivalent
$125.00/
17.98 100 60 400
Teaspoon, Safety Type, Orange Plastic 2 ($0.1/8c/se(a) ) S(SO./1C55/( ea)) cs (360) no bid no bid
(50.35 / ea)
108.72 80.00
Drinking Tumbler, "Zylon Milk White" $48.92 / ¢cs (72) > / > / . .
or equivalent, 12 oz (50.68 / ea) s (72) s (72) no bid no bid
’ ' ' ($1.51 / ea) ($1.11 / ea)
BARBER NEEDS:
Electric Hair Clippers, includes "Wahl
V5000 Motor Clipper, 4 ounce Hair . . .
88.48 69.43 bid bid bid
Clipper Oil bottle, 1/8" Attachment > /ea > /ea no ol no bl no bl
Comb & Instructions" or equivalent
Hair Clipper, Disinfectant Spray, 12
75.75 12
ounce, "Bob Barker # 72130 > /es(12) $11.45/ ea no bid no bid no bid
) . . (56.31 per spray)
Clippercide" or equivalent
BEDDING:
Bed Blanket, 62" x 82", "Bob Barker #
’ ’ 6.98 6.15 bid bid bid
WB6280" or equivalent > /ea > /ea no o no ot no o
Bed Blanket, 66" x 90", "Tabb Textile # $56.00 per dozen . .
9.12 5.16 bid bid
TB152" or equivalent 2 /ea 2 /ea (54.67 per blanket) noo! nob!
Bed Blanket, 72" x 90", "Bob Baker # . . .
N ar,], © . X ob Baker $5.18 / ea $5.16 / ea no bid no bid no bid
TN7290" or equivalent
_ $25.72 [ ¢cs (12) $22.80 per dozen _ )
Bed Sheets, 54" x 90", Flat, Whit 2.44 bid bid
e eets X a ite ($2.14/ ea) S / ea ($1.90 / ea) no bi no bi
Pillow, 20" x 26", 100% Fire-Retardant
Polyester Fiber, treated with "Staph- $6.52 / ea $6.99 / ea $4.69 no bid no bid

Chek 44" or equivalent.




Pillowcase, Standard, Polyester &
Cotton Blend, White

$8.49 / cs (12)
(50.71 /ea)

1.04 / ea

no bid

no bid

no bid




