Municipal

INVITATION FOR BID # 021-45 Pro Fire and FireLine Inc. Ten-8 Fire and NAFECO Emergency Services
FIREFIGHTING EQUIPMENT ANNUAL CONTRA! Tactical , LLC Safety, LLC (MEC)
Woodstock, GA Winder, GA Bradenton, FL Decatur, AL Sandy Hook, CT
item - PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
Number Description
Hoods - Innotex Gray 25 Particulate Blocking
1 $108.50 NO BID $107.78 $118.78 NO BID
Boots - GLOBE FootGEar Structural Shadow
2 |xF NO BID NO BID $530.12 NO BID NO BID
Boots - Black Diamond X2 Leather Structure
3 Fire Boots $317.24 $349.00 NO BID $358.88 $310.00
Cairns 1010 Helmet: 6" silk eagle, Clear
defender shield, standard head liner, and
yellow nomex ear flaps. Colors: white / red /
4  |black/yellow/orange NO BID $368.00 $380.00 NO BID NO BID
Cairns 1036 Helmet - 6" silk eagle, Clear
defender shield, standard head liner, and
yellow nomex ear flaps. Colors: white / red /
| llow /
g |lack/yellow/orange NO BID $379.00 $380.00 NO BID NO BID
Helmet front: helmet front to Contain 6"
leather front with sewn-on numbers to fit
Cairns 1010 and 1836. Please state warrant
on materials and labor. A copy of warranty
g |MUST accampany bid NO BID $58.00 $58.91 NO BID NO BID
8" silk eagle : $49 35 %OFF LIST
Defen ield: R t fol
Helmet Repair Parts: Repair parts for ltems 4 Headi;zi;‘:}f L cI:?i:::ﬂonris
i 5 Cairns Model 1010 and 183f5 helmet. vellow ear lapse, included as separate
Alease s;ala wartra&tﬁ 22 material and;%bor. velcro tab $82 pricing for each part.
copy of warranty accompany bid. Yellow earlaps $46
7 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Gloves: Vanguard Safety Wear MK1 Ultra $97.98
8 [Structural Fire Glove. No exception. $113.50 $129.00 $121.99 #7877 NO BID
Gloves: HexArmor FireArmor SR-X-8180 $92.68
g  |structural firefighting glove NO BID NO BID $73.30 #8180 $85.00

BUDGETED AMOUNT: ANNUAL CONTRACT
BIDS MAILED: 31 (1-H)
BIDS RECEIVED: 5 (1-No Bid) 1 (H)

DEPARTMENT: Fire Rescue




