HALL COUNTY

We have it all in Hall

POST OFFICE DRAWER 1435
GAINESVILLE, GA 30503

t: 770.535.8270 | f 770.531.6711

DIRECTOR
Wesley Geddings

Hall County Government
FINANCIAL SERVICES

EXHIBIT C

RFP #44-031
Mandatory Cost Proposal Worksheet

Company Name: National Equipment Dealers, LLC

Bidder's Name: Hunter Coley
G

_ iz
Bidder's SignaturW K///y‘
vl S

Date: 3/25/24

« Instructions: Provide an all-inclusive list of
equipment. Include makes, models, list price,
percentage discount factor, and the net cost for
hourly, daily, weekly, and monthly rentals.




Date: 3/28/24
Valid For: 120 Days

Pricing Schedule
Hall County Government
Rental of Equipment

Rospondent Name NATIONAL EQUIPMENT DEALERS LLGC
" — Woekly Rotall Weokly Rata Monthly Retail Monthiy Rate . Discourit % off
. Equipment 7 " aty|  DallyRate . Rats (Municlpaly Rat. Municipay | POV RID il monthiy rate
= L Excavafor i . < B [N - . : i i : i B
7 800 Ib Mini Excavator HYUNDAI R35-9A Upan Request | NOEBID 5 80000 | 8 540.00 |'$ 2,000.00 [ $ 1,600.00 [ § 375.00 20.00%)
13,000 Ik Mini Excavator HYUNDAI R55-8A Upon Reguest | NO EID 3 1,000.00 | $ 800.00 | $ 2,350.00 [ $ 1,880.00 | § 375.00 20,00%
18,500 b Mini Excavator HYUNDAI RBOCR-0A Upon Request | NO BID 5 1,300.00 [ § 1,040.00 | % 3,300.00 | § 2,640.00 [ $ 375.00 206.00%
Excavator 25 000-29,999 b HYUNDAI HX130ALCR Upon Regquest | NO BID 5 1,750.00 [ $ 1,400,00 | $ 4,000.00 | § 3,200,00 [ $ 600.00 20,00%]
Excavator 43,000 - 49,839 b HYUNDAI HX180AL Upen Request | NO BID 5 195000 [ 8 1,560.00 | $ 500000 | § 4,000.00 | $ 600.00 20.00%:
Excavator 52,000 Ib HYUNDAI HX220AL Upen Request | NO BID 5 2,500.00 200000 [ $ 6,250,00 | 8 5,000.00 | § 600,00 20,00%
|Excavalor&‘u,000-69 999 [b HYUNDAL HA300AL Upen Requast | NO BID 5 3,200,00 2,560.00 | $ 7,800.00 5240.00 | 3 500.00 20,00%
Excavator 77,000 b HYUNDAL HX350AL Upon Request | NO BID 3 3,500.00 3,120.00 | § 9,500,00 7.600.00 | § 500.00 20,00%
Excavator 89,000 b HYUNDAI HX380AL Upon Request | NO BID 3 4,300.00 344000 | § 11,000.00 8,800.00 | $ 500.00 20.00%|
Long Reach Excavater 73,000 (b (60') _|HYUNDAI HX300ALR Upon Request | NO BID S 4,600.00 3,680.00 | § 11,500.00 | § 9,200,00 | $ 600.00 20,00%
Wheeled Excavator 48.000 Ib HYUNDAI HW210A Upon Reguest | NO BID S 260000 | $ 2,080.00 | 3 6,500.00 | § 520000 | $ 600.00 20.00%
I SKdStoer R - — —— - - - =1 - : - — =
1,500 - 2 100 b Track Skidsteer MANITOU 2150 RT Upon Request [ NO BID E 1,000.00 | $ 800.00 2.500.00 | $ 200000 | $ 400,00 20.00%
2,800 - 4 000 I Track Skidsteer MANITOL 3200 VT Upon Request | NO BID 1,50000 [ $ 1,200.00 3,500.00 [ $ 2,850.00 | 3 400.00 20.00%
Compact Wheel Loader 1 cubic yard MANTTOU MLA T Upon Request | NG BID 1,250.00 | 8 1,000.00 2,750.00 [ £ 2200.00 | 3 400.00 20.00%
Dump Trucks ... . i . e . . . ] . .t
Off Read Dump Truck BELL B20E Upcn Request | NOBID 5 4,000.00 | § 3200008 10,000.60 | § 8,000.00 [ & 600,00 20.00%
_Oif Read Dump Truck BELL B30E Upon Request | NOBID 5 4,500.00 | $ 3,600.00 | & 11,500.00 | § 9.200.00 500.00 20.00%
_Oft Road Dump Truck BELL B4OE Upon Request | NO BID 5 5500.00 | $ 4,400,00 | § 14,000.00 | § 11,200.00 500.00 20.00%
_O#f Road Dump Truck |EELL B4SE Upon Request [ NO BID 5 5200.00 | $ 4,960.00 | $ 15,500.00 | § 12,400,00 500.00 20,00%
Off Road Dumnp Truck BELL B50E Upon Request | NO BID 5 7,500.00 | 5 5,000.00 | § 18,000.00 | 3 14,400.00 | § 600.00 20,00%!
. Wheel Loaders - U ) . .
Loader Wheel 3.0-3.4 Cubic Yard HYUNDAI HL930A Upon Request | NO BID 5 2,000.00 | § 160000 | § 5,000.00 | $ 4,000.00 | § 600.00 20.00%
Loader Wheel 3.5 Cubic Yard HYUNDAI HL940A Upen Request | NO BID S 220000 | 8 1,760.00 | § 550000 | 4,40000 | $ 600.00 20.00%
Loader Wheel 4.5 Cubic Yard HYUNDAI HLBS5A Upon Request | NO BID S 240000 | 1,920.00 | § 6,000.00 4,800.00 ) $ 600.00 20,00%
Loader Wheel 5.0 Cuble Yard HYUNDAI HLSS0A Upon Request | NO BID S 3,200.00 | $ 2,560.00 | 8 8,200.00 656000 | $ 600.00 20,00%
Loader Wheel 5.5 Cubic Yard HYUNDA) HLS85A Upon Request | NO BID 5 3,750.00 | $ aco000fs 10,500.00 | § 8,400,00 | § 600.00 20.00%
Loader Whee| 6.5 Cubic Yard HYUNDa) HLS70A Upon Request | NO BID 5 425000 | § 3,400.00 [ 3 11,000.00 | § 8,500.00 1 8 600.90 20.00%
Loader Wheel 7.5 Cubic Yard HYLNDA! HLSB0A Upon Requsst | NOEID 5 540000 | § 4,320.00 | $ 13,500.00 | § 10,800.00 [ § 500,00 20.00%]
Compacticn Equlpment . . ) . ] ]
Single Drum / 54" DYNAPAC CA1300 Upen Request | NO BID 5 1,30000 [ $ 1,040.00 [ 3 3.200.00 [ 5 2,560,00 [ § 400.00 20.00%
Single Dirum / 68" CAYNAPAC CA1500 Upon Recuest | NOBID 5 1,700.00 | § 1,360.00 | 3 4,000.00 | § 3,200,00 | $ 580.00 20.00%
Single Drum / 84" DYNAPAC CAZ500 Upen Request | NO BID 5 2,000.00 ] & 5 5200.00 | $ 4,160.00 | ¢ 580.00 20.00%
Motor Grader | T — > 1= —
175hp / 12-14' Blade ___John Deere 672G Upon Reguest | NO BID s 3600.00 | § 9,000.00 | $ 7.200.00 20.00%
Era o0 Off Road Water Truck - Tl e oA . ° o= R A s
[5000 Galon Water Truck BELL B30E Upon Reguest | NO BID § § 13,500.00 [ § 10,600.00 | $ 600.00 20.00%

Notatlons/Comments: Piease utilize this area to list any notes, describe any promotional priclng, and to clarify the monthly rate calculation your organization utilizes.
Defivery rale is one-way, ploase use same for pick up. Weekly rate discount is +-20%.




