IFB #017-45 Uniforms E;::\z;r:acr;n- Stro:ggomt, Pl:l':nlilf(;rsnif;ty Dana Safety | T & T Unifroms,
SHERIFF UNIFORM SUPPLY ANNUAL CONTRACT Unlimited Commerc;e Gainesville, | Supply of GA Supply, Inc. Inc.
BID TABULATION Athens, GA CA GA Bogart, GA Sugar Hill, GA Austell, GA
Item # f)escription PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE

Badges and Bars
1 [1ST LIEUTENANT. BADGE Blackington, GOLD $ 8250 | $ 89.00 | $ 66.25 | $ 81.66 | $ 7013 | $ 100.00
2 |BADGE-SHERIFF Blackington B682, GOLD $ 7650 | $ 89.00| $ 66.25 | $ 81.66 | $ 70.13 | $ 100.00
3 |BADGE-ASSIST. COMMANDER Blackington B682, GOLD | $ 7650 | $ 89.00| $ 66.25 | $ 81.66 | $ 70.13 | $ 100.00
4 |BADGE-MAJOR Blackington B682, GOLD $ 76.50 | $ 89.00 | $ 66.25 | $ 81.66 | $ 7013 | $ 100.00
5 |BADGE-CAPTAIN Blackington B682, GOLD $ 7650 | $ 89.00| $ 66.25 | $ 81.66 | $ 70.13 | $ 100.00
6 |BADGE-LIEUTENANT Blackington B682, GOLD $ 7650 | $ 89.00 | $ 66.25 | $ 81.66 | $ 7013 | $ 100.00
7 |BADGE-SGT Blackington B682, GOLD $ 7650 | $ 89.00| $ 66.25 | $ 81.66 | $ 70.13 | $ 100.00
8 |BADGE-INVESTIGATOR Blackington B682, GOLD $ 76.50 | $ 89.00 | $ 66.25 | $ 81.66 | $ 7013 | $ 100.00
9 |BADGE-DEPUTY Blackington B682, GOLD $ 76.50 | § 89.00 | $ 66.25 | $ 81.66 | $ 70.13 | $ 100.00
10 |BADGE GUNMETAL JAILER Blackington, Black $ 59.00 | $ 89.00| $ 66.25 | $ 79.00 | $ 56.36 | $ 81.50
11 |NAME PLATE Blackington, GOLD $ 15.00 | $ 22.00 | $ 13.00 | $ 14.08 | $ 1257 | $ 20.00
12 |NAME PLATE Blackington, SILVER $ 15.00 | $ 24.00 | $ 13.00 | $ 14.08 | $ 1257 | $ 20.00
13 [COLLAR BRASS-SO GOLD, Symbo Arts, S.0., GOLD $ 5.00( $ 26.00 $ 21.00($ 16.81 | $ 25.00
14 |COLLAR BRASS-HC SILVER Symbo Arts, H.C., SILVER $ 6.00 | $ 24.00 $ 21.00 | $ 18211 $ 25.00
15 |COLLAR BRASS-HC GOLDSymbol Arts, H.C., GOLD $ 6.00 | $ 26.00 $ 21.00 | $ 16.81 | $ 25.00
16 |COLLAR BRASS-SO SILVER Symbol Arts, S.O., SILVER $ 500($ 29.00 $ 21.00| $ 18211 $ 25.00
17 |HAT BADGE-GOLD Blackington, B862, GOLD $ 83.00 | $ 89.00 | $ 50.75 | $ 94.50 | $ 76.28 | $ 115.00
18 |HAT BADGE-SILVER, Blackington, Hat Silver, SILVER ) 104.00 | $ 95.00 $ 87.99 | 9% 7091 | $ 97.00
19 |HAT COVER, Flying Cross, COVER, Black $ 9.00 NO BID $ 8.00 NO BID NO BID $ 25.00

Clothing - No exceptions where noted

CLASS A PANTS -MEN'S FLYING CROSS, BLACK
20 |POLYESTER 3900-10

List prices for sizes: 28-40 $ 41.50 $ 50.00

List prices for oversizes: 42-52 $ 49.50 $ 60.00

CLASS A PANTS -WOMEN'S FLYING CROSS, BLACK
21 |POLYESTER 3900W-10

List prices for sizes: 2-20 $ 41.50 $ 50.00

List prices for oversizes: 22-24 $ 49.50 $ 60.00
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Description PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE

CLASS A SHIRT - MEN'S

L/S, FLYING CROSS,

SILVER TAN 33W782-04

List prices for sizes: 14 - 20 $ 57.00 $ 56.00

List prices for oversizes: 20-22 $ 69.00 $ 67.00

CLASS A SHIRT - WOMEN'S

L/S, FLYING CROSS,

SILVER TAN 126R78Z-04

List prices for sizes: 30 - 48 $ 57.00 $ 56.00

List prices for oversizes: $ 69.00 $ 67.00

CLASS A SHIRT - MEN'S

S/S, FLYING CROSS, Silver

Tan 85R78Z-04

List prices for sizes: 14 -21 $ 48.50 $ 50.00

List prices for oversizes: $ 59.00 $ 60.00

CLASS A SHIRT - WOMEN'S

S/S, FLYING CROSS, Silver

Tan 176R782-04

List prices for sizes: 30-48 $ 48.50 $ 50.00

List prices for oversizes: $ 59.00 $ 60.00

Ties

CLASS A TIE-20" LENGTH Samual Broome, Black $ 7.00 $ 4.99 $ 7.00

CLASS A TIE-22" LENGTH Samual Broome, Black $ 7.00 $ 5.99 $ 7.00

CLASS A TIE - SIZE 14.5 Samual Broome, Black $ 6.00 $ 4.99 $ 7.00

CLASS B SHIRT MEN'S L/S,

5.11 PDU TWILL, SILVER

TAN 72546

List prices for sizes: S - XL $ 64.50 $ 70.00 $ 46.04 | $ 78.00

List prices for oversizes: 2XL - 4XL $ 74.50 $ 70.00 $ 53.04 | $ 94.60

CLASS B SHIRT WOMEN'S

L/S, 5.11 PDU TWILL,

SILVER TAN 62086-752

List prices for sizes: S - XL $ 64.50 $ 70.00 $ 62.74

List prices for oversizes: $ 74.50 $ 70.00 $ 77.01 % 78.00
$ 9460
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Description PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
CLASS B MEN'S PANTS,
5.11, STRYKE PDU, BLACK
74545-019
List prices for sizes: 30 - 40 $ 69.00 $ 70.00 $ 58.16 | § 78.00
List prices for oversizes: 42 - 58 $ 79.00 $ 75.00 $ 58.16 | $ 94.60
CLASS B WOMEN'S PANTS, 5.11, STRYKE PDU, BLACK
64472-014
List prices for sizes: 2 - 14 $ 69.00 $ 70.00 $ 58.16 | $ 83.50
List prices for oversizes: 16-20 $ 79.00 $ 75.00 $ 58.16 | $ 100.00
5.11 CLASS B MEN'S SHORT SLEEVE FULL SHIRT, PDU
TWILL, SILVER TAN 71177
List prices for sizes: S - XL $ 50.50 $ 46.04 | $ 61.00
List prices for oversizes: 2XL - 4XL $ 57.50 $ 56.04 | $ 73.00
5.11 CLASS B MEN'S HYBRID PDU L/S, RAPID PDU,
SILVER TAN 72197
List prices for sizes: S - XL $ 57.50 $ 60.00 $ 53.04 | $ 70.00
List prices for sizes: S Short - XL Short $ 57.50 $ 60.00 $ 53.04 | $ 70.00
List prices for sizes: S Tall - XL Tall $ 57.50 $ 60.00 $ 53.04 | $ 70.00
List prices for oversizes: 2XL Tall - 6XL Tall $ 66.00 $ 70.00 $ 60.86 | $ 84.00
5.11 CLASS B MEN'S HYBRID PDU S/S, RAPID PDU,
SILVER TAN 71332
List prices for sizes: S - XL $ 64.50 $ 56.00 $ 4954 [ § 66.00
List prices for sizes: S Short - XL Short $ 54.50 $ 56.00 $ 4954 | $ 66.00
List prices for sizes: S Tall - XL Tall $ 54.50 $ 56.00 $ 59.54 | $ 66.00
List prices for oversizes: 2XL Tall - 6XL Tall $ 60.00 $ 66.00 $ 57.36 | $ 79.00
5.11 CLASS B WOMEN'S HYBRID PDU L/S, RAPID PDU,
SILVER TAN
List prices for sizes: S - XL $ 54.50 $ 60.00 $ 53.04 | $ 68.00
5.11 CLASS B WOMEN'S HYBRID PDU S/S, RAPID PDU,
SILVER TAN
List prices for sizes: S - XL $ 58.00 $ 56.00 $ 4954 [ § 73.00
CLASS C MEN'S BLACK POLO, 5.11, 71049-019
List prices for sizes: S - XL $ 37.00 $ 38.00 | $ 42.00 | $ 36.92 | $ 45.00
List prices for oversizes: 2XL - 4XL $ 40.50 $ 43.00 | $ 45.00 | $ 3716 | $ 54.00
CLASS C WOMEN'S BLACK POLO, 5.11, 61165-019
List prices for sizes: S - XL $ 37.00 $ 38.00 | $ 4200 | $ 33.61|9% 3 43.00




puyaiy UM

38

39

40

41

42

43

44

45

46

47

Description PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
List prices for oversizes: 2XL - 4XL $ 40.50 $ 43.00| $ 45.00 NO BID $ 51.00
CLASS C MEN'S RED POLO, 5.11, 71049-477
List prices for sizes: S - XL $ 37.00 $ 38.00 | $ 42.00 | $ 33.92 (% 45.00
List prices for oversizes: 2XL - 4XL $ 40.50 $ 43.00| $ 4500 | $ 37.16 | $ 54.00
List prices for sizes: S - XL $ 37.00 $ 38.00 | $ 42.00 | $ 33.61[9% 43.00
List prices for oversizes: 2XL - 4XL $ 40.50 $ 43.00| $ 45.00 NO BID $ 51.00
CLASS C MEN'S TAN POLO, 5.11, 71049-160
List prices for sizes: S - XL $ 37.00 $ 38.00 | $ 42.00 | $ 33.92 (% 45.00
List prices for oversizes: 2XL - 4XL $ 40.50 $ 43.00| $ 4500 | $ 37.16 | $ 54.00
CLASS C WOMEN'S TAN POLO, 5.11, 61165-160
List prices for sizes: S - XL $ 37.00 $ 38.00 | $ 42.00 | $ 33.61 (9% 43.00
List prices for oversizes: 2XL - 4XL $ 40.50 $ 43.00| $ 45.00 NO BID $ 51.00
FLYING CROSS COMMAND JACKET, MP351558, Black ,
38800-10
List prices for sizes: 30 - 40 $ 190.00 $ 150.00
BLAUER MEN'S TACTICAL PANTS, BLACK , 8666
List prices for sizes: 30 - 40 NO BID $ 69.99 $ 83.00
List prices for oversizes: 42 - 56 **46 & up PER Public Safety NO BID $ 75.00 $ 99.00
BLAUER WOMEN'S TACTICAL PANTS, BLK 8666W
List prices for sizes: 2 -16 NO BID $ 69.99 $ 83.00
List prices for oversizes: 18 & UP NO BID $ 75.00 $ 99.00
BLAUER MEN'S L/S FULL SHIRT - SILVER TAN, 8671
List prices for sizes: S - XL NO BID $ 69.99 $ 77.00
List prices for oversizes: 2XL - 5XL NO BID $ 83.81 $ 93.00
BLAUER WOMEN'S L/S FULL SHIRT - SILVER TAN,
8671W
List prices for sizes: 30 - 46 NO BID $ 69.99 $ 77.00
List prices for sizes: NO BID $ 83.81 $ 93.00
BLAUER MEN'S S/S FULL SHIRT - SILVER TAN, 8676
List prices for sizes: Small - XLarge NO BID $ 65.85 $ 72.00
List prices for sizes: 2XL - 5XL NO BID $ 79.68 $ 4 86.00
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BLAUER WOMEN'S S/S FULL SHIRT - SILVER TAN,
8676W
List prices for sizes: 30 -44 NO BID $ 65.85 $ 72.00
List prices for sizes: NO BID $ 79.68 $ 86.00
BLAUER MEN'S L/S ARMORSKIN HALF SHIRT - SILVER
TAN, 8361
List prices for sizes: Small - XLarge NO BID $ 63.00 $ 66.00
List prices for sizes: 2XL - 5XL NO BID $ 75.65 $ 79.00
BLAUER MEN'S S/S ARMORSKIN HALF SHIRT - SILVER
TAN, 8362
List prices for sizes: Small - XLarge NO BID $ 53.00 $ 59.00
List prices for sizes: 2XL - 5XL NO BID $ 64.34 $ 71.00
BLAUER WOMEN'S S/S
ARMORSKIN HALF SHIRT -
SILVER TAN, 8362W
List prices for sizes: XSmall - XLarge NO BID $ 53.00 $ 59.00
List prices for sizes: NO BID $ 64.34 $ 71.00
BELLEVILLE BOOTS -
KHYBER SIDE ZIP, BLACK,
TR960Z
Shoe Size: 4.0 - 8.5 $ 120.00 $ 130.00 | $ 103.32 [ § 133.00
Shoe Size: 9.0 - 12.0 $ 120.00 $ 130.00 | $ 103.32 | § 133.00
Shoe Size:12.5- 15.0 $ 120.00 $ 130.00 | $ 103.32 [ § 133.00
CAMPAIGN HAT- STRATTON, 10DB, BLLACK
Hat Sizes: 6 1/2 - 8 $ 96.00 $ 90.00 | $ 89.99 $ 117.00
CAMPAIGN HAT ACORNS-GOLD, FLYING CROSS, $10.00 ALT
ACORNS, GOLD $ 9.50 $ 9.00 ITEM $ 11.00
CAMPAIGN HAT STRAPS, FLYING CROSS, STRAP,
BLACK $ 9.00 $ 9.00 | $9.99 ALT ITEM $ 7.00
HAT COVER, FLYING CROSS, COVER, BLACK, 475 RHC | $ 9.00 $ 8.00 $ 14.00
ROTHCO BEANIE, 8460, BLACK $ 7.50 $ 6.50 [ § 8.00 $ 10.00
5.11 SIERRA BRAVO NYLON DUTY BELT - SIERRA
List prices for sizes: Small - XLarge $ 47.50 $ 52.00 | $ 59.99 | § 4334 | $ 90.00
List prices for sizes: 2XL - 5XL $ 55.00 $ 56.00 | § 62.00 | $ 4792 | $ 5 65.00
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Item # w PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
5.11 SIERRA BRAVO REPLACEMENT BUCKLE, SB
59 |BUCKLE, BLACK $ 6.50
60 |5.11 SIERRA BRAVO REPLACEMENT BELT KEEPERS, $ 11.50 $ 11.00 | $ 16.00
SB BELT KEEPERS, BLACK
61 |HALTZ TRAFFIC GLOVES FULL FINGER, HighVisibility
61a |[HNT501 - SMALL NO BID $ 33.00
61b |HNT502- MEDIUM NO BID $ 33.00
61c |[HNT503- LARGE NO BID $ 33.00
61d |HNT504-XL NO BID $ 33.00
61e [HNT505-XXL NO BID $ 33.00
61f |[HNT506-XXXL NO BID $ 33.00
$55.00 ALT
62 |TRAFFIC VEST- 2, REFLECTIVE APPAREL, YELLOW $ 47.00 ITEM $ 49.00
63 |FLASHLIGHT CONE, STREAMLIGHT, 75903, ORANGE $ 7.00 $ 650 $ 77119% 503(9% 9.00
64 |HANDCUFFS, SMITH & WESSON, M100, SILVER $ 32.00 $ 3000 $ 36.99 | $ 3782 | $ 39.99
65 [HANDCUFF CASE-NYLON, SIERRA BRAVO, BLACK $ 17.25 $ 17.00 | $ 25.00 (% 15.62
66 |HANDCUFF KEY W/ KEYCHAIN, Zak Tool, ZT11P, BLACK | $ 7.00 $ 950 $ 899 (% 55719 9.00
67 |HANDCUFF KEY W/CLIP, Zak Tool, ZT14, BLACK $ 7.00 $ 9501 $ 899 (9% 74119 9.00
BLAUER FLEXRS ARMORSKIN SILT OUTER CARRIER
68 |SILVER TAN, 8360XP
XS -4XL NO BID $ 114.00 $ 126.00
Oversize & Tall $ 139.00
RADIO HOLDER - NYLON, 5.11 SIERRA BRAVO RADIO,
69 |HOLDER $ 28.00 $ 28.00 | $ 2840 | $ 23.42
70 |FLASHLIGHT, STINGER, BLACK, 75813 $ 156.00 $ 185.00 | $ 14175 | $ 11746 | $ 190.00
71 |STREAMLIGHT STYLUS GREEN,STYLUS, BLACK $ 37.00 $ 28.00 | $ 2099 | $ 2113 | $ 21.00
72 |PATCH REMOVAL $ 2.00 $ 200 $ 2.26 $ 4.00
73 |PATCH REPLACEMENT $ 3.00 $ 500(9% 2.75 $ 4.00
74 |HEMMING $ 6.00 $ 10.00 | $ 10.50 $ 12.00
75 |UNIFORM REPAIR $ 6.00 $ 10.00 $2.00**

** #75--tears and snags**

BIDS MAILED: HALL:
BIDS RECEIVED: 6 (3 -NoBIDS) HALL: 1
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