RFQ/P #45-005 State Route 13/Atlanta Highway Corridor Study

Bid Tab Summary

Keck & Wood, | Atlas Technical | KCI Technologies, | Croy Engineering, Pond & Kimley-Horn & |Precision Planning, | CSC Design,
SCORES
Inc Consultants, LLC Inc LLC Company, Inc Assoc. Inc Inc Inc

Average Technical Scores 655.00 620.00 635.00 630.00 645.00 615.00 NO BID NO BID
Average Cost Scores 110.00 70.00 100.00 120.00 170.00 170.00 NO BID NO BID
Total Scores 765.00 690.00 735.00 750.00 815.00 785.00 NO BID NO BID
Cost $175,500.00 $200,000.00 $194,900.00 $189,336.00 $149,948.00 | $145,000.00 NO BID NO BID
Number of bids emailed 78

Number of bids emailed to Hall Co 7

Total responses 8

Number of Hall Co responses 0

No Bids 2
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