
SCORES P. Marshall and 
Associates, LLC

NGT Group LLC
Network Cabling 

Infrastructures, LLC
Hyper Networks 

LLC
The ComTran 

Group, Inc.
MasTec North 
America, Inc.

Lamar Engineering 
Services, LLC

IX NTI Holdings, 
LLC/Vertical 

Communications
, LLC (dba 
Network 
Connex)

Home Fiber Telecom 
LLC

SourceOne 
Corporation

Busker 
Communications

CenturyLink 
Communications, LLC 
(Lumen Technologies 

Group)

Babb Boring 
Inc

JM 
Communications

Telecommunications 
Technical Services (TTS)

Rosswell, GA Alpharetta, GA Duluth, GA Pineville, NC Buford, GA Coral Gables, FL Buford, GA Dallas, TX Alpharetta, GA Rosswell, GA Gainesville, GA Monroe, LA Cleveland, GA Gainesville, GA Atlanta, GA
Average Technical Scores 636.36 587.88 606.06 618.18 503.03 545.45 636.36 612.12 466.67 400.00 315.15 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Average Cost Scores 133.33 150.00 116.67 100.00 150.00 100.00 0.00 16.67 116.67 100.00 133.33 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Total Scores 769.70 737.88 722.73 718.18 653.03 645.45 636.36 628.79 583.33 500.00 448.48 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Cost $464,270.00 $523,626.50 $377,277.35 $207,281.25 $515,672.00 $176,000.00 $1,798,200.00 $807,546.02 $395,576.00 $170,613.60 $452,324.82

Number of bids emailed 68
Number of bids emailed to Hall Co 7
Total responses 15
Number of Hall Co responses 5
No Bids 4

RFQ/P #45-018 Design-Build Services for Fiber Cabling Installation
Bid Tab Summary
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