RFP #45-021 Hoschton Master Transportation Plan

Bid Tab Summary

Keck & Wood, | Kimley-Horn & | Croy Engineering, | Forestie Group, | CSC Design,
SCORES Inc AssZ)c. Inc ' I.gLC : LLC ’ Inc :
Average Technical Scores 720.00 670.00 630.00 570.00 NO BID
Average Cost Scores 150.00 160.00 170.00 140.00 NO BID
Total Scores 870.00 830.00 800.00 710.00 NO BID
Cost $148,305.00 | $148,000.00 $145,080.00 $149,450.00 NO BID

Number of bids emailed 68
Number of bids emailed to Hall Co 8
Total responses 5
Number of Hall Co responses 0
No Bids 1
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