
2023 & 2024 Refund Request- Richard Hale Account # 318891

Personal Property Account # 318891 included a 2016 Malibu Wakesetter for the 2023 and 
2024 tax years. The 2016 Malibu Wakesetter was traded in during 2022 for a 2022 
Mastercraft, but the owner, by his own admission, failed to report the sale. The 2022 
Mastercraft was picked up from the DNR list starting with the 2023 tax year but boat the 2016 
Malibu was still being taxed as well. An assessment notice that included both boats was 
mailed and not appealed. A refund is recommended for the 2016 Malibu for the 2023 and 
2024 tax years.  



Account

Year Original Value Corrected Taxable Difference 

Estimated County 

Refund 

2023 294,182 233,088 61,094 602.87

2024 294,182 233,088 61,094 581.9

Total 1,184.77                     

318891
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Refund request is for 2023 & 2024 now.
 
 
 
Nicole Griffin
Appraisal Systems Coordinator
Hall County Tax Assessors Office
(Office) 770-718-5712
Nicole.Griffin@Hallcounty.org
new logo

 
From: Rick Hale <rick.rickhale@gmail.com> 
Sent: Wednesday, February 5, 2025 5:29 PM
To: Nicole Griffin (Tax Assessors) <nicole.griffin@hallcounty.org>
Subject: Re: failed to report a boat sell and credit request 318891
 

Hi Nicole- good catch and yes, please help with a credit for the entire duration that I didn't own the boat!! 
 
You're the best! 
Rick 
 
On Wed, Feb 5, 2025 at 2:57 ?PM Nicole Griffin (Tax Assessors) <nicole.griffin@hallcounty.org> wrote:

Hi Rick,
 
Thank you for this information. Our personal property team is looking into this. I noticed in your email that you requested a
2024 refund, however the sale happened in 2022 so you may be eligible for a 2023 refund as well. Just let me know if that is
something you would like for us to check into as well and we can amend your original request to include 2023 and 2024.
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Thank you,  
 
Nicole Griffin
Appraisal Systems Coordinator
Hall County Tax Assessors Office
(Office) 770-718-5712
Nicole.Griffin@Hallcounty.org
new logo

 
From: Rick Hale <rick.rickhale@gmail.com> 
Sent: Thursday, January 30, 2025 4:13 PM
To: personal.property <personal.property@hallcounty.org>
Subject: failed to report a boat sell and credit request
 

 

Hi, just got off the phone with a great Hall County representative who suggested I submit this email.  I sold the
Malibu Wakesetter boat on 9/22.2022 (actually traded it for the new Mastercraft also on my tax bill) and I
assumed it would automatically be reported and removed at the county level. My mistake and apology. 
 
With that in mind, please consider a credit or refund for charges for 2016 Malibu Wakesetter 23 LSV
(registration 0931DB) for 2024 when I did not own it.  
 
Account number is 318891 on Marine Schedule D. and Boat registration for the Malibu is 0931DB.   The bill of
sale is attached and it shows the trade-in at the bottom for the Malibu and purchase of the Mastercraft I still
own. 
 
thanks
Rick Hale (Richard Hale legally)
404-735-4444
6417 Point Twenty Two
Gainesville GA 30506
 
--
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TAX BILL #

2023-109207

MAP CODE

P318891

LOCATION

0

LEGAL DESCRIPTION:

DISTRICT

4 Watercraft

1 
UNINCORPORATED

 2023 Property Tax Statement

BUILDING  +

0

LAND VALUE  =

0 294,182

 FAIR MARKET VALUE x 40%   =

ACREAGE

0

EXEMPTIONS

TAXING ENTITY
ASSESSED  -

VALUE
LESS  = 

EXEMPTIONS
TAXABLE  x

VALUE
MILLAGE  =

RATE
GROSS  -

TAX CREDITS =
NET
TAX

 STATE 117673 0 117673 0 0.00 0.00 0.00 

 GROSS COUNTY M&O 117673 0 117673 6.009 707.10 0.00 404.80 

      SALES TAX CREDIT 0 0 117673 -2.569 0.00 -302.30 0.00 

 SCHOOL M&O 117673 0 117673 15.64 1,840.41 0.00 1,840.41 

 SCHOOL BOND 117673 0 117673 1 117.67 0.00 117.67 

 GROSS UNINC FIRE 117673 0 117673 3.887 457.39 0.00 311.83 

      INSURANCE PREMIUM 
CREDIT

0 0 117673 -1.237 0.00 -145.56 0.00 

 EMERGENCY SERVICES 117673 0 117673 0.571 67.19 0.00 67.19 

 DEVELOPMENT SERVICES 117673 0 117673 1.005 118.26 0.00 118.26 

 PARKS & LEISURE SERVICES 117673 0 117673 0.364 42.83 0.00 42.83 

 SOLID WASTE FEE 0 0 0 0 0.00 0.00 0.00 

 LATE OR NON FILING PENALTY 0 0 0 0 154.75 0.00 154.75 

TOTAL 24.6700 $3,505.60 -$447.86 $3,057.74

Darla Eden CPA TAX COMMISSIONER 
Richard Steele CHIEF DEPUTY TAX COMMISSIONER 

 Penalty

 Interest

 2023 Current Due

 Other Fees

$3,057.74

$0.00

$26.76

$0.00

 TOTAL DUE $0.00

 Previous Payments $3,084.50

HALE RICHARD

6417 POINT TWENTY TWO

GAINESVILLE, GA  30506

 Delinquent Tax as of Billing Date $0.00

PAYMENT 
OPTIONS
Online: www.hallcountytax.org
(American Express, Discover, MasterCard, Visa, PayPal, E-Check)
By Mail: Check, American Express, Discover, MasterCard, Visa 
accepted. 
In Person: (Appointments preferred, limited walk-in availability): 
Hall County Government Center | 2875 Browns Bridge Rd | 
Gainesville GA 30504 M-F 8am-5pm
Drive-Up Drop Box: (Available 24/7) Located across from front 
doors at the Hall County Government Center under the breezeway.

2023 Property Tax Statement

Darla Eden CPA TAX COMMISSIONER 

Richard Steele CHIEF DEPUTY TAX COMMISSIONER
PO Box 1579 • Gainesville GA 30503 

BILL #

2023-109207

MAP CODE

P318891

DESCRIPTION

4 Watercraft

DUE DATE

11/15/2023

TOTAL DUE

$0.00

LOCATION

0

Make check payable to Hall County Tax Commissioner and include 
bill number on check.  Payments by American Express, Discover, 
MasterCard, Visa accepted.  Please fill out information below and 
return by mail, place in drop box or email: 

www.hallcountytax.org
propertytax@hallcounty.org

Phone: 770.531.6950
Text: 833.602.8497

PO Box 1579 • Gainesville GA 
30503

Credit and Debit Card Fees Apply

ASSESSED VALUE

117,673

HALE RICHARD

PROPERTY OWNER(S)

 Check here if making address change (see back)

AMOUNT  $_________________               EXPIRATION DATE  __________________

CARD #  ______________________________________________________________

CARD BILLING ZIP CODE  ________________________CVV____________________

CARDHOLDER PRINTED NAME  ___________________________________________

CARDHOLDER SIGNATURE  ______________________________________________

PHONE NUMBER  ______________________________________________________



Darla EDEN, CPA | TAX COMMISSIONER 
PO Box 1579 | Gainesville GA 30503 

http://tax.hallcounty.org    •    propertytax@hallcounty.org 
Phone: (770) 531-6950 • Fax: (770) 531-7111 

--Online Receipt--

Printed:    2/11/2025 3:21:32 PM

Trans No Property ID / District
Description

P318891 / 1
4 Watercraft
FMV: 294182

2023 - 109207

Original
Due

$3057.74

Interest & 
Penalty

$26.76

Fees:
$0.00
$0.00

Amount 
Due

$0.00

Amount
Paid

$3084.50

Transaction
Balance

$0.00

Paid Date:   12/4/2023 Charge Amount:   $3084.50

Totals:  $3057.74 $26.76 $0.00 $3084.50 $0.00

Scan this code with your 
mobile phone to view 
this bill

HALE RICHARD

6417 POINT TWENTY TWO

GAINESVILLE, GA  30506



TAX BILL #

2024-109379

MAP CODE

P318891

LOCATION

0

LEGAL DESCRIPTION:

DISTRICT

4 Watercraft

1 
UNINCORPORATED

 2024 Property Tax Statement

BUILDING  +

0

LAND VALUE  =

0 294,182

 FAIR MARKET VALUE x 40%   =

ACREAGE

0

EXEMPTIONS

TAXING ENTITY
ASSESSED  -

VALUE
LESS  = 

EXEMPTIONS
TAXABLE  x

VALUE
MILLAGE  =

RATE
GROSS  -

TAX CREDITS =
NET
TAX

 GROSS COUNTY M&O 117673 0 117673 5.573 655.79 0.00 380.55 

      SALES TAX CREDIT 0 0 117673 -2.339 0.00 -275.24 0.00 

 SCHOOL M&O 117673 0 117673 14.99 1,763.92 0.00 1,763.92 

 SCHOOL BOND 117673 0 117673 1 117.67 0.00 117.67 

 GROSS UNINC FIRE 117673 0 117673 3.637 427.98 0.00 282.42 

      INSURANCE PREMIUM 
CREDIT

0 0 117673 -1.237 0.00 -145.56 0.00 

 EMERGENCY SERVICES 117673 0 117673 0.571 67.19 0.00 67.19 

 DEVELOPMENT SERVICES 117673 0 117673 1.18 138.85 0.00 138.85 

 PARKS & LEISURE SERVICES 117673 0 117673 0.437 51.42 0.00 51.42 

 SOLID WASTE FEE 0 0 0 0 0.00 0.00 0.00 

TOTAL 23.8120 $3,222.82 -$420.80 $2,802.02

Darla Eden CPA TAX COMMISSIONER 
Richard Steele CHIEF DEPUTY TAX COMMISSIONER 

 Penalty

 Interest

 2024 Current Due

 Other Fees

$2,802.02

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

 TOTAL DUE $0.00

 Previous Payments $2,802.02

HALE RICHARD

6417 POINT TWENTY TWO

GAINESVILLE, GA  30506

 Delinquent Tax as of Billing Date $0.00

PAYMENT 
OPTIONS
Online: www.hallcountytax.org
(American Express, Discover, MasterCard, Visa, PayPal, E-Check)
By Mail: Check, American Express, Discover, MasterCard, Visa 
accepted. 
In Person: (Appointments preferred, limited walk-in availability): 
Hall County Government Center | 2875 Browns Bridge Rd | 
Gainesville GA 30504 M-F 8am-5pm
Drive-Up Drop Box: (Available 24/7) Located across from front 
doors at the Hall County Government Center under the breezeway.

2024 Property Tax Statement

Darla Eden CPA TAX COMMISSIONER 

Richard Steele CHIEF DEPUTY TAX COMMISSIONER
PO Box 1579 • Gainesville GA 30503 

BILL #

2024-109379

MAP CODE

P318891

DESCRIPTION

4 Watercraft

DUE DATE

11/15/2024

TOTAL DUE

$0.00

LOCATION

0

Make check payable to Hall County Tax Commissioner and include 
bill number on check.  Payments by American Express, Discover, 
MasterCard, Visa accepted.  Please fill out information below and 
return by mail, place in drop box or email: 

www.hallcountytax.org
propertytax@hallcounty.org

Phone: 770.531.6950
Text: 833.602.8497

PO Box 1579 • Gainesville GA 
30503

Credit and Debit Card Fees Apply

ASSESSED VALUE

117,673

HALE RICHARD

PROPERTY OWNER(S)

 Check here if making address change (see back)

AMOUNT  $_________________               EXPIRATION DATE  __________________

CARD #  ______________________________________________________________

CARD BILLING ZIP CODE  ________________________CVV____________________

CARDHOLDER PRINTED NAME  ___________________________________________

CARDHOLDER SIGNATURE  ______________________________________________

PHONE NUMBER  ______________________________________________________



Darla EDEN, CPA | TAX COMMISSIONER 
PO Box 1579 | Gainesville GA 30503 

http://tax.hallcounty.org    •    propertytax@hallcounty.org 
Phone: (770) 531-6950 • Fax: (770) 531-7111 

--Online Receipt--

Printed:    2/11/2025 3:20:09 PM

Trans No Property ID / District
Description

P318891 / 1
4 Watercraft
FMV: 294182

2024 - 109379

Original
Due

$2802.02

Interest & 
Penalty

$0.00

Fees:
$0.00
$0.00

Amount 
Due

$0.00

Amount
Paid

$2802.02

Transaction
Balance

$0.00

Paid Date:   11/18/2024 Charge Amount:   $2802.02

Totals:  $2802.02 $0.00 $0.00 $2802.02 $0.00

Scan this code with your 
mobile phone to view 
this bill

HALE RICHARD

6417 POINT TWENTY TWO

GAINESVILLE, GA  30506
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