
There are two parcels that are subject to a refund to Watermark on the Lake, Inc.; this is refund #2, 
parcel 10007 000109. This parcel was transferred to Watermark on the Lake, Inc. from the developer, 
Exterior Motives Contracting, Inc on May 31, 2023. The transaction documents did not identify 
Watermark on the Lake, Inc. as a Homeowners Association (HOA). As a result, the properties were 
valued and taxed as any other fee simple owned property ownership for 2024. A member of the HOA 
board contacted the BTA office questioning the taxation of the HOA common property for 2024. We 
requested supporting documents that Watermark on the Lake, Inc. is an HOA. A subsequent review of 
the Watermark on the Lake, Inc. Certificate of Incorporation verifies the status of Watermark on the 
Lake, Inc. as the HOA for the Watermark on the Lake subdivision. Given this information, the parcels 
have been revalued in accordance with the Department of Revenue’s APM (Appraisal Procedures 
Manual) and BOA policy. In instances where the HOA membership is mandatory, each property owner 
owns an undivided interest in the common property. The APM states that the BOA appraisal staff may 
recommend a nominal assessment of the common area parcel(s). Additionally, BOA policy calls for 
amenity and common areas to be valued at $1 on land and $1 for each improvement since the common 
area(s) are included in an undivided interest of each property owner.

A refund in the amount of $1,347.45 is recommended for approval for parcel 10007 000108 for tax year 
2024. The refund does not include the Street Light Fee. 

APM: Appraisal Procedures Manual 560-11-10-.09(4)(d)1: 

The appraisal staff may take into account the extent that the fair market value of 
individually owned units in a residential subdivision, planned commercial 
development, or condominium also represents the fair market value of any 
ownership interest in any common area that is conveyed with the individually 
owned units. When the appraisal staff determines that the fair market value of the 
common area is included in the fair market value of the individually owned units, 
the appraisal staff may recommend a nominal assessment of the common area 
parcel. When the appraisal staff makes such a determination, the fair market 
value of residual interests not conveyed to the owners of the individually owned 
units shall be appraised and an assessment recommended to the board of tax 
assessors. 

BOA Policy: 

12. Values for amenity and common areas shall be charged at $1 on land and $1 for each 
improvement. Golf courses and club houses where retail or commercial income is derived are 
excluded. Ownership must be held by a mandatory homeowners’ association and made available 
for the use of the members of the association. Approve by BTA 9/16/2015



2024 133,600$        4$  133,596$     $1,347.45

TOTAL REFUND $3,623.83

Parcel 10007 000109
Year Original Value Corrected Value Difference Remove Solid Waste Estimated County Refund

2024 239,000$        5$  238,995$     $2,276.38

Estimated County 
Refund 

Parcel 10007 000108 - REFUND #1
Year Original Value Corrected Value Difference Remove Solid Waste

rswatson
Highlight
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Nicole Griffin (Tax Assessors)

From: Tommy Sandoval <thomas.c.sandoval@gmail.com>
Sent: Wednesday, February 5, 2025 2:40 PM
To: Steve Watson (Real Property)
Cc: Nicole Griffin (Tax Assessors); John Smith (Tax Assessors); Marion Meeks (Tax Assessors); 

Wazim Khan (Tax Assessors); Eric Jackson (Tax Assessors)
Subject: Re: 059: Property tax Invoices and copies of checks for 2023, 2024

To whom it may concern at the Hall County Commission, Property Tax Assessors Board, Property Tax 
Assessor, as well as Tax Commissioner's office, or anyone else pertinent. We at Watermark on the Lake 
subdivision (Watermark on the Lake, Inc), mailing address 5910 Watermark Cv, Gainesville, GA 30506, 
respectfully request a refund of property taxes paid on subdivision common properties ( parcels 10007 
000108 and 10007 000109). Thank you in advance for helping rectify this issue.  
Tommy Sandoval 
Watermark on the Lake 
HOA President 
 
On Wed, Feb 5, 2025 at 2:30 PM Steve Watson (Real Property) <rswatson@hallcounty.org> wrote: 

Marion,  

  

The property was transferred into the name of Watermark on the Lake, Inc. There was no indication in the deed or 
associated documents that Watermark on the Lake, Inc. is an HOA. The HOA, knowing that they are an HOA did 
not appeal the assessment which included the estimated taxes and also paid the property tax bill. Now that Mr. 
Sandavol has brought to light this revelation with the supporting documentation (see attached to Nicoles email) I 
believe that Watermark on the Lake, Inc. is an HOA and should have been treated as such for 2024.  

  

Tommy, unless I have missed it send us a request for a refund, and we will start the process. Thanks. 

  

Respectfully, 

  

  

Steve Watson, 

Director/Chief Appraiser of Hall County Board of Assessors 

Hall County Government 

 CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the 
sender and know the content is safe. 
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(office) 770-531-6733  

(cell) 470-691-6375 

rswatson@hallcounty.org 

 

  

From: Nicole Griffin (Tax Assessors) <nicole.griffin@hallcounty.org>  
Sent: Wednesday, February 5, 2025 2:21 PM 
To: Tommy Sandoval <thomas.c.sandoval@gmail.com> 
Cc: Steve Watson (Real Property) <rswatson@hallcounty.org>; John Smith (Tax Assessors) <jtsmith@hallcounty.org>; 
Marion Meeks (Tax Assessors) <mlmeeks@hallcounty.org>; Wazim Khan (Tax Assessors) <wkhan@hallcounty.org> 
Subject: RE: 059: Property tax Invoices and copies of checks for 2023, 2024 

  

Hi Tommy, 

  

Just to make sure I am understanding correctly, you have paid parcels 10007 000108 and 10007 000109 for 2024 but 
believe they are missed valued due to be owned by the HOA?  

  

I am including your appraiser, Wazim, and our appraisal supervisor, Marion, on this reply. They will go over the 
documents (attached) you have sent in to us and see what, if any, adjustments can be made.  

  

Please let me know if you have any questions. 

  

Thank You,  

  

Nicole Griffin 
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Appraisal Systems Coordinator 

Hall County Tax Assessors Office 

(Office) 770-718-5712 

Nicole.Griffin@Hallcounty.org 

 

  

From: Tommy Sandoval <thomas.c.sandoval@gmail.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, February 5, 2025 2:05 PM 
To: Steve Watson (Real Property) <rswatson@hallcounty.org>; Nicole Griffin (Tax Assessors) 
<nicole.griffin@hallcounty.org> 
Subject: Fwd: 059: Property tax Invoices and copies of checks for 2023, 2024 

  

2024 Invoice attached and screen shot of payment. Is this sufficient? If you need anything else just let 
me know.  I sent this to Nicole Griffin in your office being your last email to me had her attached.  

Thank you, 

Tommy 

---------- Forwarded message --------- 
From: Cecilia Mandella <CM2@associationmgt.com> 
Date: Wed, Feb 5, 2025 at 12:35 PM 
Subject: 059: Property tax Invoices and copies of checks for 2023, 2024 
To: Tommy Sandoval <thomas.c.sandoval@gmail.com> 

  

Tommy, 

I have attached the invoices for your property taxes. Copy of check for invoices in screenshot 
below.  Please let me know if you need anything else. 

 CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the 
sender and know the content is safe. 
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Thank you, 

  

Cecilia Mandella 

Community Manager 

Assn Management Advisory Group  

P. O. Box 491537 
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Lawrenceville, GA 30049-1537 

678-407-1115 Office extension 108 

678-384-9389 

Please structure community name in Subject Line. 

e.g.Subject: community name, email subject 

Thank you, AMAG    

Confidential Email: The information transmitted is intended solely for the individual or entity to which it is addressed and 
may contain confidential and/or privileged material. Any review, retransmission, dissemination or other use of or taking 
action in reliance upon this information by persons or entities other than the intended recipient is prohibited. If you have 
received this email in error please contact the sender 

 

  

  



TAX BILL #

2024-79069

MAP CODE

10007 000109

LOCATION

6020 WATERMARK CV

LEGAL DESCRIPTION:

DISTRICT

WATERMARK S/D PHASE 1 AMENITY AREA

1 
UNINCORPORATED

 2024 Property Tax Statement

BUILDING  +

129,700

LAND VALUE  =

109,300 239,000

 FAIR MARKET VALUE x 40%   =

ACREAGE

0.84

EXEMPTIONS

TAXING ENTITY
ASSESSED  -

VALUE
LESS  = 

EXEMPTIONS
TAXABLE  x

VALUE
MILLAGE  =

RATE
GROSS  -

TAX CREDITS =
NET
TAX

 GROSS COUNTY M&O 95600 0 95600 5.573 532.78 0.00 309.17 

      SALES TAX CREDIT 0 0 95600 -2.339 0.00 -223.61 0.00 

 SCHOOL M&O 95600 0 95600 14.99 1,433.04 0.00 1,433.04 

 SCHOOL BOND 95600 0 95600 1 95.60 0.00 95.60 

 GROSS UNINC FIRE 95600 0 95600 3.637 347.70 0.00 229.44 

      INSURANCE PREMIUM 
CREDIT

0 0 95600 -1.237 0.00 -118.26 0.00 

 EMERGENCY SERVICES 95600 0 95600 0.571 54.59 0.00 54.59 

 DEVELOPMENT SERVICES 95600 0 95600 1.18 112.81 0.00 112.81 

 PARKS & LEISURE SERVICES 95600 0 95600 0.437 41.78 0.00 41.78 

 SOLID WASTE FEE 0 0 0 0 0.00 0.00 0.00 

 STREET LIGHT FEE 0 0 0 0 149.70 0.00 149.70 

TOTAL 23.8120 $2,768.00 -$341.87 $2,426.13

Darla Eden CPA TAX COMMISSIONER 
Richard Steele CHIEF DEPUTY TAX COMMISSIONER 

 Penalty

 Interest

 2024 Current Due

 Other Fees

$2,426.13

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

 TOTAL DUE $0.00

 Previous Payments $2,426.13

WATERMARK ON THE LAKE, INC.
c/o AMAG
P. O. BOX 491537

LAWRENCEVILLE, GA  30049

 Delinquent Tax as of Billing Date $0.00

PAYMENT 
OPTIONS
Online: www.hallcountytax.org
(American Express, Discover, MasterCard, Visa, PayPal, E-Check)
By Mail: Check, American Express, Discover, MasterCard, Visa 
accepted. 
In Person: (Appointments preferred, limited walk-in availability): 
Hall County Government Center | 2875 Browns Bridge Rd | 
Gainesville GA 30504 M-F 8am-5pm
Drive-Up Drop Box: (Available 24/7) Located across from front 
doors at the Hall County Government Center under the breezeway.

2024 Property Tax Statement

Darla Eden CPA TAX COMMISSIONER 

Richard Steele CHIEF DEPUTY TAX COMMISSIONER
PO Box 1579 • Gainesville GA 30503 

BILL #

2024-79069

MAP CODE

10007 000109

DESCRIPTION

WATERMARK S/D PHASE 1 AMENITY AREA

DUE DATE

11/15/2024

TOTAL DUE

$0.00

LOCATION

6020 WATERMARK CV

Make check payable to Hall County Tax Commissioner and include 
bill number on check.  Payments by American Express, Discover, 
MasterCard, Visa accepted.  Please fill out information below and 
return by mail, place in drop box or email: 

www.hallcountytax.org
propertytax@hallcounty.org

Phone: 770.531.6950
Text: 833.602.8497

PO Box 1579 • Gainesville GA 
30503

Credit and Debit Card Fees Apply

ASSESSED VALUE

95,600

WATERMARK ON THE 
LAKE, INC.

PROPERTY OWNER(S)

 Check here if making address change (see back)

AMOUNT  $_________________               EXPIRATION DATE  __________________

CARD #  ______________________________________________________________

CARD BILLING ZIP CODE  ________________________CVV____________________

CARDHOLDER PRINTED NAME  ___________________________________________

CARDHOLDER SIGNATURE  ______________________________________________

PHONE NUMBER  ______________________________________________________



TAX BILL #

2024-79068

MAP CODE

10007 000108

LOCATION

5910 WATERMARK CV

LEGAL DESCRIPTION:

DISTRICT

WATERMARK S/D PHASE 1 AMENITY AREA

1 
UNINCORPORATED

 2024 Property Tax Statement

BUILDING  +

119,500

LAND VALUE  =

14,100 133,600

 FAIR MARKET VALUE x 40%   =

ACREAGE

2.9

EXEMPTIONS

TAXING ENTITY
ASSESSED  -

VALUE
LESS  = 

EXEMPTIONS
TAXABLE  x

VALUE
MILLAGE  =

RATE
GROSS  -

TAX CREDITS =
NET
TAX

 GROSS COUNTY M&O 53440 0 53440 5.573 297.82 0.00 172.82 

      SALES TAX CREDIT 0 0 53440 -2.339 0.00 -125.00 0.00 

 SCHOOL M&O 53440 0 53440 14.99 801.07 0.00 801.07 

 SCHOOL BOND 53440 0 53440 1 53.44 0.00 53.44 

 GROSS UNINC FIRE 53440 0 53440 3.637 194.36 0.00 128.25 

      INSURANCE PREMIUM 
CREDIT

0 0 53440 -1.237 0.00 -66.11 0.00 

 EMERGENCY SERVICES 53440 0 53440 0.571 30.51 0.00 30.51 

 DEVELOPMENT SERVICES 53440 0 53440 1.18 63.06 0.00 63.06 

 PARKS & LEISURE SERVICES 53440 0 53440 0.437 23.35 0.00 23.35 

 SOLID WASTE FEE 0 0 0 0 75.00 0.00 75.00 

 STREET LIGHT FEE 0 0 0 0 149.70 0.00 149.70 

TOTAL 23.8120 $1,688.31 -$191.11 $1,497.20

Darla Eden CPA TAX COMMISSIONER 
Richard Steele CHIEF DEPUTY TAX COMMISSIONER 

 Penalty

 Interest

 2024 Current Due

 Other Fees

$1,497.20

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

 TOTAL DUE $0.00

 Previous Payments $1,497.20

WATERMARK ON THE LAKE, INC.
c/o AMAG
P. O. BOX 491537

LAWRENCEVILLE, GA  30049

 Delinquent Tax as of Billing Date $0.00

PAYMENT 
OPTIONS
Online: www.hallcountytax.org
(American Express, Discover, MasterCard, Visa, PayPal, E-Check)
By Mail: Check, American Express, Discover, MasterCard, Visa 
accepted. 
In Person: (Appointments preferred, limited walk-in availability): 
Hall County Government Center | 2875 Browns Bridge Rd | 
Gainesville GA 30504 M-F 8am-5pm
Drive-Up Drop Box: (Available 24/7) Located across from front 
doors at the Hall County Government Center under the breezeway.

2024 Property Tax Statement

Darla Eden CPA TAX COMMISSIONER 

Richard Steele CHIEF DEPUTY TAX COMMISSIONER
PO Box 1579 • Gainesville GA 30503 

BILL #

2024-79068

MAP CODE

10007 000108

DESCRIPTION

WATERMARK S/D PHASE 1 AMENITY AREA

DUE DATE

11/15/2024

TOTAL DUE

$0.00

LOCATION

5910 WATERMARK CV

Make check payable to Hall County Tax Commissioner and include 
bill number on check.  Payments by American Express, Discover, 
MasterCard, Visa accepted.  Please fill out information below and 
return by mail, place in drop box or email: 

www.hallcountytax.org
propertytax@hallcounty.org

Phone: 770.531.6950
Text: 833.602.8497

PO Box 1579 • Gainesville GA 
30503

Credit and Debit Card Fees Apply

ASSESSED VALUE

53,440

WATERMARK ON THE 
LAKE, INC.

PROPERTY OWNER(S)

 Check here if making address change (see back)

AMOUNT  $_________________               EXPIRATION DATE  __________________

CARD #  ______________________________________________________________

CARD BILLING ZIP CODE  ________________________CVV____________________

CARDHOLDER PRINTED NAME  ___________________________________________

CARDHOLDER SIGNATURE  ______________________________________________

PHONE NUMBER  ______________________________________________________
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