
Allied Paving Ryals Brothers ER Snell Bartow Paving
SCORES Pendergrass, GA Lula, GA Snellville, GA Cartersville, GA
Average Technical Scores 172.22 161.11 172.22 NO BID
Average Cost Scores 800.00 600.00 266.67 NO BID
Total Scores 972.22 761.11 438.89 NO BID
Base Bid $2,032,006.20 $2,973,432.61 $3,060,080.75 NO BID
Net Change for Alternate 1 ($978,889.20) ($1,833,504.54) ($660,878.20) NO BID
Net Total $1,053,117.00 $1,139,928.07 $2,399,202.55 NO BID

Number of bids emailed 90
Number of bids emailed to Hall Co 21
Total responses 4
Number of Hall Co responses 1
No Bids 1

RFQ/P #45-025 Whitehall Road Improvements at Healan's Head's Mill
Bid Tab Summary
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