Uniforms Unlimited

EXHIBIT C - MANDATORY COST PROPOSAL

HALL COUNTY GOVERNMENT

FINANCIAL SERVICES

IFB #010-46, SHERIFF UNIFORM SUPPLY ANNUAL CONTRACT

Item#	Description	PRICE
Badges ar	nd Bars	

	Badges and Bars		
1	1ST LIEUTENANT. BADGE Blackington, GOLD	\$	92.00
2	BADGE-SHERIFF Blackington B682, GOLD	\$	85.00
3	BADGE-CHIEF DEPUTY - Blackington B682, GOLD	\$	85.00
4	BADGE-MAJOR Blackington B682, GOLD	\$	85.00
5	BADGE-CAPTAIN Blackington B682, GOLD	\$	85.00
6	BADGE-LIEUTENANT Blackington B682, GOLD	\$	85.00
7	BADGE-SGT Blackington B682, GOLD	\$	85.00
8	BADGE-INVESTIGATOR Blackington B682, GOLD	\$	85.00
9	BADGE-DEPUTY Blackington B682, GOLD	\$	85.00
10	NAME PLATE Blackington, GOLD	\$	17.00
11	NAME PLATE Blackington, SILVER	\$	17.00
12	COLLAR BRASS-SO GOLD, Symbo Arts, S.O., GOLD	\$	14.00
13	COLLAR BRASS-HC SILVER Symbo Arts, H.C., SILVER	\$	14.00
14	COLLAR BRASS-HC GOLD Symbol Arts, H.C., GOLD	\$	14.00
15	COLLAR BRASS-SO SILVER Symbol Arts, S.O., SILVER	\$	14.00
16	HAT BADGE-GOLD SYMBOL ARTS GOLD	NO BID	
17	HAT BADGE-SILVER, SYMBOL ARTS, SILVER	NO BID	
18	HAT COVER, Flying Cross, COVER, Black	\$	10.00
	Clothing - No exceptions where noted		
19	CLASS A PANTS -MEN'S FLYING CROSS, BLACK POLYESTER-3900-10		
	List prices for sizes: 28-40	\$	49.50
1	List prices for oversizes: 42-52	\$	58.00
20	CLASS A DANTS WOMEN'S FLYING CROSS PLACK POLYECTER 2000W 10		
20	CLASS A PANTS -WOMEN'S FLYING CROSS, BLACK POLYESTER 3900W-10	6	10.50
	List prices for sizes: 2-20	\$	49.50
	List prices for oversizes: 22-24	\$	58.00
21	CLASS A SHIRT - MEN'S L/S, FLYING CROSS, SILVER TAN 33W78Z-04		
1	List prices for sizes: 14 - 20	\$	61.00
	List prices for oversizes: 20-22	\$	75.00
22	CLASS A SHIRT - WOMEN'S L/S, FLYING CROSS, SILVER TAN 126R78Z-04		
	List prices for sizes: 30 - 48	\$	61.00
	List prices for oversizes:	\$	75.00
24	CLASS A CHIEF. MACNIS SIS ELVING CROSS SILVER CERTIFICA		
24	CLASS A SHIRT - MEN'S S/S, FLYING CROSS, Silver Tan 85R78Z-04 List prices for sizes: 14 -21	\$	53.00
1	100 p. 1000 (01 01203) 17 E1	7	33.00

	List prices for oversizes:	\$	63.00
25	CLASS A SHIRT WOMEN'S, S/S, FILYING CROSS, SILVER TAN 176R78Z-04		
23	List prices for sizes: 1432-48	\$	53.00
	List prices for oversizes:	\$	63.00
		-	03.00
26	Ties		
26a	CLASS A TIE-20" LENGTH Samual Broome, Black	\$	8.00
26b	CLASS A TIE-22" LENGTH Samual Broome, Black	\$	8.00
26c	CLASS A TIE - SIZE 14.5 Samual Broome, Black	\$	7.00
28	CLASS C MEN'S BLACK POLO, 5.11, 71049-019		
	List prices for sizes: S - XL	\$	39.00
	List prices for oversizes: 2XL - 4XL	\$	42.00
	and production overlaness. Ext. The	Ť	72.00
29	CLASS C WOMEN'S BLACK POLO, 5.11, 61165-019		
	List prices for sizes: S - XL	\$	39.00
	List prices for oversizes: 2XL - 4XL	\$	42.00
30	BLAUER MEN'S TACTICAL PANTS, BLACK, 8666		
	List prices for sizes: 30 - 40	no bid	
	List prices for oversizes: 42 - 58	no bid	
31	BLAUER WOMEN'S TACTICAL PANTS, BLK 8666W		
	List prices for sizes: 2 - 16	no bid	
	List prices for oversizes:16-20	no bid	
22	DIALIED MENUCLIS FULL SUIDT ST. T. OSTA		
32	BLAUER MEN'S L/S FULL SHIRT - Silver Tan 8671		
	List prices for sizes: S - XL	no bid	
	List prices for oversizes: 2XL - 4XL	no bid	
33	BLAUER WOMEN'S L/S FULL SHIRT - Silver Tan 8671w		
	List prices for sizes: S - XL	no bid	
	List prices for oversizes: 2XL - 4XL	no bid	
34	BLAUER MEN'S S/S FULL SHIRT - Silver Tan 8676		
	List prices for sizes: S - XL	no bid	
	List prices for oversizes: 2XL - 4XL	no bid	
35	BLAUER WOMEN'S S/S FULL SHIRT - Silver Tan 8676W		
55	List prices for sizes: S - XL	no bid	
	List prices for oversizes: 2XL - 4XL	no bid	
	LIST PRICES FOR OVERSIZES. ZAL - HAL	no bia	
36	BLAUER MEN'S S/S SHIRT, 8676, BLACK		{
	List prices for sizes: S - XL	no bid	
	· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·		

	List prices for oversizes: 2XL - 4XL	no hid
	LIST PINCES TOT OVERSIZES. ZAL - 4AL	no bid
37	BLAUER MEN'S L/S SHIRT 8671, BLACK	
	List prices for sizes: S - XL	no bid
	List prices for oversizes: 2XL - 4XL	no bid
38	PLATIER MOMENTS SIS STUDY OCTOM, DUAGY	
38	BLAUER WOMEN'S S/S SHIRT 8676W, BLACK List prices for sizes: S - XL	
	List prices for sizes: 5 - XL List prices for oversizes: 2XL - 4XL	no bid no bid
	LIST prices for oversizes. ZAL - 4AL	no bia
39	BLAUER WOMEN'S L/S SHIRT 8671W, BLACK	
	List prices for sizes: S - XL	
	List prices for oversizes: 2XL - 4XL	
40	BELLEVILLE BOOTS - MEN'S KHYBER SIDE ZIP, Black	
	Shoe Size: 4.0 - 8.5	\$ 130.00
	Shoe Size: 9.0 - 12.0	\$ 130.00
	Shoe Size: 12.5 - 15.0	\$ 130.00
41	CAMPAIGN HAT- STRATTON, 10DB, Black	
	Hat Sizes: 6 1/2 - 8	\$ 96.00
42	CAMPAIGN HAT ACORNS-GOLD, Flying Cross, ACORNS, Gold	\$ 9.50
43	CAMPAIGN HAT STRAPS, Flying Cross, Strap, Black	\$ 9.00
44	HAT COVER, Flying Cross, COVER, Black	\$ 9.00
45	5.11 SIERRA BRAVO NYLON DUTY BELT - SIERRA BRAVO 59505	
	List prices for sizes: S - XL	\$ 47.50
	List prices for oversizes: 2XL - 5XL	\$ 55.00
46	5.11 SIERRA BRAVO REPLACEMENT BUCKLE, SB BUCKLE, BLACK	\$ 6.50
47	5.11 SIERRA BRAVO REPLACEMENT BELT KEEPERS, SB BELT	\$ 11.50
48	HALTZ TRAFFIC GLOVES FULL FINGER, HighVisibility	
48a	HNT501 - SMALL	no bid
48b	HNT502- MEDIUM	no bid
48c	HNT503- LARGE	no bid
48d	HNT504-XL	no bid
48e	HNT505-XXL	no bid
48f	HNT506-XXXL	no bid
49	TRAFFIC VEST- 2, Reflective Apparel, Yellow	\$ 47.00

50	HANDCUFFS, Smith and Wesson, M100, Silver	\$ 32.00
51	HANDCUFF CASE-NYLON, SIERRA BRAVO, Black	\$ 17.25
52	HANDCUFF KEY W/ KEYCHAIN, Zak Tool, ZT11P, Black	\$ 7.00
53	HANDCUFF KEY W/CLIP, Zak Tool, ZT14, Black	\$ 7.00
54	PATCH REMOVAL	\$ 3.00
55	PATCH REPLACEMENT	\$ 4.00
56	HEMMING	\$ 7.00
57	UNIFORM REPAIR	\$ 10.00

.

~