RFQ/P #46-006 Banking and Investment Services - Rebid

Bid Tabulation Summary

Bid Opening Date: 04/17/2025

Scores Out of 1,000 Total Maximum Points Available

. . First Citizen JP MORGAN / SouthState .
Bidders AmerisBank Truist Wells Fargo
Bank Chase Bank
. . . Atlanta, GA / . .
Location Oakwood, GA | Gainesville, GA Gainesville, GA Atlanta, GA Atlanta, GA
Charlotte, NC
Average Technical Scores 737.65 701.91 761.37 719.08 738.02 816.04
Average Cost Scores 26.04 70.06 31.32 30.51 34.05 44,58
Total Scores 763.69 771.97 792.69 749.59 772.07 860.62
TALLY:
Banks Contacted: 13
Hall County Invitations: 13
Bids Received: 6
No Bids: 4

BANKS RESPONDING:

AMERIS

FIRST CITIZEN

JP Morgan / Chase

SOUTHSTATE

Truist

WELLS FARGO

NO BIDS:

Bank of America - No bid

CADENCE BANK - No bid

PINNACLE BANK - No bid

Renasant - No bid

NO RESPONSES:

Community Bank & Trust - No response

PEACH STATE - No response

Regions Bank - No response




