
SCORES Pond & Company
Alta Planning + 

Design Inc
Keck & Wood 

Inc.
RS&H, Inc.

Goodwyn Mills 
Cawood, LLC

Tunnell-Spangler & 
Associates (TSW)

Croy Engineering

Civil 
Engineering 
Consultants, 

Inc

Chattahoochee 
Group

Peachtree Corners, GA Atlanta, GA Duluth, GA Atlanta, GA Augusta, GA Peachtree Corners, GA Marietta, GA Marietta, GA Clermont, GA
Average Technical Scores 697.78 675.56 684.44 657.78 604.44 608.89 577.78 395.56 NO BID
Average Cost Scores 190.00 160.00 140.00 160.00 80.00 60.00 70.00 20.00 NO BID
Total Scores 887.78 835.56 824.44 817.78 684.44 668.89 647.78 415.56 NO BID
Cost $75,000.00 $88,430.00 $92,000.00 $87,500.00 $114,600.00 $129,500.00 $114,040.00 $37,000.00 NO BID

Number of bids emailed 70
Number of bids emailed to Hall Co 7
Total responses 8
Number of Hall Co responses 0
No Bids 1

RFP #46-013 Highlands to Islands Trail Study - UNG to McEver
Bid Tab Summary
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