RFP #46-019 911 Public Safety Technology Consultant

Bid Tab Summary

TSG Public Saf Federal Engineerin Mission Critial Winbour ADCOMM TUSA Consultin National Publi
SCORES s:dvl:s':)r(;,st:ty eers Ini see Pasrst:er:, LtLZ Consul:t?:g,cfnc Engin::ring LLC ;Jesrvi::::s Isll,'| :ch Gartner, Inc. DELTAWRX LLC Sae\tf:tya Gr::pc
Tallahassee, FL Fairfax, VA Port Matilda, PA | Arlington, VA Sandy, OR Liberty, MO Stamford, CT Woodland Hills, CA | Aberdeen, NC
Average Technical Scores 658.84 550.60 585.90 534.13 529.43 475.31 517.66 465.89 NO BID
Average Cost Scores 160.00 150.00 90.00 130.00 100.00 90.00 40.00 80.00 NO BID
Total Scores 818.84 700.60 675.90 664.13 629.43 565.31 557.66 545.89 NO BID
Lump Sum Bid $140,000.00 $197,736.00 $305,000.00 $125,000.00 | $397,097.00 $250,000.00 $688,725.00 $329,985.00 NO BID

Number of companies emailed

Number of Hall Co companies emailed

Total responses

Number of Hall Co responses

No Bids
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