
2022, 2023, and 2024 Refund Request

Personal Property Account – 336293

Valentin Pashnyak

2002 Carver Yacht

Mr. Pashnyak recently provided a copy of the bill of sale for the 2002 Carver Yacht dated 

June 18, 2021.  He is requesting a refund for tax years 2022, 2023, and 2024.

As the bill of sale supports the 2021 sale, we recommend the request be approved and 

forwarded to BOC.

Attached are supporting documents including the bill of sale, request for refund, and the 

TCO spreadsheet listing refund amounts. 
 
The marina had him listed as a 2000 Carver, which was his friend's boat.  When he 
 bought the 1998 Carver, he registered it in Gwinnett County.  
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Good afternoon,

Thank you for the update.

I’m requesting a refund for the years 2022, 2023, and 2024. Since the boat was sold on 6/18/2021, I understand that I’m still
responsible for the 2021 taxes in full.

Additionally, I want to ensure that I’m not billed for 2025 moving forward.

On Mon, Jul 14, 2025 at 1:06 ?PM Rebecca Rainey (Tax Assessors) <rrainey@hallcounty.org> wrote:

Good afternoon,

 

We have your refund request and will begin the process.  Nicole Griffin is our refund coordinator and will be keeping in touch
with you with any information as far as scheduling goes.  For the record, could you please list out the years you are requesting a
refund for?  Keep in mind that if you sold the boat after 1/1/2021 you would still be responsible for 2021 taxes in full.

 

Thank you,

 

Rebecca Rainey

Personal Property Manager

Hall County Board of Assessors
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From: Valentin Pashnyak <valentin@911applianceemt.com> 
Sent: Monday, July 14, 2025 11:02 AM
To: Blake Brooks (Tax Assessors) <bbrooks@hallcounty.org>; personal.property <personal.property@hallcounty.org>;
Christopher L. Daugherty <cldaugherty@hallcounty.org>; Jennifer Dorsey (Tax Assessors) <jdorsey@hallcounty.org>
Subject: Proof of Sale and Tax Reimbursement Request

 

Hi Blake,

About a month ago, I visited your office and paid off some outstanding liens on a boat that I hadn’t paid taxes on. At that time,
your office requested a bill of sale as proof of the transaction.

I’ve gone through my old records and was finally able to locate it. The boat was sold to Johnathan Savoy on June 18, 2021.
His address is 2725 Cambridge Ct, Cumming, GA 30041.

During my last conversation with Jennifer Dorsey, she mentioned that if I paid the lien and later found the bill of sale, I could be
reimbursed for the taxes paid after the sale. I’ve attached both the bill of sale and the receipt for the taxes I paid.

Please let me know if you need any more information from me to process the reimbursement.

Best regards,
Valentin Pashnyak
1865 Buford Dam Rd
Buford, GA 30518
404-884-236
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Emergency Master Technician
Appliance Repair & Maintenance 

Tel:  877-649-9777

 

 

 

 

***NOTICE*** This communication is for use by the intended recipient(s) and contains information that may be confidential,
privileged, attorney work product or otherwise exempt from disclosure under applicable law. If you are not the intended
recipient(s), you are hereby formally notified that any use, copying or distribution of this communication, in whole or in part, is
strictly prohibited. If you have received this message in error, or are not the intended recipient(s), please immediately notify
sender by reply e-mail and delete this message and any attachments without retaining a copy. This communication does not
constitute consent to the use of sender's contact information for direct marketing purposes or for transfers of data to third
parties.

tel:(404) 884-2222


Account

Year Original Value Corrected Value Difference Estimated County Refund Interest, Penalty, Fifa Refund

2022 91,665 0 91,665 $1,417.24 $943.09 $474.15

2023 91665 0 91,665 $1,271.97 $904.57 $367.40

2024 91665 0 91,665 $998.68 $873.09 $125.59

Total: $3,687.89 $2,720.75 $967.14

Base Refund

336293
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