
SCORES Scroggs & Grizzel 
Contracting

Hogan Construction 
Group

J Davis 
Construction

Graphite 
Construction LLC

ProTech General 
Construction Inc

Crown Retail 
Services Inc

Beam Team 
Construction Inc

Pencor LLC Multiplex LLC
Amacher Bros 

Construction Co
NPSG Built LLC

Projerac 
Mechanical 

LLC

Sol Construction 
LLC

Carroll Daniel 
Construction

Clermont, GA Peachtree Corners, GA Anderson, SC Cartersville, GA Alpharetta, GA Gainesville, GA Alpharetta, GA Alpharetta, GA Duluth, GA Atlanta, GA Woodstock, GA Atlanta, GA Atlanta, GA Gainesville, GA
Average Technical Scores 616.00 637.00 577.50 574.00 609.00 546.00 532.00 598.50 458.50 556.50 472.50 Disqualified NO BID NO BID
Average Cost Scores 300.00 165.00 195.00 165.00 120.00 180.00 165.00 60.00 165.00 60.00 60.00 Disqualified NO BID NO BID
Total Scores 916.00 802.00 772.50 739.00 729.00 726.00 697.00 658.50 623.50 616.50 532.50 Disqualified NO BID NO BID
Cost $1,609,000.00 $1,860,000.00 $1,678,132.00 $1,859,040.00 $1,920,798.00 $1,745,306.00 $1,872,333.00 $2,073,310.00 $1,843,000.00 $2,121,000.00 $2,078,628.00

Number of bids emailed 19
Number of bids emailed to Hall Co 9
Total responses 14
Number of Hall Co responses 3
No Bids 2

RFQ/P #46-021 Remodel HCGC 3rd Floor
Bid Tab Summary
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