Ohmshiv Azimuth c W't's°':. | fBactkb°:'e Strickland & Sons | Chattahoochee
ITB #021-46 Athens Street Corridor Construction, LLC | Construction, LLC onstruction nirastructure, Pipeline, Inc Group Inc
. ’ ’ Management, LLC LLC ’
Pedestrian Improvements
Lawrenceville, GA Suwanee, GA Norcross, GA Buford, GA Gainesville, GA Clermont, GA
ITEM DESCRIPTION PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE NO BID
Phase | $1,930,899.25 $2,313,232.67 $2,260,065.20 $1,885,974.27 $4,751,928.30 NO BID
Phase | Alternate $33,140.80 $23,962.62 $29,211.60 $29,459.78 $62,288.10 NO BID
Phase I $797,267.58 $518,776.57 $644,552.20 $802,344.83 $1,226,287.40 NO BID
Number of companies emailed 32
Number of Hall Co companies emailed 11

Total responses

Number of Hall Co responses

No Bids
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