
SCORES Midwest Tape LLC
Childrens Plus Inc 

(dba Libraria)
Ingram Library

Mackin Book 
Company

The Library 
Supply

Follett Content 
Solutions, LLC

Holland, OH Beecher, IL LaVergne, TN Burnsville, MN Miami Lakes, FL McHenry, IL
Average Technical Scores 780.00 740.00 713.33 700.00 NO BID NO BID
Average Cost Scores 75.00 91.67 83.33 37.50 NO BID NO BID
Total Scores 855.00 831.67 796.67 737.50 NO BID NO BID
Books N/A $205,320.00 $208,560.00 $0.00
A/V $39,015.00 N/A N/A $0.00
Total Cost $39,015.00 $205,320.00 $208,560.00 $0.00

*Note 1*: Children's Plus (Libraria) is able to meet new expedited deadline.
*Note 2*: Mackin did not provide an adequate and consistent pricing structure.

Number of bids emailed 14
Number of bids emailed to Hall Co 0
Total responses 6
Number of Hall Co responses 0
No Bids 2
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