
SCORES Ace Comfort LLC
JR Hobbs Co - 

Atlanta
Conditioned Air 

Systems, Inc
B&W Mechanical 

Contractors

Lawson Air 
Conditioning and 

Plumbing, Inc.

Capital City Mechanical 
Services, LLC

Blount 
Mechanical 

Contractors Inc.

Stiles Heating 
and Cooling, 

Inc.

Total Comfort 
Solutions dba 

Dynamiq

Lanier HVAC 
Services

Maxair 
Mechanical, 

LLC

Southern 
Mechanical HVAC 
Contractors, LLC

Wes Winkler Air 
Conditioning LLC

Trane US Inc 5 Seasons Mechanical LLC
Daikin Applied 
Americas Inc

Entek Solutions HVAC Allies LLC
Your AC 

Company LLC
Dirania 

Consulting
Service First 

HVAC
Valhalla 

Mechanical

Gainesville, GA Lawrenceville, GA Gainesville, GA Lawrenceville, GA Gainesville, GA Peachtree Corners, GA Bogart, GA Bogart, GA Braselton, GA Gainesville, GA Marietta, GA Athens, GA Gainesville, GA Atlanta, GA Peachtree Corners, GA Marietta, GA Buford, GA Ellenwood, GA Cumming, GA Dacula, GA Atlanta, GA Gainesville, GA
Average Technical Scores 800.00 800.00 800.00 800.00 800.00 800.00 791.67 791.67 791.67 800.00 775.00 725.00 775.00 775.00 741.67 691.67 658.33 616.67 566.67 400.00 NO BID NO BID
Average Cost Scores 200.00 200.00 166.67 150.00 100.00 100.00 100.00 100.00 66.67 50.00 66.67 100.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 33.33 0.00 16.67 50.00 200.00 NO BID NO BID
Total Scores 1000.00 1000.00 966.67 950.00 900.00 900.00 891.67 891.67 858.33 850.00 841.67 825.00 775.00 775.00 741.67 725.00 658.33 633.33 616.67 600.00 NO BID NO BID
Cost

Number of companies emailed 46
Number of Hall Co Companies emailed 21
Total responses 22
Number of Hall Co responses 8
No Bids 2

Bid Tab Summary

RFQ/P #47-007 Demand Services for On-Call HVAC Contractors
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