of Bids Received

Uniform Purchase Annual Contract

Uniforms Unlimited

Federal Eastern International

GT Di:

'Smyrna Police Distributors

Strongpoint, LLC

S.T.AR. Apparel & Plastics

T & T Uniforms, Inc.

Annual Contract

IFB 015-47 Smyrna, GA Gainesville, GA Oakwood, GA Austell, GA Athens, GA Jacksonville, FL Plugerville, TX
# Description Price (EA) Notes Price (EA)| _ Notes Price (EA) Notes Price (EA) Notes Price (EA) Notes Price (EA) Notes Price (EA) Notes
1 5.11 2110?;"'5 Rapid Performance S/S Polo Shirt, | 404 | g5, g9 S3XL $55.00 S3XL $55.00 S-3XL $50.00 S3XL $42.50 S3XL $40.04 S3XL No Bid S3XL
2 511 5.1 Performance Polo Shirt, S5 #71049 700 | $50.00 XS-3XL $50.00 | XS-3XL $50.00 XS3XL $46.00 XS3XL $39.00 XS3XL $36.52 XS-3XL No Bid XS3XL
3 5.11 5.1 Tactical Tacite Pro S/S Shirl #7175 100 | $60.00 XS-3XL $65.00 | XS-3XL $65.00 XS-3XL $58.00 XS-3XL $51.00 XS-3XL $47.08 XS-3XL No Bid XS-3XL
4 5.11 s g fotcal polo- 100% cottonjersey | 50 | g53.00 S-axL $55.00 | S-4xL $55.00 S-3XL $50.00 S-3XL $42.50 S-4xL $40.04 S-3XL No Bid S-aXL
5 511 5.11 Men's Twil PDU S/S shirl #71183 20 | _s55.00 SAXL $60.00 | SAXL No Bid SaXL $60.25 SaXL $50.00 5-4XL_| Discontinued | S-4XL No Bid SAXL
6 511 5.1 Bike Patrol Polo Shirt, #7132 75 | s60.00 SIXL $65.00 | S-XL $65.00 SIXL $60.25 SIXL $52.00 S-axL $47.36 SIXL No Bid SaXL
7 511 5.11 Mens PDU Rapid Shirt SIS, #71332 10| Disconti $70.00 | S4xXL No Bid S-axL $54.00 SaXL $52.00 S-4XL_| Disconti SAXL No Bid SAXL
8 5.11 2711132”;" s Taclite TOU S/S shirt teflon treated, | 3 | pyocontinued $70.00 | XS-3XL No Bid XS-3XL $46.00 XS-3XL $39.00 S-3XL $69.05 XS-3XL No Bid XS-3XL
9 5.11 5.11 Taclte Pro Pan, Men's /S shirt, #74273 | 50 |  $60.00 30x30-44x34 | $65.00 |30x30-44x38|  $65.00 |30x30-44x34| $59.00 |30x30-44x3a|  s51.00 2844 $47.08 | 30x30-44x34 | NoBid | 30x30-44x34
10 5.11 g;;og”:"'s Tactical LIS Professional Polo Shirt, | 4, $58.00 S-3XL $60.00 S-3XL $60.00 S-3XL $54.00 S-3XL $46.50 S-3XL $43.57 S-3XL No Bid S3XL
11 5.11 271210};“‘“' Men's Performance L/S Polo Shirt, | - 5, $55.00 S3XL $55.00 S3XL $55.00 S-3XL $50.00 S3XL $42.50 S3XL $40.04 S3XL No Bid S3XL
2 511 5.1 Taclite Pro Shirt, #72175 20 | $66.00 SIXL $75.00 | SOXL $70.00 SIXL $64.00 SIXL $54.75 SIXL $50.88 SIXL No Bid SIXL
13 511 5.1 Mens PDU Rapid Shirt L/S #7217 10| Disconti $75.00 | SXL $75.00 SIXL $58.00 SIXL $48.50 S-3XL $47.08 S-XL No Bid SIXL
14 5.11 5.11 PDU Men's LS Class A shirt, tact, #72344 | 20 | Discontinued $65.00 | S-4xL No Bid S-axL $64.00 S-4xL $54.00 SaXL $72.84 S-4xL No Bid S-4xL
15 511 5.11 Men's Taclical Pant, #74251 700 | $60.00 3240 $70.00 | 3240 $70.00 3240 $64.00 3240 $55.00 S3XL__| Discontinued | 3240 No Bid 3240
16 5.11 5.11 Men's Taclite Pro Pant, #74273 200 | s60.00 32:50 $65.00 | 3250 $65.00 3250 $59.00 3250 $51.00 28-44 $36.52 32:50 No Bid 3250
17 5.11 5.1 Men's Stryke Pant, #74427 50 | $90.00 30-60 $100.00 | 30-60 $100.00 30-60 $92.00 30-60 $78.50 2844 $72.84 30-60 No Bid 30-60
18 5.11 g;‘:t\';g%ﬁgs Tactical Professional /S Polo | o5 $58.00 S3XL $65.00 S3XL No Bid S-3XL $50.00 S3XL $42.00 S3XL | Discontinued S3XL No Bid S3XL
19 5.11 i%z‘g"me”’s Performance Polo /S shirt, 20 $50.00 XS-3XL $50.00 | XS-3XL $50.00 XS-L $46.00 Xs-L $39.00 S-3XL $36.52 Xs-L No Bid XS-L
0 5.11 Women's PDU Twill Shirt, LS. #62064 20 | Disconti No Bid XL $54.00 S3XL__| Disconti XL No Bid XS-L
5.11 Women's Tacite Pro Pant, #64360 50 | $60.00 aRAGR $65.00 R aR-16R $51.00 2-20 $47.08 4R-16R No Bid 4R-16R
5.11 Women's Strvke Pant, #64402 50 | s92.00 4R-20R $100.00 | 4R-20R 4R20R 4R-20R $78.50 220 $72.84 4R-20R No Bid 4R20R
5.11 Women's Stryke Pant, #74369 50 | ss7.00 30x30-44x34 | $95.00 | 30x30-44x34 30x30-44x34] 30x30-44x34] $74.00 28-44 $68.51 | 30x30-44x34 | NoBid | 30x30-44x34
4 5.1 Tactical Rain Jacket, Unisex. #48098 10 | s250.00 XS-3XL $175.00 | XS-3XL X5-3XL X5-3XL $102.00 S-3XL__| Disconti XS-3XL No Bid XS-3XL
2 5.1 Sabre Jacket 2.0 - waterproof, #48112 10_|_s245.00 L2XL $300.00 | L2XL L2XL L2XL $235.00 S-aXL $212.45 L2XL No Bid L2XL
2 5.11 g eal ATLAS, Men's Traner shoes. | 0 | 130,00 4R14R No Bid No Bid discontinued Discontinued No Bid
27 5.11 S ractcel oo s ATAC. 208" side 2 | 59 | 120,00 5R-10R $135.00 | 5R-10R $135.00 5R-10R $117.00 5R-10R | discontinued $92.36 5R-10R No Bid 5R-10R
5 5.1 Sierra Bravo Keepers duty belt #59508 | 20 | $18.00 $15.00 $15.00 $13.00 $12.14 No Bid
9 Disconti No Bid No Bid No Bid discontinued Discontinued No Bid
0 Di No Bid No Bid No Bid i i Di il No Bid
1 Di No Bid No Bid No Bid discontinued Discontinued No Bid
32 5.1 5 Discontinued No Bid No Bid No Bid discontinued Discontinued No Bid
33 511 5 | o No Bid No Bid No Bid discontinued Discontinued No Bid
34 5.11 g tcal Serra bravo latex glove pouch 5 $23.00 No Bid $25.00 $21.00 $18.50 $17.27 No Bid
5 0 | Disconti No Bid No Bid No Bid discontinued Discontinued No Bid
6 5.11 Trainer Belt, 1.5 #59409 0| ss3.00 XS4XL $60.00 | XSAXL $60.00 XS-aXL $54.00 XS-4XL $46.00 $43.20 XS4XL No Bid XS-4XLC
7 5.11_Men's Duty Belt. #59505 0 | s65.00 XS-4XL $70.00 | XSAXL No Bid XS-4XL $66.00 XS4XL $55.00 $51.96 XS4XL No Bid XS-4XL
3 5.11_SB Handouff Cuff Pouch, #56246 0 | s22.00 $25.00 $25.00 $21.00 $18.50 s17.27 No Bid
9 5.11_Gas/Mace/Light Pouch, #56243 0 | s22.00 $25.00 $25.00 $21.00 $18.50 $17.27 No Bid
0 5.11 SB Dbl. Pistol Ma. Pouch, #56245 0 | s3s.00 $45.00 $35.00 $38.00 $32.00 $30.28 No Bid
1 5.11 Blk Radio Pouch, #56247 0 | s3s.00 No Bid $40.00 $34.00 $29.00 $27.30 No Bid
Men's cooling performance crew tee shirts, y ’ I )
42 A4 moisture polyester, #N3142 4 | $2400 S-axt No Bid $7.00 0D no bid No Bid No Bid
43 Alboum Hat Co. Campaign Hat Rain Cover - clear - L 1 $8.95 No Bid No Bid $6.00 $9.00 No Bid No Bid
44| American Body Armor | ABA Tac Carrier wi5 fixed pookets 1| _s400.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid o bid No Bid $375.00
‘Ameriglo Tall (Suppressor) sight set fts all glock
45 Ameriglo except 42, 43 variants, XL serrated 315" front, | 50 |  $42.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid no bid No Bid $36.47
flat black -394 rear, GL-429
% ASP-35710___|ASP Black tungsten, usb, flashiight 1 $80.00 $716.00 No Bid $138.75 $135.00 $97.70 $93.93
47 ASP-56140 | ASP Open top handouff case 1 $50.00 $46.40 No Bid $56.00 $43.50 $40.83 $37.57
48| AsP-w-Rssg  |ASP Rotating sidebreak baton scabbard for 26" | $60.00 $61.60 No Bid $74.00 $58.00 $52.35 $49.88
expandable batons
9 PFT-715-Blk-Round T No Bid $15.10 No Bid $16.00 $12.00 No Bid No Bid
50 | Bella+ Canvas _|Unisex Jersey SIS tes shirt 20 $7.00 XL No Bid $8.00 XC $7.00 XC $10.00 No Bid XC No Bid XC
51 Bella + Canvas Unisex Jersey S/S tee shirt 30 $9.00 2XL No Bid $10.25 2XL $7.00 2XL $10.00 No Bid 2XL No Bid 2XL
52 | Bianchi - BIA17390 |Bianchi 7300 AccuMold Covered cuff case 1 $34.00 No Bid No Bid $42.00 $32.00 No Bid $25.16
53 | Bianchi- BIA31301 E::é‘f“‘sz‘;o; PatrolTek double magazine pouch, | | b0 ioq No Bid No Bid No Bid $29.00 No Bid $22.95
54| Blackhawk - 44B351BK| Nylon belt keepers 2.25" double snap 1 $18.00 No Bid No Bid $21.00 $21.00 $13.55 $12.31
’ 'A2327-DE Rhodium Large Round Disc, BL- ’ " " "
55 Blackinton Josci 1 $40.00 No Bid No Bid $60.00 no bid $27.31 No Bid
A2547 Hi-Glo with applied emblem, red enamel,
56 Blackinton double clutch backing with 2 horn A2908, 1 $54.00 No Bid No Bid $58.00 no bid $40.26 No Bid
Division Chief Collar brass, BL-A2547-HG
A2547 Hi-Glo with applied emblem, red enamel,
57 Blackinton double clutch backing with 2 vertical horn A2908| 1 $54.00 No Bid No Bid $58.00 no bid $40.26 No Bid
2, Captain Colar brass, BL-A2547-HG
A2547 Hi-Glo with applied emblem, red enamel,
58 Blackinton double clutch backing with 3 horn A2907, 1 $54.00 No Bid No Bid $58.00 no bid $40.26 No Bid
Division Chief Collar brass, BL-A2547-HG




A2547 Hi-Glo with applied emblem, red enamel,

59 Blackinton double clutch backing with 4 horn A2006, Asst. | 1 $54.00 No Bid No Bid $58.00 no bid $40.26 No Bid
Chief Collar brass, BL-A2547-HG
'A2547 Hi-Glo with applied emblem, red enamel,
60 Blackinton double clutch backing with 5 horn A2905, Chief | 1 $54.00 No Bid No Bid $58.00 no bid $40.26 No Bid
Collar brass, BL-A2547-HG
’ 'A2817-DE Rhodium Lieutenant Hat, wired y - -
61 Blackinton B e o e 1 $68.00 No Bid No Bid $81.00 $63.00 $93.87 No Bid
B1160 Rho-Glo Finish, Block Blue lettering,
62 Blackinton CAPTAIN, Georgia seal, safety catch, BL- 1 $110.00 No Bid No Bid $130.00 $115.00 $93.87 No Bid
B1160-RG
B1160 Rho-Glo Finish, Block Blue lettering,
63 Blackinton DIVISION CHIEF, Georgia seal, safety catch, | 1 $110.00 No Bid No Bid $130.00 $115.00 $93.87 No Bid
BL-B1160-RG
o B1160 Rho-Glo Finish, Block Blue lettering, " " "
64 Blackinton e e e 1 $110.00 No Bid No Bid $130.00 $115.00 $93.87 No Bid
B547 Rho-Glo Finish, Block Black lettering,
65 Blackinton A3028 Seal with red enamel and siver rim, BL- | 1 $90.00 No Bid No Bid $134.00 $115.00 $77.37 No Bid
BS47RG
66 B682 Hi-Glo 6 point star badae, Hi-Glo, T $95.00 $159.50 No Bid $134.00 $120.00 $96.33 No Bid
67 Blackinton j;gl_’;’“e”ca" Flag Bar Rhodium, 2 Nail, BL- | $20.00 $25.10 No Bid $21.00 $18.00 $15.37 No Bid
8 AT A4117 - Medal of Valor 7 $77.00 $98.50 No Bid $83.00 $75.00 $59.59 No Bid
69 | Blackinton - J61 Bars |Blackinton P1300-GId-X-CBRASS 1 $13.00 $11.60 No Bid $10.50 $8.00 §7.24 No Bid
70 ~J63 Bars P1302-Gld-X-CBRASS 1 $13.00 $11.60 No Bid $10.50 $8.00 §7.24 No Bid
[ 71 [ Biackinton Awardbar # Ad616, F-GT 1 $23.00 $25.1 No Bid $21.00 18.00 g No Bid
7 inton Awardbar_|Award Bar. Blackinton # AB392, D-GT 1 $23.00 $25.1 No Bid $21.00 18.00 No Bid
[ 73 | Blackinton Awardbar_|Award Bar. Blackinton # A8392. C-GT 1 $23.00 $25.1 No Bid $21.00 18.00 No Bid
74 inton Awardbar | Award Bar. #A8392. E-GT 1 $23.00 $25.1 No Bid $21.00 18.00 No Bid
75 | Biackinton Awardbar #A4616, G-GT 1 $23.00 $25.1 No Bid $21.00 18.00 No Bid
7 inton Awardbar #A4616. W-GT 1 $23.00 $25.1 No Bid $21.00 18.00 No Bid
77 | Blackinton Awardbar #ABO74, B-GT 1 $23.00 $25.1 No Bid $21.00 18.00 No Bid
78 inton Awardbar #ABOT4, GT 1 $23.00 $25.1 No Bid $21.00 18.00 No Bid
79 [ Blackinton Awardbar _|Biackinton # A8285. A-GT 1 $23.00 $25.1 No Bid $21.00 18.00 No Bid
0 inton Awardbar # AB285, GT 1 $23.00 $25.1 No Bid $21.00 18.00 No Bid
81 [ Biackinton Awardbar #A11272, GT award bar 1 $23.00 $25.1 No Bid $21.00 18.00 No Bid
82 inton Awardbar #A4616. C-Rhodium 1 $23.00 $25.1 No Bid $21.00 18.00 No Bid
83 | Blackinton Awardbar #A4616. E-GT 1 $23.00 $25.1 No Bid $21.00 18.00 g No Bid
84 inton Awardbar | Bravery Medal, # AB365, KK-GA 1 $180.00 $291.50 No Bid $210.00 $220.00 $351.45 No Bid
85 | Blackinton Badge _|Blackinton 1627DE - Gold - GA 1 $115.00 $157.50 No Bid $210.00 $95.00 $118.02 No Bid
86 inton Badae B682 - HC - Gunmt - GA 1 $65.00 $99.70 No Bid $241.00 $69.00 $56.52 No Bid
87 | Blackinton Badge _|Blackinton B682 - HC - Higlo - GA 1 $95.00 $159.50 No Bid $132.00 $115.00 $96.58 No Bid
88 inton Badae 956 - Hiclo-GA 1 $105.00 $168.50 No Bid $141.00 $110.00 $101.76 No Bid
. Blackinton Purple Heart Medal KK-GA - " "
89 | Blackinton Badge | io 1 $125.00 $171.00 No Bid $141.00 $125.00 $102.26 No Bid
% Bar Holder #SBIAGT 7 $9.00 $7.10 No Bid $7.00 75.00 $4.53 No Bid
91 | Blakinton Bar Holder [Blackinton # SB2 1 $9.00 $8.60 No Bid $8.00 15.00 $5.43 No Bid
92 i Bar Holder # SB3- 1 $9.00 10.00 No Bid $9.00 15.00 $6.27 No Bid
93 | Blackinton Bar Holder [Blackinton # SB4- 1 $18.00 16.40 No Bid $14.00 15.00 13 No Bid
o4 inton Bar Holder #SB5-AGT 1 $18.00 18.00 No Bid $16.00 15.00 09 No Bid
95 | Blackinton Bar Holder [Blackinton # SB6- 1 $20.00 19.50 No Bid $17.25 15.00 .00 No Bid
% inton Bar Holder #SBT-AGT 1 $23.00 $26.10 No Bid $22.75 15.00 .57 No Bid
' Blackinton #V801 Clear Pocket Carrier with " " " "
97 | Blackinton ID Badge g b 1 $140.00 No Bid No Bid $171.00 $49.00 No Bid No Bid
% Medal Distinguished Service Metal, #A2619 | 1 $125.00 $142.00 No Bid $119.00 $110.00 No Bid No Bid
99 | Blackinton Namebar J3-GOLD-BLK letter 7 $18.00 $19.90 No Bid $17.00 $17.00 $12.99 No Bid
100 Namebar J3-SIL-BLK letter 1 $18.00 $19.90 No Bid $17.00 $17.00 $12.99 No Bid
101 | Blackinton Namebar |Blackinton-A2388 - Gold letter 1 $25.00 $30.80 No Bid $26.00 $35.00 $18.80 No Bid
102 | Blackinton Namebar |Blackinton-V801 Gold Plate 1 $32.00 N°::r:g§;‘r“s‘ No Bid No Bid $66.00 $49.00 No Bid No Bid
. gold plate and Rhodium N - N
103 plate | SO e e 1 $19.00 $30.80 No Bid $26.00 $17.00 No Bid No Bid
04 Cherokee Roval blue scrub pants. #4200 0 | _NoBid SAXL No Bid No Bid No Bid $14.40 No Bid No Bid
o Cherokee V neck roval blue scrub top, #1645 50 | NoBid SAXL No Bid No Bid No Bid $16.20 No Bid No Bid
o Condor Condor Summit Softshell iacket 2 No Bid SIXL $123.99 | SOXL No Bid SIXL $114.00 SIXL o bid $86.48 SIXL No Bid SIXL
0 Condor Condor XPC Exo Plate Carrier T No Bid $111.95 No Bid $102.00 o bid $77.20 No Bid
108 Condor Condor Double Kangaroo Mag Pouch, black 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid $19.25 no bid $17.33 No Bid
#MAS51-002
100 Cornerstone :g;‘;? Class 3 water resist windbreaker, 5 $55.00 SXL $§75.00 L-4XL $56.95 L-4xXL $55.00 L-4XL $46.00 No Bid L-4XL No Bid L-4XL
710 | Comerstone | Duck cloth hooded work jacket, #7631 5 $65.00 SXL $96.00 | LAXL $68.95 LaxXL $68.00 LaXL $57.00 No Bid XL No Bid XL
1 Comerstone |19 Focketiess polo shift, safety yelow, 10 | s23.00 SXL No Bid $20.00 L3xL $17.00 LaxL | discontinued No Bid LaxL No Bid LaxL
Cormerstone | Tactical SIS shirt #CS403 0 | _sz.00 SL No Bid $15.50 SL $17.00 ST fsconti No Bid S No Bid S
Comerstone | Tactical S/S shirt, #GS411 0 | sa2.00 SXC $25.00 | SAXL $34.75 SAXL $30.00 SAXC $26.00 No Bid SAXC No Bid SaXC
4 Comerstone | Snaa Proof S/S shirt, #CS412 0 |_s33.00 SXL $25.00 | S4XL $20.75 SaXL $26.00 SAXL $26.00 No Bid SAXL No Bid SAXL
Comerstone ___[Women's snag-proof polo shit, #CS413 0 | 3300 SXL $40.00 | SAXL $20.75 SAXL $26.00 SAXL $22.00 No Bid SAXL No Bid SAXL
o Dammer Danner en' Acadi unisusted nkor 525, 1o | 509 No Bid No Bid $417.00 o bid No Bid No Bid
17 Danner 10 | Discontinued No Bid No Bid No Bid no bid No Bid No Bid
718 Dickie's Dickie's Pant, #DCK-874 50 | NoBi No Bid No Bid $35.00 $31.00 No Bid No Bid
o Dutyman 15" Black basketweave veicro e Uy bet. | 10 | 4200 No Bid No Bid $36.00 s27.50 No Bid e
#DUT-5121U
120|  Eiseman-Ludmar |20 & BLKC~ M Captain collarbrass, 1 $14.00 No Bid No Bid $10.00 $8.00 No Bid No Bid
721 | _Eiseman-Ludmar__|Gold-X and BLK collar brass, #E1S-2078 T $14.00 No Bid No Bid $10.00 $8.00 No Bid No Bid
122 | Eiseman-Ludmar | Gold and BLK collar brass. #EIS-2080A 1 $14.00 No Bid No Bid $13.00 $8.00 No Bid No Bid
123 | _Eiseman-Ludmar__|Gold-X and BLK colar brass, #E1S-2087 1 $14.00 No Bid No Bid $10.00 $8.00 No Bid No Bid
Elbeco L/S shirt — custom badge tab with metal
124 Elbeco eyelets to fit “Blackinton #8682 badge, #ELB- | 30 |  NoBid No Bid No Bid $68.00 discontinued No Bid No Bid

5612




Elbeco I/s shirt — custom badge tab with metal

125 Elbeco eyelets to fit ‘Blackinton #8682 badge, #ELB- | 30 |  NoBid No Bid No Bid $68.00 discontinued No Bid No Bid
5622
Elbeco Ripstop ADU S/s shirt - custom badge
126 Elbeco tab with metal eyelets to fit ‘Blackinton #8682" | 20 |  NoBid No Bid No Bid $63.00 discontinued No Bid No Bid
badae, #ELB-5632
Elbeco Ripstop ADU S/s shirt - custom badge
127 Elbeco tab with metal eyelets to fit ‘Blackinton #8682" | 50 |  NoBid No Bid No Bid $63.00 discontinued No Bid No Bid
badge, #ELB-5642
128 Elbeco Elbeco Men's Ripstop ADU Pant, #ELB-5700 | 150 |  No Bid No Bid No Bid $65.00 discontinued No Bid No Bid
129 Elbeco Elbeco Men's Ripstop ADU Pant, #ELB-5710 | 20 |  NoBid No Bid No Bid $65.00 discontinued No Bid
ying Cross |Flying Cross, /S shirt, FC-85R78Z 20 |_NoBid No Bid No Bid $58.00 $53.00 No Bid
Flying Cross | Flving Cross. LS shirt, #FC-33W78Z 20 | NoBid No Bid No Bid $73.00 $61.00 No Bid
Fiying Cross | Fiying Cross. LS shirt, #FC-85R78Z 20 | __NoBid No Bid No Bid $58.00 $53.00 No Bid
Fiying Cross___[Women's LS polvester shirt, #FC-126R78Z 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid $55.00 $61.00 No Bid
134 Flying Cross ;'ggggg;%s Men's Polyester Gabardine Pant, | 5, $69.00 No Bid No Bid $58.00 $49.50 No Bid
135 Flying Cross §:§"C"399g6“’;5 Female Polyester Gabardine Pant, | 5, $69.00 No Bid No Bid $58.00 $49.50 No Bid
736 Gal's Handcuff key - cuff pocket olip #1P-R121 T $13.00 No Bid No Bid $8.00 $10.00 No Bid
137 Gildan Gildan tee shirts, #Gildan 2000 40 $7.00 $14.00 $5.75 SKL $6.75 SXL $8.00 SXL No Bid SXL
G41 Gen 4 MOS Pistol .45 ACP, EGLOCK- " " " N
138 Glock e 50 | sa20.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid no bid $429.00
Glock 21/41 Magazine 45 ACP 13 rds. # y - - - -
139 Glock S i raga 60 | s2150 No Bid No Bid No Bid no bid No Bid $20.50
Gould & Goodrich | G&G leather restraint belt w/buckle $60.00 No Bid No Bid $109.00 no bid $65.31 $65.00
HSG Stun Gun #TACO - 115G00 5 $50.00 $62.00 No Bid $70.00 $43.12 $42.36
HSGI Sure Grip Padded Belt, slotted, #33PB01 30 | _$120.00 $140.00 No Bid $162.00 $98.58 $98.12
Jerzees Sweatshit 10 | s20.00 SXL $30.00 $15.55 SXL $16.50 SXL $18.00 No Bid SXL No Bid SXL
Jerzees Jerzees 50/50 Jersey knit polo shirt #437 60 |__$15.00 SXL $20.50 $12.25 SXL $13.00 SXL $12.00 No Bid SXL No Bid SXL
145|  Law Enforcement | GOLDMYLAR/GOLDACOR Campaign hat cord | 1 $13.50 W. Alboum | No Bid No Bid $9.00 $9.50 No Bid No Bid
146 | Law Enforcement | SH-39-BRN 3 po. leather strap for uniform hat | 1 $10.00 W. Alboum | NoBid No Bid $8.50 $9.00 No Bid No Bid
a7 | Lav SILVMYLR/SILVACORN Campaian hat cord 7 $13.50 W._Alboum | No Bid No Bid $10.00 $9.50 No Bid No Bid
148 axpedition 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
149 i 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
150 axpedition 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
151 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
752 Werrel Cham 7 Slam Luna Leather shoes #/12063 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid 21.00 discontinued No Bid No Bid
153 Merre Cham 7 Slam Luna Leather shoes #J12065 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid 21.00 isconti No Bid No Bid
754 Werrel Cham 7 Slam Luna Leather shoes #J32889 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid 21.00 discontinued No Bid No Bid
155 Merre Men's Adility Peak Shoes, #J17763 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid 59.00 isconti No Bid No Bid
756 Werrel Moab 2 8" Tactical boot, #J15845 1 No Bid $190.00 No Bid 46.00 $126.00 No Bid No Bid
157 Front Draw Holster. #3034 1 $48.00 No Bid No Bid o Bid $47.00 No Bid $35.95
158 Monadnock | AutoLock Expandable Black Chrome 26" Baton | 1 |  $147.00 No Bid No Bid $57.00 $235.00 No Bid $175.91
Baton holder, front draw swivel, black in Golor, y - -
159 Moradnock |08 hoide, ront draw 1 $57.00 No Bid No Bid $57.00 $47.00 No Bid $35.95
Batons, auto Lok-22, power safely tp, black
160 Monadnock  |chrome finish with super grip, MON9452 or 1| s22000 No Bid No Bid $284.00 $235.00 No Bid $173.64
equivalent
761 Monadnock | Handouf Key - cuff pocket ol 7 $13.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $10.00 No Bid $8.53
62 Nebo Redine flashliaht, #NEBO-5615 SE 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $31.00 No Bid No Bid
) Flashiight, multi-function rechargable, personal- ! N N
163 Nightstick e 1| s13500 No Bid No Bid $186.00 no bid $134.73 $135.37
164 Nike Gold Dri-Fit men's micro pique shirt, #363807 | 1 $36.00 No Bid $30.75 XSXL $34.00 XSXL $33.00 No Bid XSXL No Bid XSXL
165 Nike Nick Sphere dry cap, low profile 6 panels, 1 $25.00 No Bid $24.75 $29.00 $22.50 No Bid No Bid
velcro closure, #247077
6-panel polyester pro mesh cap, hook and Ioop Plain-No - : )
166 otTo & pane Pt 1 $13.00 i No Bid $8.95 $10.50 $8.50 No Bid No Bid
167 OoTTO Caps — #19-251 1 No Bid No Bid $8.50 $10.00 $8.50 No Bid No Bid
Otto Polyester pro mesh gray undervisor low ] ) ; )
168 otTo I 1 No Bid No Bid $8.95 $10.50 $8.50 No Bid No Bid
169 | Premiere Emblem  |Premiere Emblem Years Service Bars (Various) | 1 $2.00 Rollof 100 | NoBid No Bid $6.00 $6.00 No Bid No Bid
; Premiere Emblem - Hashmarks - 5 Serv. y - : )
170 | Premiere Emblem | Cremiere Sl 1 $3.50 Per set No Bid No Bid $6.00 $4.00 No Bid No Bid
171 Premiere Emblem | Premiere Emblem Invest. - chevrons 1 $3.95 Por set No Bid No Bid $6.00 $4.00 No Bid No Bid
172 | Premiere Emblem | Premiere Emblem Staff Sat - chevrons 1 $3.50 Por set No Bid No Bid $6.00 $4.00 No Bid No Bid
173 Peerless Leg rons, , carbon steel construction, Peerless | 4 $135.00 No Bid No Bid §76.00 $64.60 No Bid $54.46
#1703 or equivalent
174 Posrless Black chain ouffs, #PE-4711 Model 701C 7 $36.00 No Bid No Bid $39.00 $35.00 $27.44
175 Peerless Blue chain ink handouff, #PE-4712N #750 1 $48.00 No Bid No Bid $57.00 $35.00 $35.98
176 Perfect Fit Perfect Fit Recessed ID Badge Clip, Black #716 | 1 No Bid $23.60 No Bid $20.00 $17.00 No Bid
777 Port& Co Black Knit Cap, #CP90 7 $6.50 $5.00 $3.50 $4.50 $3.50 No Bid
178|  PortAuthority  |ANSI Class 3 heavyweight safety parka, #J799s| 5 |  $115.00 SXL $190.00 $139.00 XS-XL $151.00 XS-XL $125.00 XSXL No Bid XS-XL
179 Port Authority é:i"r;eifg;g'ee"e meridian cotton blend polo 20 | Discontinued $20.00 53“‘2)':;_2’“" $16.95 XS-XL $19.00 XS-XL | discontinued XSXL No Bid XS-XL
Ladies Concept Henley Tunic, 62/33/5,
180 Port Authority | poly/rayon/spandex jersey knit, 3 button henley | 20 $25.00 XS-XL $30.00 | $40-002XL- | i ntinued $26.00 | $2700-2XL, | iceontinued No Bid No Bid
placket, #LK5432 XL $28.00-3X4X]
781| Port Authoriy _[Ladies LS Easv care shirt, #L608 20 | s28.00 XSXL $45.00 52325 XSXL $26.00 XSXL $21.00 No Bid XS-XC No Bid XS-XC
182|  PortAuthority  |-2CieS Pinpomt mesh 1/2:2p, 100% polvester, | 59 | g5.00 XS-XL $40.00 $24.75 XS-XL $27.00 |s28.002x-3x|  $22.00 No Bid XS-XL No Bid XS-XL
183 PortAuthority  [Lades Sik Touch Performance LS polo, 20| s21.00 SXL $32.00 $17.25 XS-XL $19.00  [s2000-2x-3x|  $16.00 No Bid XS-XL No Bid XS-XL
18| PortAuthority  |codies Sik Touch pigue 34 sieeve sportshir, | 59 | g1, SXL No Bid $17.95 XS-XL $19.00  [$20.00-2x-3x discontinued No Bid XS-XL No Bid XS-XL
185 Port Authority Micro Fleece Jacket. #F223 5 $36.00 XS-XL $40.00 $23.25 XS-XL $26.00 $27.00-2X-3X] $21.50 No Bid XS-XL No Bid XS-XL
186 | Port Authority | Challenger Jacket, #SM-J754 10 | s4800 XSXL $80.00 $49.95 XSXL $55.00 _|$57.00-2X-3X|__$45.00 No Bid XSXL No Bid XSXL




87 Propper Duty Fleece Jackel - #F 5431 5 $80.00 XL No Bid 75.00 No Bid Tscontinued Discontinued No Bid
188 Propper Duty Fleece Jacket - #F5433 5 $80.00 SXL No Bid $199.99 $147.00 isconti Disconti No Bid
189 Propper I.C.E. Polo Shirt, S/S. #F5341 20 | __s38.00 $44.99 $45.00 $38.00 $35.00 $32.20 No Bid
190 Propper Polo shirt, #F534172 10 | _s38.00 $44.99 $45.00 $38.00 $35.00 $32.20 No Bid
191 Propper Propper BA Softshell Duty Jacket 2/0, #5483 | 20 |  $130.00 $149.99 $149.99 $132.00 $125.00 $109.31 No Bid
192 Propper Prooper Jackel # F5473-75 20 | Disconti No Bid $50.00 No Bid fsconti b No Bid
193 Propper Propper Jacket # F5474-07 20 | Disconti No Bid $60.00 No Bid discontinued Discontinued No Bid
194 Propper Propper Kinetic Pant #F52944 10 | s57.00 $69.99 $70.00 $59.00 $55.00 $49.07 No Bid
195 Propper Rapid release belt, #5364 30 | Disconti $59.99 No Bid $53.00 discontinued $43.05 No Bid
196 Propper Women's Polo shitt, S/S, wlembroidery, #F5327| 20 | $48.00 | Wiembroidery | $59.99 $45.00 $54.00 $41.00 $32.20 No Bid
767 Propper Women's uniform polo. LS. #F5396 20 | _s3t.00 $29.99 $30.00 $28.00 $27.00 $23.77 No Bid
198 Propper Women's Light weight Tactical Pant, #2F5254 | 10 |  $50.00 $54.99 No Bid No Bid $44.50 $39.43 No Bid

[ 199 Protes PTA- Impac Plate. 5 8, #MT0058 $140.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid o bid No Bid $150.57

00 Proteo 37/40mm less lethal pouch, #PTA-PTT2 $20.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $19.89
0 Protec Single side arm mag pouch. #PTA-TP10 $20.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $19.89
0 Proteo Double side arm ma pouch, #PTA-TP10A $30.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $31.25
0 Protec Triple side arm mag pouch. #PTA-TP10B $30.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $31.25
04 Proteo MK IV Pouch. #PTA-TP13 $22.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $22.73
205 Protech $;ﬁj’x’a°'e baton/ flashiight pouch, #PTA- 1 $25.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $25.57
06 Proteo 26" baton pouch, #PTATP14B $32.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $34.10
07 Protec Sinle cuff pouch. #PTA-TP17 $22.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $22.73
08 Proteo Double handouff poush, #PTATP17A $25.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $25.57
09 Proteo Utilty pouch 48 vertical, #PTA-TP19A $30.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $31.25
10 Proteo Utilty pouch 48 horizontal, #PTA-TP198 $30.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $31.25
11 Protec Tactical medic pouch, #PTA-TP20 $45.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $48.30
12 Proteo Tactical radio pouch, #PTA-TP21 $32.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid o bid No Bid $34.10
213 Protech $§g‘1"Ap°“°“ wlbungee - universal, #PTA- 1 $40.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid no bid No Bid $34.10
2 Protech Hydration pouch, #PTA-TP22 T $47.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid o bid No Bid $51.14
Red House [ Slim-fit Non-lron twill shirt, #RHB0 20| Disconti No Bid Discontinued $34.00 discontinued No Bid No Bid
Rothco Cold Weather Gloves. #4494 - L 10 | s$15.00 $24.99 No Bid $43.00 $19.00 No Bid No Bid
Rothco Midweiaht thermal knit bottom. #2839 10| __s24.00 $32.99 No Bid $26.00 $26.00 No Bid No Bid
8 Rothco Midweiaht thermal knit top. #2829 10 |_s27.00 SIXL $32.99 No Bid $27.00 $27.00 No Bid No Bid
219 Rothco Miltary ECWCS Gen Ill Level ll Balaclava head | $6.75 §7.99 No Bid $7.00 $7.00 No Bid No Bid
covering, #5569
Special Ops Soft Shell Security Jacket, XL o790 |5199992XL|  noma  [STe8882XL] $199.99-2XL- No B S198.982XL- | noma | S199992XL
220 Rothco priosiodelat 5 | sts.00 Upto st67.00 |$19%.%- 0 Bid o $136.00 ol $113.00 0 Bid ol o Bid oy
221 Safariland 2.0 Soft Trauma plate, 5'x8", #SBA-STP-5'x" | 130 |  $50.00 No Bid No Bid $40.00 No Bid $34.10
222 Safariland Glock 34/35 X300U, #SAF-6354RDS-6832-481 | 30 |  $130.00 No Bid No Bid $210.00 $175.00 No Bid $181.51
23 Safariland ggg‘;i‘gf Glock 34/35 x300U, SAF-6360RDS- | 3 | ¢450.00 No Bid No Bid $247.00 $205.00 No Bid $167.59
May ot be
ALS Concealment Belt Loop Holster - Black - ) ! ) ’ y not b
224 Safariland fits Glock 22 & 23 #6377 1 $65.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $185.00 No Bid $53.53 available in
ALS Low-Ride, Level Ill Retention Duty Holster ) ! ) )
225 Safariland B o ) o 1 $130.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $185.00 No Bid $153.69
'ALS/SLS Mid ride level Tl duty holster Glock 35 ’ - -
226 Safariland e e o 10 | s130.00 No Bid No Bid $206.00 $205.00 No Bid $139.45
ALS/SLS tactical holster with quick release
227 Safariland Glock 35 Swat drop leg holster #SAF-6305- 1 $176.00 No Bid No Bid $289.00 $225.00 No Bid $195.10
6832-131
228 Safariland Ballstic vest, female cut, #SBA-SX0Z-II-F 10 | $950.00 Panels Only | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,065.35
229 Safariland Ballstic vest, male cut, #SBA-SX02-lI-M 150 | $950.00 Panels Only | No Bid No Bid No Bid o bid No Bid No Bid
230 Safariland Garrison belt basket weave 10 | s65.00 No Bid No Bid $25.00 $84.00 No Bid $45.89
Handcuff case, Black basketweave finish, #SAF- ’ " )
231 Safariland e e 1 $35.00 No Bid No Bid $55.00 $48.00 No Bid $34.42
232 Safariland g‘;’f_x’ 1"""" light Glock 17 or 22 #SAF-6360- 1 $130.00 No Bid No Bid $206.00 $205.00 No Bid $139.45
233 Safariland M1 C carrier, #SBAM1 200 | $150.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid o bid No Bid $129.42
Magazine holder, Black basketweave finish " " "
234 Safariland Magazin holder, Black bask 1 $33.00 No Bid No Bid $55.00 $45.00 No Bid $36.48
235 Safariland Molded belt keeper, #65-4-2PBL 1 $24.00 No Bid No Bid $25.00 $25.00 No Bid $16.48
OC Holder, #7909, Black basketweave finish
with hidden snap**must fit Def Tec MK3 1.3 OC ) ! )
No Bi No Bi 41.. 21. No Bi .
236 Safariland e s 19 06 Foan | 1 $32.00 o Bid o Bid $41.00 $21.00 0 Bid $13.10
#7909 or equivalent
237 Safariland SBA Impac-MT 5'x8", #SBA-1001632 150 | $140.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid o bid No Bid $150.57
238 Safariland ?Eé 1T mf;' Assault Carrier WIMOLLE, #SBA- | - 4, $310.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid no bid No Bid $208.30
239 Safariland ;:“C‘ifp‘l‘g‘e’ carrier wifixed pocket, #SBA- 150 | $400.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 1o bid No Bid $375.00
Universal radio pouch for HT1000 radio and " - " "
240 Safariland e e 71000 rak 1 $45.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $55.00 No Bid $47.36
White cotton parade gloves with snap cuff ’ - - -
241 Safariland A 1 $6.00 No Bid No Bid $8.00 $7.00 No Bid No Bid
Polyester 3* Clip-on men's fie with buttonholes " - " -
242 SamuelBroome [FoVeser & TR 1 $8.00 No Bid No Bid $9.00 $8.00 No Bid No Bid
Polyester 3° Clip-on women's tie with ’ - - -
243|  Samuel Broome P 1 $8.00 No Bid No Bid $9.00 $8.00 No Bid No Bid
Polyester 3.5 Clip-on men's. tie with " - " -
244|  Samuel Broome v e 0008 1 $8.50 No Bid No Bid $9.00 $9.00 No Bid No Bid
25| Samuel Broome _|X-Long Black tie 1 $9.00 No Bid No Bid $9.00 $9.00 No Bid No Bid
26 San Mar Shorts, #5T310 10 | s21.00 SXL $32.00 $18.00 XS-XL s2000 | $21:002X | 4909 No Bid XS-XL No Bid XSXL
$22.00-3X4X|
247|  Second Chance | SC Body Armor Tactical Assault Carrier "TAC™ | $400.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid no bid No Bid No Bid
fixed pockets
248| _ Second Chance _|SC Summit Lv Il APEX2 carrier, #SM02 1| ses0.00 Panels Only | No Bid No Bid No Bid no bid No Bid No Bid




249 Sig Sauer 5 | NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid no bid No Bid No Bid
250 | Smith & Wesson _|S&W Nickel plated chained handcuffs, #110 1 $36.00 No Bid No Bid $61.00 $50.00 No Bid No Bid
Ladies Mioro Pique V-neck polo, snag resistant ¥ $23.002%, ] y " y
251 Sport Tek s e 30 | s23.00 $34.00 $19.25 XS-XL s2200 | P00 st050 No Bid XSXL No Bid XSXL
Stration Straw Campaign Style -Double Brim y " - -
252|  statonHats | raten Sty Com 1 $110.00 No Bid No Bid $117.00 $105.00 No Bid No Bid
253 Streamight__|Stinger Flashiight traffic want #75903 1 $8.95 No Bid No Bid $9.00 $8.50 $6.57 $593
Tactical Research, Men's Waterproof 8" miltary y " ] ]
254|  Tactical Research | (213 Research, len's 20 | s12200 No Bid No Bid $144.00 $135.00 No Bid No Bid
255 | Tagua IPH4-330 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid o bid No Bid No Bid
‘Spiewak Police safety vest, Hi-Vis yellow, black y " " ) -
25|  TheFireStore [SPiewa Pate setely vest 1 $42.00 No Bid No Bid $46.00 no bid No Bid No Bid
- RMR Type 2 Adjustable LED Red Dot Site 3.25 ! N ! !
257 Trijicon e e 50 | sas5.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $290.00 No Bid $492.18
258 Tru-Spec ;;“0’951%6;75 Star Field Shirt, 24-7, SIS, 2 $25.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid discontined No Bid No Bid
259 Tru-Spec ;;‘3'951"09;35 Star Rnge belt, 24-7, 2 ply - 2 $15.75 No Bid $16.00 No Bid discontined No Bid No Bid
260 Tru-Spec 2| Disconti No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
B Tru-Spec H20 Proof 3-in-1 parka, (#22410) - N - - - N
261 Tru-Spec e s 1| s100.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid discontined No Bid No Bid
262 Tru-Spec Tru-Spec H20 Proof Element 3-in-1 Jacket 5 $85.00 SXL No Bid No Bid No Bid o bid No Bid No Bid
263 Tru-Spec Tru-Spec Light Weight Field shitt, LIS, #1101 | 5 $26.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid discontined No Bid No Bid
264 Tru-Spec ;Z’fz";c Performance women's L/S polo shirt | -, $34.00 No Bid $42.95 $38.00 $33.00 No Bid No Bid
265 Tru-Spec ;;:357"5“':9""""6"* women’s S/S poloshirt | 4, $35.00 No Bid $42.95 $38.00 $33.00 No Bid No Bid
Tiru-Spec Wormen's Orgal Tackal P, " - -
266 Tru-Spec P 10 | s50.00 $54.95 No Bid $54.00 $48.00 No Bid No Bid
267 Tru-Spec Tru-Spec 24-7 Series Tactical Pant - #1062009 | 10 | $50.00 $59.95 $53.75 $54.00 $48.00 $39.07 No Bid
268 Tru-Spec ;;“0’335‘:)‘;24’7 Series Tactical Pant, Women. | 4 $57.00 $54.95 $60.95 $65.00 $58.00 $46.49 No Bid
269 Tru-Spec ;;‘é‘;"oe;sz” Series Tactical Pant, Women, 10 $57.00 $54.95 $69.95 $65.00 $58.00 $46.49 No Bid
270 Tru-Spec Tru-Spec, Men's Original Tactical Pant, #1060 | 10 |  $50.00 $59.95 No Bid $54.00 $48.00 No Bid No Bid
27 Tru-Spec Tru-Spec Women's Ascent Pant, #1032 10 | ss7.00 $72.95 No Bid $65.00 $58.00 No Bid No Bid
212 Tru-Spec Tru Spec Women's Ascent Pant, #1036 10 | s57.00 $72.95 No Bid $65.00 $58.00 No Bid No Bid
273 Uncle Mike's f”zfe“de’s' #35862, or equivalent, black in 1 $45.00 No Bid No Bid $51.00 discontinued No Bid No Bid
274 Under Armour 10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid no bid No Bid No Bid
275 Under Armour 10 | NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid no bid No Bid No Bid
276 Under Armour | US Stellar Tac Side Zip boot, #1303129-001 1 $120.00 No Bid No Bid $125.00 o bid No Bid No Bid
217 Tru-Spec Tru-Spec Men's Polyester/Cotton Pant, #21060| 10 | $57.00 $59.95 No Bid $53.00 $48.00 No Bid No Bid
278 Tru-Spec Tru-Spec 24-7 Series Tactical Pant, #21060050 | 10 |  $57.00 $59.95 $53.75 $54.00 $48.00 $39.07 No Bid
279 Tru-Spec Tru-Spec Men's Polyester/Cotton Pant, #21062| 10 | $57.00 $59.95 $53.75 $54.00 $48.00 No Bid No Bid
280 Tru-Spec Tru-Spec_Polyester/Cotton Pant, #21064 10 | ss7.00 $59.95 $53.75 $54.00 $48.00 No Bid No Bid
281 Tru-Spec Tru-Spec_Polyester/Cotion Pant, #21079 10 | ss7.00 $59.95 $53.75 $54.00 $48.00 No Bid No Bid
282 Knit tobogan cap, “Resource Recovery” logo 10 | NoBid No Bid $7.25 $14.00 $9.00 No Bid No Bid
in yellow - black
283 Black security hat, adjustable, light weight 10 | Nosid No Bid $11.25 $16.00 $14.00 No Bid No Bid
mesh, low profile 9275
284 *Crime Scene" Barrier Tape 5 | NoBid No Bid No Bid $17.00 no bid No Bid No Bid
285 "Caution" Barrier Tape 5 | NoBid No Bid No Bid $17.00 no bid No Bid No Bid
$16.00-LC
286 §75.00 | PeriogoSetup | g5, $8.00 Logo, $10.00- $5.00 No Bid No Bid
Fee Name 1 Line,
Embroidery charges 1 $22.00-Back
287 | EMB-HCCI-Gold__|Embroidery 1 $9.00 Per Garment_|_$15.00 $8.00 $16.00 $6.00 No Bid No Bid
288 | EMB-HCCI-Seal-Gold | Embroidery 1 $10.00 Per Garment_|_$15.00 $8.00 $16.00 $6.00 No Bid No Bid
289| EMB-NAME-ONE _|Embroidery 1 $9.00 Per Garment_|_$15.00 $5.00 $10.00 $4.00 No Bid No Bid
f purchased ] - "
290 Hemming ; $2.50 $10.00 No Bid $10.00 $7.00 No Bid No Bid
291 Patoh Placement 1 $2.00 Per patch $5.00 $7.00 $4.00 $3.00 No Bid No Bid
292 Patch Removal 1 $2.00 Per patch $2.00 $2.50 $0.00 $3.00 No Bid No Bid

Bids sent out: 35 (H) 2

Bids rec'd: 7_(H) 2

No bids: Brown & Bigelow, NAFECO
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