
IFB #005-47

Pavement Marking Installation or Removal Services
Annual Contract

COLUMBUS, GA
Line 
Item

DOT Item 
Code Item Description

Unit of 
Measure Price

0005 652-0091 Pavement Marking, Symbol, TP1 ea $150.00 No Bid
0010 652-0094 Pavement Marking, Symbol, TP4 ea $250.00 No Bid
0015 652-0095 Pavement Marking, Handicap Symbol ea $75.00 No Bid
0020 652-0110 Pavement Marking, Arrow, TP1 ea $35.00 No Bid
0025 652-0120 Pavement Marking, Arrow, TP2 ea $35.00 No Bid
0030 652-0210 Pavement Marking, Word, TP1 ea $35.00 No Bid
0035 652-2501 Solid Traffic Stripe, 5 in, White lm $1,250.00 No Bid
0040 652-2502 Solid Traffic Stripe, 5 in, Yellow lm $1,250.00 No Bid
0045 652-3501 Skip Traffic Stripe, 5 In, White glm $600.00 No Bid
0050 652-3502 Skip Traffic Stripe, 5 In, Yellow glm $600.00 No Bid
0055 652-5301 Solid Traffic Stripe, 6 In, White lf $1.50 No Bid
0060 652-5451 Solid Traffic Stripe, 5 In, White lf $1.50 No Bid
0065 652-5452 Solid Traffic Stripe, 5 In, Yellow lf $1.50 No Bid
0070 652-5701 Solid Traffic Stripe, 24 In, White lf $6.00 No Bid
0075 652-6301 Skip Traffic Stripe, 6 In, White glf $0.50 No Bid
0080 652-6501 Skip Traffic Stripe, 5 In, White glf $0.50 No Bid
0085 652-6502 Skip Traffic Stripe, 5 In, Yellow glf $0.50 No Bid
0090 652-9001 Traffic Stripe, White sy $3.50 No Bid
0095 652-9002 Traffic Stripe, Yellow sy $3.50 No Bid
0100 653-0095 Thermoplastic Pvmt Marking, Handicap Symbol ea $250.00 No Bid
0105 653-0100 Thermoplastic Pvmt Marking, RR/Hwy Crossing Symbol ea $350.00 No Bid
0110 653-0110 Thermoplastic Pvmt Marking, Arrow, TP1 ea $45.00 No Bid
0115 653-0120 Thermoplastic Pvmt Marking, Arrow, TP2 ea $85.00 No Bid
0120 653-0130 Thermoplastic Pvmt Marking, Arrow, TP3 ea $100.00 No Bid
0125 653-0150 Thermoplastic Pvmt Marking, Arrow, TP5 ea $10.00 No Bid
0130 653-0170 Thermoplastic Pvmt Marking, Arrow, TP7 ea $85.00 No Bid
0135 653-0210 Thermoplastic Pvmt Marking, Word, TP1 ea $85.00 No Bid
0140 653-0220 Thermoplastic Pvmt Marking, Word, TP2 ea $85.00 No Bid
0145 653-0230 Thermoplastic Pvmt Marking, Word, TP3A ea $150.00 No Bid
0150 653-0235 Thermoplastic Pvmt Marking, Word, TP3B ea $250.00 No Bid
0155 653-0240 Thermoplastic Pvmt Marking, Word, TP4 ea $100.00 No Bid
0160 653-1501 Thermoplastic Solid Traf Stripe, 5 In, White lf $2.50 No Bid
0165 653-1502 Thermoplastic Solid Traf Stripe, 5 In, Yellow lf $2.50 No Bid
0170 653-1504 Thermoplastic Solid Traf Stripe, 12 In, White lf $7.50 No Bid
0175 653-1704 Thermoplastic Solid Traf Stripe, 24 In, White lf $10.00 No Bid
0180 653-1804 Thermoplastic Solid Traf Stripe, 8 In, White lf $2.95 No Bid
0185 653-1810 Thermoplastic Solid Traf Stripe, 10 In, White lf $2.95 No Bid
0190 653-2501 Thermoplastic Solid Traf Stripe, 5 In, White lm $2,850.00 No Bid
0195 653-2502 Thermoplastic Solid Traf Stripe, 5 In, Yellow lm $2,850.00 No Bid
0200 653-3501 Thermoplastic Skip Traf Stripe, 5 In, White glf $1.00 No Bid
0205 653-3502 Thermoplastic Skip Traf Stripe, 5 In, Yellow glf $1.00 No Bid
0210 653-3810 Thermoplastic Skip Traf Stripe, 10 In, White lf $2.00 No Bid
0215 653-4501 Thermoplastic Skip Traf Stripe, 5 In, White lm $1,850.00 No Bid
0220 653-4502 Thermoplastic Skip Traf Stripe, 5 In, Yellow lm $1,850.00 No Bid
0225 653-6004 Thermoplastic Traf Striping, White ea $7.50 No Bid
0230 653-6006 Thermoplastic Traf Striping, Yellow ea $7.50 No Bid
0235 654-1001 Raised Pvmt Markers, TP1 ea $6.00 No Bid
0240 654-1002 Raised Pvmt Markers, TP2 ea $2.00 No Bid
0245 654-1003 Raised Pvmt Markers, TP3 ea $6.00 No Bid
0250 654-1004 Raised Pvmt Markers, TP4 ea $5.00 No Bid
0255 654-1005 Raised Pvmt Markers, TP5 ea $5.00 No Bid
0260 654-1007 Raised Pvmt Markers, TP7 ea $7.00 No Bid
0265 654-1010 Raised Pvmt Markers, TP10 ea $35.00 No Bid
0270 656-0050 Remove Exist Solid Traf Stripe, 5 In, Thermoplastic lf $1.50 No Bid
0275 656-1005 Remove Exist Skip Traf Stripe, 5 In, Paint lf $1.50 No Bid
0280 657-1054 Preformed Plastic Solid Pvmt Mkg, 5 In, White, TP PB lf $5.00 No Bid
0285 657-1084 Preformed Plastic Solid Pvmt Mkg, 8 In, White, TP PB lf $8.00 No Bid
0290 657-1104 Preformed Plastic Solid Pvmt Mkg, 10 In, White, TP PB lf $10.00 No Bid
0295 657-1244 Preformed Plastic Solid Pvmt Mkg, 24 In, White, TP PB lf $24.00 No Bid
0300 657-3054 Preformed Plastic Skip Pvmt Mkg, 5 In, White, TP PB glf $3.50 No Bid
0305 657-5000 Preformed Plastic Pvmt Markings sy $45.00 No Bid
0310 657-5014 Preformed Plastic Pvmt Mkg, Words and/or Sym, White, TP ea $1,000.00 No Bid
0315 657-5016 Preformed Plastic Pvmt Mkg, Words and/or Sym, Arrow TP1 ea $500.00 No Bid
0320 657-5017 Preformed Plastic Pvmt Mkg, Words and/or Sym, Arrow TP2 ea $500.00 No Bid
0325 657-5120 Preformed Plastic Pvmt Mkg, Words and/or Sym, Arrow TP5 ea $750.00 No Bid
0330 657-6054 Preformed Plastic Solid Pvmt Mkg, 5 In, Yellow, TP PB lf $5.00 No Bid
0335 657-8054 Preformed Plastic Skip Pvmt Mkg, 5 In, Yellow, TP PB glf $3.50 No Bid

TOTAL AWARDED AMOUNT:    Annual Contract
BIDS MAILED:         12                     HALL:2
BIDS RECEIVED:   1    ( 1-NO BIDS)     HALL:  0

PEEK PAVEMENT 
MARKING, LLC

ESA 
Striping
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