

	CRITERIA	Total Possible Points	RFQ/P 47-010 On-Site Pharmacy Services Provider			
			ASM	OSRx	Riverside Pharmacy	Citizens Pharmacy
Demonstrated understanding of the services and needs required by the County and provided solutions on how to address the following:						
	Staffing & pharmacy operations - including but not limited to Pharmacist in Charge, clinical/staff pharmacists and technicians, hours of operation, and dispensing procedures	110	100	98.33333333	103.3333333	No Bid
	Implementation & transition plan - including but not limited to start-up timeline, deliverables, licensure, inventory takeover, and roles/responsibilities	110	95	106.6666667	105	No Bid
	Technology & IT capabilities - including but not limited to automated dispensing/inventory systems, interface with PBM formulary and mail order, and eligibility integration	110	88.33333333	100	100	No Bid
	Reporting & program effectiveness - including but not limited to standard/ad hoc reporting, performance metrics, and documentation of savings and utilization	110	84.33333333	104	94	No Bid
	Privacy & compliance - including but not limited to HIPAA compliance, credentialing, audits, and inventory/financial record controls	110	96.66666667	96.66666667	105	No Bid
Credentials, qualifications, experience, and financial stability of the pharmacy provider, as well as references, client case studies, and the designated account management/service team		200	165	183.3333333	186.6666667	No Bid
Value Adds		50	31.66666667	38.33333333	48.33333333	No Bid
	Pricing - including start-up costs, ongoing fees, drug pricing basis (AWP/MAC/acquisition cost), dispensing/administration fees, rebates, and projected savings/ROI	200	165	186.6666667	193.3333333	No Bid
TOTAL SCORE (out of 1000):			826	914	935.6666667	No Bid
Rank:			3	2	1	

Number of Companies Emailed: 19
 Number of Hall County Companies Emailed: 14
 Number of Bids Received: 4
 Number of Hall County Bids Received: 3
 "No Bids" Received: 1