

**SUMMATION OF BIDS RECEIVED  
# 023-43 FIRE AND EMS UNIFORM  
SUPPLY ANNUAL CONTRACT  
Name of Company**

<u>Item #</u>	<u>Description</u>	NAFECO Clarkston, GA	S.T.A.R. Oakwood, GA
<b><u>Patches</u></b>			
1	Fire Service Uniform Patch	\$3.00	No bid
2	Badge Patch	\$2.00	No bid
3	Badge Patch	\$2.00	No bid
4	Georgia Smoke Diver Patch	\$3.00	No bid
5	Honor Guard Patch	\$3.00	No bid
6	Embroidered Collar Disc Patch - Captain / Battalion Chief	\$2.00	No bid
7	Embroidered Collar Disc Patch - Firefighter / Lieutenant	\$2.00	No bid
8	Embroidered Paramedic Patch	\$2.00	No bid
9	Embroidered EMT Patch	\$2.00	No bid
9A	Sew-On namestrip	\$3.00	No bid
9B	New Badge Patch	\$3.00	No bid
9C	Challenge Coin size 1.75", round	\$8.00	No bid
<b><u>Badges and Bars</u></b>			
10	Firefighter Badge - BLACKINTON # B547	\$86.00	No bid
11	Lieutenant Badge - BLACKINTON # B1160	\$86.00	No bid
12	Chief - Captain Badges - BLACKINTON # B1160	\$86.00	No bid
13	Chief - Captain Badges - BLACKINTON # B1160-2	\$86.00	No bid
14	Honor Guard Badge - BLACKINTON # B586	\$88.00	No bid
15	Firefighter Collar Brass Set - BLACKINTON	\$52.00	No bid
16	Lieutenant Collar Brass Set - BLACKINTON	\$52.00	No bid
17	Captain Collar Brass Set - BLACKINTON	\$52.00	No bid
18	Battalion Chief Collar Brass Set - BLACKINTON	\$52.00	No bid
19	Commander Guard Collar Brass Badge Set - BLACKINTON	\$74.00	No bid
20	Division Chief - BLACKINTON #A2547/A2907	\$74.00	No bid
21	Deputy Chief Collar Brass Set - BLACKINTON #A2547/A2906	\$74.00	No bid
22	Chief Collar Brass Set - BLACKINTON #A2547/A2905	\$74.00	No bid
23	Lieutenant Hat Badge - BLACKINTON # A2817DE	\$56.00	No bid
24	Sergeant Cap Badge - BLACKINTON #A6223	\$36.00	No bid
25	Firefighter Cap Badge - BLACKINTON #A698	\$36.00	No bid
26	Captain Hat Badge - BLACKINTON #A6197DE	\$54.00	No bid
27	Battalion Chief Hat Badge - BLACKINTON A2816DE	\$54.00	No bid
28	Commander Badge - BLACKINTON #A2816DE	\$54.00	No bid
29	Division Chief Badge - BLACKINTON #A2853DE	\$54.00	No bid
30	Deputy Chief Hat Badge - BLACKINTON #A1962DE	\$54.00	No bid
31	Chief Hat Badge - BLACKINTON #A2815DE	\$54.00	No bid
32	Honor Guard Hat Badge - BLACKINTON #C12571	\$50.00	No bid
33	Honor Guard Membership Bar - BLACKINTON #B1942	\$24.00	No bid
34	Nameplates	\$20.00	No bid
<b><u>Clothing - No exceptions where noted</u></b>			
35	Class A Dress Pants - (men) Flying Cross		No bid
	List prices for sizes: 28-42	\$104.00	
	List prices for oversizes: 44-58	\$124.00	
36	Class a Dress Pants - (women) Patriot		No bid
	List prices for sizes: 6-20	\$104.00	
	List prices for oversizes: 22-24	\$124.00	
37	Class A Dress Honor Guard Pants (made to measure)		No bid
	List prices for sizes: 28-42	\$120.00	
38	Class A Dress Coat - (men) Flying Cross		No bid

**SUMMATION OF BIDS RECEIVED  
# 023-43 FIRE AND EMS UNIFORM  
SUPPLY ANNUAL CONTRACT  
Name of Company**

<u>Item #</u>	<u>Description</u>	NAFECO Clarkston, GA	S.T.A.R. Oakwood, GA
	List prices for sizes: 34-46	\$325.00	
	List prices for oversizes: 48-50	\$350.00	
	List prices for oversizes: 52-54	\$375.00	
39	Class A Dress Coat - (women) Patriot List prices for sizes: 6-20 List prices for oversizes: 22-24	\$325.00 \$350.00	No bid
40	Class A Dress Honor Guard Coat List prices for sizes: 38-46	\$450.00	No bid
41	Class A Dress Honor Guard Top Coat List prices for sizes: 38-46 List prices for oversizes: 48-50	\$230.00 \$250.00	No bid
42	Honor Guard Shoulder Cord, 1", 20", 22" adj.	\$28.00	No bid
43	Class A Dress Hat XS -2 XL	\$75.00	No bid
44	Class A Honor Guard Hat XS -2 XL Chief's Hat with Flame Visor	\$110.00 \$150.00	No bid
45	Class A Dress Shoe - Bates 941 High Gloss Military Uniform Oxford List prices for men sizes: 4-15 (half sizes 6-12) List prices for women sizes: 5-10 - (half sizes 5 1/2 - 9 1/2)	\$110.00 \$110.00	No bid
46	Dress Belt 28-42 44-54	\$24.00 \$26.00	No bid
47	Honor Guard Parade Belt Even sizes 24-60	\$98.00	No bid
48	Ties 4-in-Hand List prices for men sizes: 18, 20, 22 List prices women sizes: 14-16	\$6.50 \$6.50	No bid
49	Long Sleeve White Shirt - Flying Cross #45W6600 men / # 102W6600 ladies List prices for men neck sizes: 14-17.5 List prices for men neck sizes: 18.5-20 List prices for women bust sizes: 30-44 List prices for women bust sizes: 46-48	\$62.00 \$75.00 \$62.00 \$72.00	No bid
50	Short Sleeve White Shirt - Flying Cross #95R6600 men / #152R6600 women List prices for men - S - XL List prices for men 2XL - 4XL List prices for women bust sizes: 30-44 List prices for women bust sizes: 46-48	\$54.00 \$54.00 \$58.00 \$54.00	No bid
51	Long Sleeve Black Shirt - Flying Cross #47W6610 men / # 104W6610 ladies List prices for men neck sizes: 14-17.5	\$62.00	No bid

**SUMMATION OF BIDS RECEIVED**  
**# 023-43 FIRE AND EMS UNIFORM**  
**SUPPLY ANNUAL CONTRACT**  
**Name of Company**

<u>Item #</u>	<u>Description</u>	NAFECO Clarkston, GA	S.T.A.R. Oakwood, GA
	List prices for men neck sizes: 18.5-20	\$72.00	
	List prices for women bust sizes: 30-44	\$62.00	
	List prices for women bust sizes: 46-48	\$2.00	
52	Short Sleeve Black Shirt - Flying Cross #97R6610 men / #154R6610 women		No bid
	List prices for men - S - XL	\$62.00	
	List prices for men 2XL - 4XL	\$72.00	
	List prices for women bust sizes: 30-44	\$62.00	
	List prices for women bust sizes: 46-48	\$72.00	
53	Staff Non-Pleated Black Pant - Flying Cross 3900		No bid
	List prices for sizes: 28-42	\$40.00	
	List prices for oversizes: 44-52	\$45.00	
	List price for women sizes: 2-20 even sizes	\$40.00	
54	Physical Training shirts, NEXT LEVEL, s/s, Beefy T-shirt		
	S - XL	\$15.00	\$8.50
	2XL - 4XL	\$17.00	\$12.50
55	Physical Training Shorts - Champro # Boss 9		
	List prices for sizes: Small - XLarge	No bid	\$10.65
	List prices for sizes: 2XL - 3XL	No bid	\$12.15
56	Physical Training Pants - Champro #1550		
	List prices for sizes: Small - XLarge	\$30.00	\$11.95
	List prices for sizes: 2XL - 3XL	\$32.00	\$13.95
57	Sweatshirt Crewneck - Jerzees Style #562 Navy & Grey		
	List prices for sizes: Small - XLarge	\$28.00	\$14.50
	List prices for sizes: 2XL - 3XL	\$30.00	\$16.50
58	Cap - Embroidered - Navy Blue	\$16.50	\$17.50
59	Flex-Fit Cap - Embroidered in Navy Blue		
	Red / Silver: SM/Med: LG/XL	\$18.50	\$15.95
	Red / Gold: SM/Med: LG/XL	\$18.50	\$15.95
60	Fleece Beanie Hat in Navy Blue	\$9.00	\$8.50
61	Job Shirt - Tri-Mountain # 647 Alarm and # 644 React in Navy Blue		
	# 647 sizes: Small - 4X Large		
	Small - XL	\$62.00	\$65.00
	2XL - 4XL	\$64.00	\$75.00
	Large Tall 4XL	\$64.00	\$80.00
62	Boots - Bates #2066 - men's 7 - 12	No bid	No bid
63	Boots - Bates # 2261	No bid	No bid
	men's medium - 6-12, 13, 14, 15, 16		
	men's extra wide - 7-12, 13, 14		
64	Boots - USBBK, Redback Only	No bid	No bid
	List men full sizes: 4-15		
	List men half sizes: 5.5-12.5		

**SUMMATION OF BIDS RECEIVED  
# 023-43 FIRE AND EMS UNIFORM  
SUPPLY ANNUAL CONTRACT  
Name of Company**

<u>Item #</u>	<u>Description</u>
	List men wide width sizes: 15-16
65	Shoes - #834-633 Men's Oxford Black and #534-6333 Women's Oxford Black List prices for men sizes: 7-12 List price for men size: 13 List price for men size: 14 List price for men size: 15 List prices for women sizes: 7-12 List price for women size: 13 List price for women size: 14 List price for women size: 15
66	Nomex Uniform Shirt - Workrite # 720NX45 Short Sleeve in Midnight Blue 38-50 52-54
67	Nomex Polo Shirt, Workrite #263TK-67-NB, s/s, in navy S-XL 2XL
68	Nomex Uniform Shirt, Workrite #705NX-45-NV, l/s in navy 38-50 52-54
69	Nomex Uniform Shirt, Workrite #701NMX-45-NV, s/s in navy S-XL 2XL
70	Nomex Uniform Shirt, Workrite #706NX-45-NV, l/s in navy S-XL 2XL
71	Nomex Uniform Pant, Workrite #400-NX-75 Industrial or #402-NX-75 in navy List prices for sizes: 28-42 List prices for oversizes: 44-56
72	Nomex Uniform Pant, Workrite #401-NX-75 in navy List prices for sizes: 2-20 List prices for oversizes: 22-24
73	Nomex Uniform Pant, Workrite #401-NX-75-NV in navy List prices for sizes: 2-20 List prices for oversizes: 22-24
74	Nomex Cargo Shorts, Workrite #425NX-60-NV in navy List prices for sizes: 28-42 List prices for oversizes: 44-50
75	Rescue Belt, Rescue Tech #703306, w/"V" ring Standard size Over Size
76	Firefighter Turnout Gear Bag, FIREARTH20-N-107-WH

NAFECO Clarkston, GA	S.T.A.R. Oakwood, GA
	No bid
\$160.00 \$160.00 \$160.00 \$160.00 \$160.00 \$160.00 \$160.00 \$160.00	
\$124.00 \$138.00	\$155.00 \$210.00
\$94.00 \$100.00	\$109.00 \$139.00
\$136.00 \$146.00	\$185.00 \$245.00
\$124.00 \$138.00	\$155.00 \$210.00
\$136.00 \$146.00	\$185.00 \$245.00
\$136.00 \$146.00	\$175.00 \$235.00
\$136.00 \$146.00	\$175.00 \$235.00
\$120.00 \$140.00	\$185.00 \$245.00
\$36.00 \$40.00	No bid
\$78.00	No bid

**SUMMATION OF BIDS RECEIVED  
# 023-43 FIRE AND EMS UNIFORM  
SUPPLY ANNUAL CONTRACT  
Name of Company**

<u>Item #</u>	<u>Description</u>
77	Staff Short Sleeve Tactical Polo Shirt - Propper F534172 List price for men sizes: XS-XL List price for men size: 2XL - 6XL
78	Staff Long Sleeve Tactical Polo Shirt - Propper F5315 List price for men sizes: XS-XL List price for men size: 2XL - 6XL
79	Staff Short Sleeve Tactical Polo Shirt - UFX K5100 List price for men sizes: S-XL List price for men size: 2XL - 4XL

NAFECO Clarkston, GA	S.T.A.R. Oakwood, GA
	No bid
\$44.00 \$48.00	
	No bid
\$50.00 \$54.00	
\$62.50 \$75.00	\$55.00 \$65.00

**SUMMATION OF BIDS RECEIVED  
# 023-43 FIRE AND EMS UNIFORM  
SUPPLY ANNUAL CONTRACT  
Name of Company**

<u>Item #</u>	<u>Description</u>
80	Tactical Pants - Propper # F52550 30-42 44-54
81	Tactical Pants - Propper #F5252-50 (olive) 30-42 44-54
<b><u>Recruit Uniforms</u></b>	
82	T-Shirt Hanes Beefy in Heather Grey List price for sizes: Small-X Large List price for size: 2XL - 3 XL
83	BDU Pant - Propper # F5201-38-405 List price for sizes: Small-X Large List price for sizes: 2X Large-3X Large
84	AV-56121F, Alert vision 5 point breakaway vest List Price for sizes L - 2XL
85	Sweatshirt Crewneck - Recruit List price for sizes: Small-X Large List price for size: 2XL - 3 XL
86	Physical Training Shorts _ Recruit List price for sizes: Small-X Large List price for sizes: 2X Large-3X Large

NAFECO Clarkston, GA	S.T.A.R. Oakwood, GA
\$44.00 \$48.00	\$42.00
	No bid
\$14.00 \$16.00	\$11.95 \$15.95
\$32.00 \$34.00	\$35.00 \$35.00
\$64.00	No bid
\$28.00 \$30.00	\$14.50 \$19.50
\$18.00 \$20.00	\$11.95 \$14.95